
DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 
 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
APRIL 16, 2019 

 
 
 
 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 01           Agenda and Minutes 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Approval of the April 16, 2019 Agenda, and February 19, 2019 Board 

Meeting Minutes 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Tentative Agenda and Draft Minutes 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



P a g e  1 | 2 
 

TENTATIVE AGENDA 
 
 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING/MEETING 
 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene 
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello 

 
Teleconference – (877) 820-7831--529619 

dbs.idaho.gov – (208) 332-7137 
 

Tuesday, April 16, 2019 
 

9:30 a.m. – 12:30 p.m. (MDT) 
8:30 a.m. – 11:30 a.m. (PDT) 

 
9:30 a.m. CALL TO ORDER – Andrew Bick, Chairman 

o Roll Call & Introductions 
o Open Forum 

 
 CONSENT AGENDA 

1. Approval of the April 16, 2019 Agenda, and February 19, 2019 Draft Board Meeting 
Minutes – Andrew Bick 
 

PUBLIC HEARING 
2. Discuss and Review Possible Adoption of 2018 Codes – Andrew Bick 

a.    International Energy Conservation Code (IECC)--Residential – Jerry Peterson, 
Energy Program Manager and Dave Freelove, Idaho Energy Code Circuit 
Rider 

i. 2018 IECC Cost Analysis – Jerry Peterson 
 

b. International Energy Conservation Code (IECC)--Commercial – Eric Makela, 
New Building Institute 
 

c. International Building Code (IBC) and International Existing Building Code 
(IEBC) – Jason Blais, Board Member 

 
d. International Residential Code (IRC) – Patrick Sullivan, city of Nampa and 

Charlie Allen, city of Ammon 
i. Chapter 10 Means of Egress, Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator 



P a g e  2 | 2 
 

 
ACTION AGENDA 
3. Negotiated Rulemaking Schedule – Andrew Bick 
 
INFORMATIONAL AGENDA 
4. Benefits and Practices of Installing Continuous Insulation for Buildings, Gunnar 

Gladics, Pivot North Design 
 

5. Basic Rulemaking – Patrick J. Grace, Regional Manager 
 

6. Program Manager Report – Jeff Egan, Building Program Manager 
 

7. Administrator Report – Chris L. Jensen, Administrator 
a.    Financial Report 

 
12:30 p.m. ADJOURN 
 
For additional agenda information, refer to the packet, available one week prior to this meeting, at the DBS’s central and regional offices and 
https://dbs.idaho.gov/boards/bcboard/bcmeetings.html.   
 
All times, other than beginning, are approximate and scheduled in accordance to Mountain Daylight Time (MDT), unless otherwise noted.  Agenda 
items may shift depending on the Idaho Building Code Board preference.  04/03/2019r 

https://dbs.idaho.gov/boards/bcboard/bcmeetings.html


 

February 19, 2019 IBCB Draft Minutes  Page 1 of 3 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
Tuesday – February 19, 2019 – 9:30 a.m. (MST) 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene 
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello 

 
*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE FEBRUARY 19, 2019 MEETING 

 
NOTE:  The following report is not intended to be a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting, but to record the 
significant features of those discussions. 
 
Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:34 a.m. (MST) 
 
Board Members Present:  DBS Staff Members Present: 
Andrew Bick, Chairman  Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator 
Jason Blais, Vice-Chairman  Spencer Holm, Deputy Attorney General 

 Stan Browning  Jeff Egan, Building Program Manager 
 Kent Soelberg  Larry Jeffres, Regional Manager, Region 1 
 Allen Jensen   Patrick J. Grace, Regional Manager, Region 2 
 John Cotner   Adam Bowcutt, Regional Manager, Region 3 
 Chuck Bleth-Teleconference   Lisa Stover, Building Program Supervisor 
   Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2 
 
♦ Open Forum 

There were no new issues to discuss under open forum. 
 

♦ Approval of the February 19, 2019 Agenda, and Board Meeting Minutes for October 
16, 2018, November 13, 2018 (Special), December 11, 2018 (Special), January 15, 2019 
(Special) and January 29, 2019 (Special) 
MOTION:  John Cotner made a motion to accept the agenda and minutes as presented.  
Allen Jensen seconded.  All in favor, motion carried. 
 

♦ Discuss and Review 2018 codes; International Building Code (IBC), International 
Existing Building Code (IEBC), International Residential Code (IRC), International 
Energy Conservation Code (IECC)--Residential, and International Energy 
Conservation Code (IECC)--Commercial 
This meeting is to review items of concern generated from the four special meetings held in 
November and December 2018, as well as January 2019, regarding possible adoption of the 
2018 codes. 
 
A document by Jerry Peterson, DBS Energy Program Manager, and David Freelove, Idaho 
Energy Code Circuit Rider, titled 2018 Residential IECC Discussion Update was e-mailed 
and distributed to all interested parties.  A cost analysis of the 2018 IECC should be complete 
by mid-March, with a summary of the findings available at the April 2019 board meeting. 



 

February 19, 2019 IBCB Draft Minutes  Page 2 of 3 

 
An e-mail from Teri Ottens, Idaho Association of Building Officials, states the following 
individuals will provide proposed code changes to the Board:  Jason Blais, Board Member – 
IBC; Patrick Sullivan, city of Nampa and Charlie Allen, city of Ammon – IRC; Jerry 
Peterson and Dave Freelove – IECC (Residential); and Eric Makela, New Building Institute – 
IECC (Commercial).  Although there are no major amendments to the IEBC, Board Member 
Blais offered to present any changes to the Board. 
 
Governor Brad Little recently issued Executive Order 2019-02, Red Tape Reduction Act.  To 
propose a new rule for publication in the Idaho Administrative Bulletin, the Division must 
submit to the Division of Financial Management an impact statement; identifying the impact 
the proposed rule will have on individuals and small businesses.  In addition, at least two 
existing rules will need to be repealed or significantly simplified, or a statement clearly and 
thoroughly stating why existing rules cannot be simplified or eliminated. 
 
As part of the negotiated rulemaking process, the April 16, 2019 and June 18, 2019 meetings 
will be held as public hearings.  Should the Board need to finalize negotiated rulemaking, a 
special meeting will be held on August 20, 2019.  Deputy Attorney General Spencer Holm 
offered, and Chairman Andrew Bick agreed, to provide the Building Code Comment 
Submittal form to anyone that is interested.  In addition, the Deputy Attorney General 
explained the timeline for negotiated rulemaking. 
 
Greg Wilson, Senior Policy Advisor, is the Division’s liaison with the Governor’s office.  
Chairman Bick requested Mr. Wilson’s contact information.  Regional Manager Patrick J. 
Grace offered to share information he will receive on a basic rulemaking class to be held on 
February 22, 2019. 
 
Board Member Blais noted at the November 13, 2018 special board meeting, there were 
items of conflict in Chapter 10, Means of Egress, sections 1010.1.4.4 and 1010.1.9.8 of the 
2018 IBC regarding school safety.  Deputy Administrator Ron Whitney offered for the 
Division’s Office of School Safety and Security to review and provide input on the language. 
 
ACTION:  Deputy Administrator Whitney will meet with the Division’s Office of School 
Safety and Security to review the language in Chapter 10, Sections 1010.1.4.4 and 
1010.1.9.8. 
 

♦ Program Manager Report 
Legislation – On January 21, 2019, Building Program Manager Jeff Egan presented the 
Board’s proposed rule, Docket No. 07-0301-1801, to the House Business Committee, where 
it passed.  The proposal is to revise the incorporation by reference of the IECC by removing 
reference to a chapter of the code regarding energy efficiency and adding a table regarding 
piping volume and maximum piping length.  It has not been heard by the Senate Commerce 
and Human Resources Committee; however, since it has been approved by the House, if it 
does not get brought up in the Senate, the amendments become permanent anyway. 
 
House Bill 108 – This bill amends existing law to provide for building plans examiners, to 
remove reference to the International Conference of Building Officials, and to revise a 



 

February 19, 2019 IBCB Draft Minutes  Page 3 of 3 

provision regarding inspector certification.  It passed in the House Business Committee 
and has been referred to the Senate Commerce and Human Resources Committee. 
 
Plan Reviews/Inspections – The Division entered into contracts with the cities of Arimo and 
Fairfield to provide building plan review and building inspection services. 
 

♦ Administrator Report 
In the absence of the Administrator, Deputy Administrator Ron Whitney presented the report. 
 
Legislation (Cont’d) – With the exception of the one rule mentioned by Building Program 
Manager Egan, all rules submitted by DBS have passed both the House Business and Senate 
Commerce and Human Resources Subcommittees. 
 

♦ Adjournment 
MOTION:  Jason Blais made a motion to adjourn the meeting.  John Cotner seconded.  All 
in favor, motion carried. 

 
The meeting adjourned at 11:02 a.m. (MST) 
 
 
 
          
ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN  RON WHITNEY, DEPUTY ADMINISTRATOR 
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 

 
 
 

          
DATE  DATE 
 
*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board.  03/11/2019rb 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 02a     International Energy Conservation Code (Residential) 
 
PRESENTER: Jerry Peterson, DBS Energy Program Manager and Dave Freelove, Idaho 

Energy Code Circuit Rider 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Discuss and review for possible adoption of the 2018 IECC-Residential. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION:  Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic was addressed at a special meeting of the Board on January 15, 

2019.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL   
HISTORY:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS:  Proposed changes to the 2018 IECC-Residential. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 
Items in black indicate “no change”. Items in red are “what is currently being discussed”. Please understand 
that “this document” is being circulated “for comments”. A “final proposal” needs to be submitted in “the 
negotiated rule format” approximately April 1, 2019. None of the language (narrative) in “italics” will be 
included in the final proposal. “Reason statements” are required as part of the negotiated rules form. 

  
For questions or comments related to this document, please email: Jerry.Peterson@dbs.idaho.gov or 
David.Freelove@yahoo.com.  

 
Any code reference or table in the amendments (below) that refer to Chapter 11 of the IRC (they start with 
N) will need to be changed because of last year’s legislation that removed Chapter 11 of the IRC from the 
State’s adopted codes.  
 
Please note that the way our amendments (below) are currently listed, Commercial and Residential are 
not separated or identified in separate categories.  
 
 04. International Energy Conservation Code. 20158 Edition with the following amendments:  

(3-29-17)(Insert date) 
 

The code reference (below) would not be applicable to the 2018 IECC if both the Residential and 
Commercial codes are adopted. This amendment was needed when the 2015 IECC Commercial Code was 
adopted in 2017 but the not the Residential Code since they were both contained in one IECC Code book. 

             
a. Delete the Residential Provisions of the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) set 

forth in chapters 1 [RE] through 6 [RE]; including Appendix RA (pages R 1 through R 57), and 
replace with the Residential Provisions of the 2012 IECC set forth therein in chapters 1 [RE] 
through 5 [RE] (pages R1 through R 47) and as such provisions may be further amended herein 
these rules. 

(3-29-17) 
 

b.a.Add the following as new subsection C101.5.3: Industrial, electronic, and manufacturing 
equipment. Buildings or portions thereof that are heated or cooled exclusively to maintain the 
required operating temperature of industrial, electronic, or manufacturing equipment shall be 
exempt from the provisions of this code. Such buildings or portions thereof shall be separated 
from connected conditioned space by building thermal envelope assemblies complying with this 
code.   

(3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 

c.b.Add the following exception No. (10) under section C403.3 Economizers (Prescriptive): Unusual 
outdoor air contaminate conditions – Systems where special outside air filtration and treatment 
for the reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air economizer 
infeasible.  

(3-29-17)(Insert date) 
 

The language and tables (below) will be replaced to reflect current (tentative) discussions on changes to 
windows and ceiling insulation for climate zone 5. There is an increase in efficiency for skylights for climate 
zone 5 and 6. The remainder of the proposed table doesn’t change from our current amendments to the 
2018 IECC. Modeling indicates that requiring R49 ceiling insulation in climate zone 5 (in Idaho) is not cost 

mailto:Jerry.Peterson@dbs.idaho.gov
mailto:David.Freelove@yahoo.com


effective. Additionally, 25% of builders are using U-factor 0.32 windows at this time. Modeling indicates 
that requiring more stringent values in climate zone 5 (in Idaho) may not be cost effective. There were too 
many variables to determine an accurate upfront cost and there is an understanding that the window 
manufacturers are offering more efficient windows without additional cost that may make the 
requirement a moot point.  
 

d.c. Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.12 (Table N1102.1.1) for climate zone “5 and Marine 
4” and climate zone “6” and replace with the following: 

 
  

TABLE R402.1.12 
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT 

 
Climate 

Zone 

 
Fenestration 

U- Factor 

 
Skylight 
U-factor 

Glazed 
Fenestration 
SHGC 

 
Ceiling 
R-Value 

Wood 
Fram
e Wall 

R-Value 

Mass 
Wall 
R-Value 

 
Floor 

R-
Value 

Basement 
Wall 

R-Value 

 
Slab R-

Value 

Crawlspace 
Wall 
R-Value 

5 and 
Marine 4 

0.352 0.60
0.55 

NR 38 20 or 
13+5h 

13/17 30g 10/13
15/19 

10, 2 ft 10/1315/19 

 
6 

 
0.350 

 
0.60
0.55 

 
NR 

 
49 

20+5
h or 
13+5h 

10h
 

 
15/19 20 

30g  
15/19 

 
10, 4 ft 

 
10/13 15/19 

(3-20-14)(Insert date) 
 

e.d. Add the following footnote to the title of Table R402.1.12 - Insulation and Fenestration 
Requirements by Component: k. For residential log home building thermal envelope construction 
requirements see section R402.6.   

          (3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 

The U Factor tables (below) are also being changed to reflect the changes made to Insulation and 
Fenestration tables. 
 

f.e. Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.34 (Table N1102.1.3) for climate zone “5 and Marine 
4” and climate zone “6” and replace with the following: 

 
TABLE R402.1.34 

EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS 

Climate 
Zone 

Fenestration 
U-factor 

Skylight 
U-factor 

Ceiling 
R-Value 

Wood Frame 
Wall 
R-Value 

Mass Wall 
R-Value 

Floor 
R-Value 

Basement 
Wall 
R-Value 

Crawlspace 
Wall 
R-Value 

5 and 
Marine 4 

0.352 0.60 
0.55 

0.030 0.057 0.060 0.082 0.033 0.0590 0.065 0.055 

6 0.350 0.60 
0.55 

0.026 0.057 0.045 0.060 0.033 0.050 0.065 0.055 

(3-20-14)(Insert date) 
 
We have not received any comments related to residential steel buildings. In the 2012 IECC there were 
additional efficiency measures as well as adjustments for “steel framed walls” that differentiate between 



16” and 24” stud spacing. It appears that the table below is from the 2009 IECC. It’s important to 
understand that the addition of continuous insulation to “steel framed walls” includes measures to prevent 
condensation inside the wall assemblies. There were no changes from the 2012 IECC table to the 2018 IECC 
table. If there are no objections, the table below would be deleted. Please note that the table below is not 
broken up by climate zones. You would take the initial “insulation and fenestration” requirements from 
the climate zone table (above) and use the table in the 2018 IECC to determine the equivalent for “steel 
framing”. 
 

g. Delete Table R402.2.6 (Table N1102.2.6) and replace with the following: 
 

TABLE R402.2.6 
STEEL-FRAME CEILING, WALL AND FLOOR INSULATION 
(R-VALUE) 

Wood Frame 
R-value Requirement 

Cold-formed Steel Equivalent R-valuea 

Steel Truss Ceilingsb 

R-30 R-38 or R-30 + 3 or R-26 + 5 

R-38 R-49 or R-38 +3 

R-49 R-38 + 5 

Steel Joist Ceilingsb 

R-30 R-38 in 2 x 4 or 2 x 6 or 2 x 8 R-49 in any framing 

R-38 R-49 in 2 x 4 or 2 x 6 or 2 x 8 or 2 x 10 

Steel-Framed Wall 
R-13 R-13 + 5 or R-15 + 4 or R-21 + 3 or R-0 + 10 

R-19 R-13 + 9 or R-19 + 8 or R-25 + 7 

R-21 R-13 + 10 or R-19 + 9 or R-25 + 8 

Steel Joist Floor 
R-13 R-19 in 2 x 6 

R-19 + 6 in 2 x 8 or 2 x 10 

R-19 R-19 + 6 in 2 x 6 
R-19 + 12 in 2 x 8 or 2 x 10 

a. Cavity insulation R-value is listed first, followed by continuous insulation R-value. 
b. Insulation exceeding the height of the framing shall cover the framing. 

  
(3-25-16) 

 
h.f.  Delete section R402.4.1 (N1102.4.1) and replace with the following: Building thermal envelope. 

The building thermal envelope shall comply with sections R402.1.1 and either section R402.4.1.2 
or R402.4.1.3. The sealing methods between dissimilar materials shall allow for differential 
expansion and contraction.    

(3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 

i.g. Delete section R402.4.1.1 (N1102.4.1.1) and replace with the following: Installation. The 
components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table R402.4.1.1 shall be installed in 
accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and the criteria listed in Table R402.4.1.1, as 
applicable to the method of construction. 



(3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 
This code reference (below) would not be applicable to the 2018 IECC since the “fireplace” component is 
no longer in the table.  

 
j.  Delete the criteria requirement for the “Fireplace” component of Table R402.4.1.1 (Table 

N1102.4.1.1) Air Barrier and Insulation Installation, and replace with the following: An air barrier 
shall be installed on fireplace walls. 

(3-20-14) 
 

k.h. Delete section R402.4.1.2 (N1102.4.1.2) and replace with the following: Testing option, Building 
envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when tested air 
leakage is less than seven (7) five (5) air changes per hour (ACH) when tested with a blower door 
at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50Pa) Testing shall occur after rough in and after installation of 
penetrations of the building envelope, including penetrations for utilities, plumbing, electrical, 
ventilation and combustion appliances. Twenty percent (20%) of all new single-family home 
construction shall be tested to establish air leakage rates. Testing shall be concluded in 
accordance with RESNET/ICC 380, ASTM E 779 or ASTM E 1827 and reported at a pressure of 0.2-
inch w.g. (50 Pascals). The jurisdiction having authority may waive this requirement if significant 
testing indicates the five (5) air changes per hour (ACH) requirement is consistently being met or 
exceeded (resulting in a lower ACH). During testing:  

(Insert date) 
 

i. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shall be closed, but not sealed; 
         (3-20-14) 

ii. Dampers shall be closed, but not sealed, including exhaust, intake, makeup air, backdraft 
and flue dampers;   

(3-20-14) 
iii. Interior doors shall be open;  

(3-20-14) 
iv. Exterior openings for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery ventilators shall 

be closed and sealed;   
(3-20-14) 

v. Heating and cooling system(s) shall be turned off;  
(3-20-14) 

vi. HVAC ducts shall not be sealed; and  
(3-20-14) 

vii. Supply and return registers shall not be sealed.  
(3-20-14) 

 
i.   Exceptions will be allowed for rural areas where testing equipment is not available or is cost 

prohibitive.  
(Insert date) 

 
l.j.  Add the following as section R402.4.1.3 (N1102.4.1.3): Visual inspection option, Bbuilding 

envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when the items 
listed in Table R402.4.1.1, applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where 



required by code official an approved party independent from the installer of the insulation shall 
inspect the air barrier and insulation.  

(3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 

m.k. Add the following section: R402.6 (N1102.6) Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope. Residential 
log home construction shall comply with sections R401 (General), R402.4 (Air Leakage), R402.5 
(Maximum Fenestration U-Factor and SHGC), R403.1 (Controls), R403.23.2 (Sealing), R403.2.33.5 
(Building Cavities), sections R403.3 through R403.9 (referred to as the mandatory provisions), 
Section R404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either i., ii., or iii. as follows:  

(3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 

i. Sections R402.2 through R402.3, R403.2.1, R404.1 and Table R402.6;  
(3-25-16) 

ii. Section R405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or  
(3-25-16) 

iii. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program).  
(4-7-11) 

 
n.l. Add Table R402.6 (Table N1102.6) Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements by 

Component to be used only in accordance with item i. of section R402.6 above to appear as 
follows: 

 
TABLE R402.6 

LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT 
For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm. 

          (3-25-16)(Insert date) 
 

 
Climate 

Zone 
 

Fenestration 
U-factora 

 
Skylight 
U-factor 

 
Glazed 
Fenestration 
SHGC 

 
Ceiling 
R-value 

Min. 
Average 
Log 
Size In 
Inches 

 
Floor 

R-value 

 
Basement 

Wall 
R-valued 

Slab 
R-value 

& 
Depthb 

Crawl 
Space 
Wall 

R-valued 

5, 6 - High 
efficiency 
equipment 
pathc 

 
0.32 

 
0.60 

 
NR 

 
49 

 
5 

 
30 

 
15/19 

 
10, 4 ft. 

 
10/13 

5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10, 2 ft. 10/13 

6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 15/19 10, 4 ft. 10/13 

 The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration. 
 
b. R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs. 

 
 90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance 

heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is 
considered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path). 

 
 “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the 

interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement 
wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous 
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. 



Initially we were discussing setting this level at 90%. Feedback from the builder community and the DOE 
study indicated that there were areas of the state at the 75% level. Current technologies and advancement 
in lighting will probably make this a moot point but moving to 90% may be contentious.  
 

o.m.Delete section R404.1 (N1104.1) and replace with the following: Lighting equipment 
(Mandatory). A minimum of fifty percent (50%) seventy-five percent (75%) of the lamps in 
permanently installed lighting fixtures shall be high-efficacy lamps or a minimum of fifty percent 
(50%) seventy-five percent (75%) of the permanently installed lighting fixtures shall contain only 
high efficacy lamps. 

(3-20-14)(Insert date) 
 

n.  Delete section R403.5.3 Hot water pipe insulation (Prescriptive) and replace with the following: 
Insulation for hot water piping with a thermal resistance, R-value, of not less than R-3 shall be 
applied to the following: 

 
There are seven items listed in the 2018 IECC. Two items are being deleted. The first is, ¾ inch or larger pipe 
and the second is the insulation requirement from the water heater to a distribution manifold. There are 
too many variables for determining whether either of those items justify the additional cost and labor that 
includes whether or not they are in “conditioned space”. What is listed is easily understood and consistent 
with current building practices.  

 
1. Piping serving more than one dwelling unit. 
2. Piping located outside the conditioned space. 
3. Piping located under a floor slab. 
4. Buried piping. 
5. Supply and return piping in recirculation systems other than demand recirculation systems.  

(Insert date) 
 

There has been a lot of discussion over the years about what the ERI (HERS) score should be for Idaho. The 
2018 IECC sets the score at 61. The 2015 IECC first introduced the ERI option with a score of 55. Last year 
RESNET and others reworked the calculations related to square footage and other issues. The current scores 
take that into consideration. A 2018 study from RESNET puts the average score in Idaho at 64. There has 
been previous discussions about implementing a “Tiered Approach” based on square footage. There was 
also discussion about moving the score higher to encourage builders to use the ERI option. At this time we 
haven’t received any proposals to adjust the score and are not considering a change to the score itself. 
 
 It has been brought to our attention that R406.3 does provide a ventilation rate equation that is not 
consistent with RESNET/ICC 301 and may be negatively impacting scores. The following amendment would 
remove that equation.  
 

o.    Delete section R406.3 Energy Rating Index and replace with the following: The Energy Rating Index 
(ERI) shall be determined in accordance with RESNET/ICC 301. Energy used to recharge or refuel 
a vehicle used for transportation on roads that are not on the building site shall not be included 
in the ERI reference design or the rated design.  

(Insert date) 
 

 



005.  References to Other Codes. Where any provisions of the codes that are adopted in this Section make 
reference to other construction and safety-related model codes or standards which have not been 
adopted by the involved authority having jurisdiction, to the extent possible, such reference should be 
construed as pertaining to the equivalent code or standard that has been duly adopted by such 
jurisdiction.  

(3-29-10) 
 

There is no amendment related to “buried ducts” R403.3.6. Discussions with HVAC contractors resulted in 
concerns that would be more relevant to training and technical support versus additional code 
requirements since “buried ducts” are an option not a minimum requirement.  
 
Please remember that DBS does not advocate a position for or against code adoption. This document and 
the discussions related to its creation are an attempt to address various concerns from interested 
stakeholders and present it in a manner that is consistent with prior amendments. This document does not 
prohibit or interfere with anyone submitting their own proposal. Please understand there are deadlines for 
submitting “negotiated rules”. The appropriate form is provided on the DBS website. Here is a link. 
 
 https://dbs.idaho.gov/boards/bcboard/NegRules/rulemaking_BUILDING_comment_submittal_form.pdf  
 
 

https://dbs.idaho.gov/boards/bcboard/NegRules/rulemaking_BUILDING_comment_submittal_form.pdf


IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 02b  International Energy Conservation Code (Commercial) 
 
PRESENTER: Eric Makela, New Building Institute 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Discuss and review for possible adoption of the 2018 IECC-Commercial. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION:  Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic was addressed at a special meeting of the Board on January 29, 

2019.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL   
HISTORY:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Proposed changes to the 2018 IECC-Commercial. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 1 

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 
APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF A PROPOSED STATEWIDE AMENDMENT 

TO STATE ADOPTED CODES 
2018 Code Adoption Cycle 

 
 

Log#_____________ 
           (Office Use Only) 
 

PLEASE FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE FIVE 
1.  State Building Code to be Amended: 
□ International Building Code X International Energy Conservation Code 
□ International Residential Code □ International Mechanical Code 
□ International Fuel Gas Code □ National Electrical Code 
□ International Existing Building Code □ 
□ Idaho State Plumbing Code □ 
 
Section __C402.5______________________  Page ____C-38_______________ 
 
2.  Applicant Name (Specific local government, organization or individual): 
 
Eric Makela, New Buildings Institute 
 
 
3.  Signed: 

 
     Associate Director   March 26, 2019 
Proponent      Title    Date 
 
 
4.  Designated Contact Person: 
 
Eric Makela    Associate Director 
Name       Title 
 
 
Address:  New Buildings Institute 
   623 SW Oak Street 
   Portland, OR  92705 
 
(208) 863-6924          
Office Phone     Cell     Fax 
 
 
E-mail address: ericm@newbuildings.org 



 2 

 
5.  Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language. 
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each 
separate proposal. 
 
IECC      C402.5     C-38 
Code      Section    Page 
 
 
Please note number of additional pages: 1 
 
See separate attachment for proposed amendment. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 3 

 
 
Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all 
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete 
proposals will not be accepted. 
 
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show: 
 

1. That it meets basic criteria – See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code 
amendment. 

2. The intended effect – See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the 
benefits and the problems addressed. 

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business – See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how 
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected. 

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to 
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions. 

5. Economic costs and benefits – Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits 
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and 
operation and maintenance. 

 
Part I ♦ Background information on amendment. 
 
Code references:  C402.5   Title:  Air leakage – thermal envelope (Mandatory) 
 
Related Codes: N/A 
(Does this amendment change other related codes?) 
 
Proponent:  Eric Makela, New Buildings Institute  Phone:  (208) 863-6924  Date:  March 25, 2019 
 
NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate 
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below: 
 

 (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need. 
 (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute. 

X (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations. 
 (4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state. 
 (5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions. 

 
Part II ♦ Amendment Benefit: 
 
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment): 
 
Section C402.5 of the 2018 IECC lists envelope leakage testing as an option for complying with 

continuous air barrier requirement.  Other options listed include installing tested materials or 

assemblies.  Typically, the materials and assembly options are selected to comply with this code.  To 

comply with the testing option, the entire building must be tested regardless of building size.  ASHRAE 

Standard 90.1-2016, referenced as an option in the 2018 IECC, includes identical continuous air barrier 

requirements in Section 5.4.3.1.3.  This provision also allows larger buildings greater than 50,000 ft2 to 

only test a portion of the building if they choose to demonstrate compliance using the testing option.  

This proposed amendment would include this same testing option in the IECC, which results in more 

consistency between the IECC and ASHRAE, and will reduce confusion by the building, design and 

enforcement industry in trying to implement two different options for the same provision.   



 4 

The modification will provide a lower cost building envelope testing option for larger buildings.  It is 

important to note that testing is one option for meeting the continuous air barrier requirements in the 

code but the only option that ensures that the building meets the performance threshold specified in 

C402.5.  This will encourage the building and design industry to select the air leakage testing option to 

show compliance with C402.5.  Studies have shown that buildings that are not tested have envelope air 

leakage rates as high as 1.0 CFM/ft2 of envelope area verses the targeted leakage rate of 0.40 cfm/ft2 of 

envelope area.  Lower air leakage commercial buildings result in increased energy savings. 

 
PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria 
listed above) 
 
The primary reason for the amendment is to increase consistency between the commercial provisions of 

the 2018 IECC for the commercial building envelope air leakage testing option and the identical option 

provided in Section 5.4.3.1.3 of ASHRAE Standard 90.1-2016 that allows a lower cost alternative to 

meeting this requirement for larger buildings.  ASHRAE allows a portion of a large building to be tested if 

the building is greater than 50,000 ft2.  The IECC currently requires the entire building to be tested.  

Modifying the IECC language to be consistent with ASHRAE will provide a lower cost alternative to 

testing and result in increases in efficiency if this option is used.  It also provides consistency and clarity 

between the IECC and ASHRAE reducing confusion in the Idaho building, design and enforcement 

industry when implementing this portion of the code. 

 
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION: X New Construction  Alteration / Tenant Improvement / Repair 

 Residential-Single Family  Residential – Multi Family X Commercial X Industrial 

Note that this amendment will also apply to high-rise multifamily 
 
List business/industries affected by amendment 

Manufacturers None 

Specific Construction Contractors & Trades None 

Construction Supply Industry None 

Specialty Trades None 

Types of Buildings None 

Fire Protection Industry None 

 
Types of Services Required 

 Reporting:  Brief Description No addition reporting over current code provision 

 Record Keeping:  Brief Description No additional record keeping over current code provision 

 Other:  Brief Description None 

 Indirect Cost to Industry:  Indicate whether there are multiple sources to obtain the equipment. Materials or 
service required by this proposal.  If not, provide justification of the benefit versus small business impact.  

 
Part IV – Amendment Costs and Benefits 
Note that this amendment will create an exception that will allow the air leakage testing option 
to be conducted at a lower cost if the builder and designer chose to select this option for 
complying with the continuous air barrier requirement. 
 
 
 



 5 

Building Type Construction1 Enforcement2 Operation & Maintenance3 

  
Costs 

% 
impact4 

 
Benefits5 

 
Costs 

% 
Impact 

 
Benefits 

 
Costs 

% 
Impact 

 
Benefits 

Residential          

Single Family          

Multi-family (4 story 
and above) 

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Commercial/Retail N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Industrial N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Institutional N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

 
 



 6 

Proposed Modification to the 2018 IECC Commercial Provisions 
 
Modify the following provision by adding a new exception as follows: 
 
 
C402.5 Air leakage—thermal envelope (Mandatory). The thermal envelope of buildings shall 
comply with Sections C402.5.1 through C402.5.8, or the building thermal envelope shall be 
tested in accordance with ASTM E 779 at a pressure differential of 0.3 inch water gauge (75 Pa) 
or an equivalent method approved by the code official and deemed to comply with the provisions 
of this section when the tested air leakage rate of the building thermal envelope is not greater 
than 0.40 cfm/ft2 (2.0 L/s • m2). Where compliance is based on such testing, the building shall 
also comply with Sections C402.5.5, C402.5.6 and C402.5.7. 
 

Exception:  For buildings having over 50,000 ft2 of conditioned floor area, air leakage 
testing shall be permitted to be conducted on less than the whole building, provided the 
following portions of the building are tested and their measured air leakage is area-
weighted by the surface areas of the building envelope: 

1. The entire floor area of all stories that have any spaces directly under a roof. 

2. The entire floor area of all stories that have a building entrance or loading 
dock. 

3. Representative above-grade wall sections of the building totaling at least 25% 
of the above-grade wall area enclosing the remaining conditioned space; floor 
area tested per (1) and (2) shall not be included in the 25%. 

 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 02c       International Building Code (IBC) and International 
Existing Building Code (IEBC)         
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Board Member 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Discuss and review for possible adoption of the 2018 IBC and IEBC. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION:  Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic was addressed at a special meeting of the Board on November 

13, 2018.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL   
HISTORY:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS:  Proposed changes to the 2018 IBC and IEBC. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 





 2

 
5.  Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language. 
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each 
separate proposal. 
 
IDAPA 07.03.01, 004      01     2-4 
Code      Section    Page 
 
 
Please note number of additional pages: 3 
 
 
Proposal to adopt the 2018 International Building Code making editorial and formatting 
amendment update modifications, deletions or additions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01, 
accordingly to align. 
 
See separate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 3

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all 
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete 
proposals will not be accepted. 
 
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show: 
 

1. That it meets basic criteria – See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code 
amendment. 

2. The intended effect – See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the 
benefits and the problems addressed. 

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business – See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how 
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected. 

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to 
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions. 

5. Economic costs and benefits – Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits 
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and 
operation and maintenance. 

 
 
Part I ♦ Background information on amendment. 
 
Code references: IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01  Title: International Building Code 
 
Related Codes: Aligns with the International Existing Building Code 
(Does this amendment change other related codes?) 
 
Proponent: Jason Blais    Phone: 208-608-7097   Date: 3/19/19 
 
NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate 
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below: 
 

� (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need. 
� (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute. 
  (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations. 
� (4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state. 
  (5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions. 

 
 
Part II ♦ Amendment Benefit: 
 
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment): 
 
Proposal to update the International Building Code to the latest published edition, recommending 
adoption for up to date provisions in Idaho, to provide a reasonable level of safety, public health and 
general welfare through structural strength, means of egress, stability, sanitation, light, ventilation, 
efficiency and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards, and to provide a reasonable level of 
safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations, in the built environment.  
 
New amendments or existing amendment modifications update formatting, code sections and have 
language aligning with other state statutes, administrative rules or codes adopted by the state. Proposal to 
update also allows for new methods/technologies and to align for consistency with the proposal to update 
the International Existing Building Code to the latest published edition, as these two codes work hand in 
hand together. 



 4

Amendment b. – New amendment, language added/amended for accurate cross reference clarification 
on when five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care may comply with the International Residential 
Code, with removal of sprinkler language, consistent with already amended IBC section 310.4.1. 
 
Amendment c. – New amendment, language added/amended for accurate cross reference clarification 
on when five (5) or fewer persons receiving medical care needs to be classified as an R-3 occupancy, 
removing option to comply with International Residential Code. 
 
Amendment e. – Reformatting of existing amendment for what is classified as an R-3 Occupancy in the 
IBC. Clarifying the types of care in care facilities. Categorizing congregate living facilities (nontransient 
with 16 or fewer occupants) and (transient with 10 or fewer occupants). Adding language of transient and 
10 or fewer occupants to the lodging houses with 5 or fewer guest rooms. 
 
Amendment f. – Modification of existing amendment clarifying the types of care, personal care and 
custodial care, that can be allowed to comply with the International Residential Code for one and two 
family dwellings. 
 
Amendment h. – Modification of existing amendment, deleting and reinserting amendment in correct 
order of amendments, adding language to delete footnote f location and language and replace with new 
location in Table. Replacement language remains the same from prior adoption. The 2018 IBC has a new 
footnote f for outdoor swimming pools and calculating plumbing fixtures in accordance with the 
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, but this method appears much more restrictive/costly for 
medium to smaller size pools. It is recommended to delete this footnote and replace with our previous 
approved drinking fountain footnote in its place. 
 
Amendment i. – New amendment, language added to this new IBC section cross referencing and stating 
the need to comply with administrative rules and statutes adopted by the State of Idaho for modular 
buildings. 
 
 
PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria 
listed above) 
 
Effectuating duties of the board under Title 39 Health and Safety, Chapter 41, Idaho Building Code Act, 
of state statute, continually studying the operation of adopted codes, standards and rules relating to the 
construction of buildings and facilities, with an ongoing effort to promote uniform adoption of building 
codes statewide, including the authority to recommend adoption of later editions of codes and to 
promulgate rules, including evaluating updates with the effect upon and in the interest of public safety.  
 
There are up to date provisions within the code, including Flood Hazard Area provisions that do align 
with current FEMA standards. New amendments or existing amendment modifications update formatting, 
code sections and have language aligning with other state statutes, administrative rules or codes adopted 
by the state. Updating allows for new methods/technologies and to align for consistency with the proposal 
to update the International Existing Building Code to the latest published edition, as these two codes 
integrate with each other. 
 
Regarding Executive Order No. 2019-02, Red Tape Reduction Act: 
 

1. Business/competitiveness impact statement – This updated code provides up to date provisions 
and options to achieve compliance with minimum provisions when a business constructs a 
building. New methods and technologies are also available as options within this code. 

 



 5

2. One existing amendment rule item is proposed to be deleted. Another is being deleted but being 
reinserted in correct order with some rewording. Regarding other existing or new amendment 
rules related to this code, some are being reformatted, others cannot be simplified or eliminated as 
doing so would result in more restrictive/costly provisions or cause conflicts with other 
provisions of state statutes, administrative rules or codes adopted by the state (e.g. child care state 
statute, modular building rules and statute, cross reference language for care facility scoping and 
eliminating sprinklers in the International Residential Code aligning with state statute). 



jblais
Text Box
6



 

Section 005 Page 1 BMyles_02082019  

 

IDAPA 07 
TITLE 03 

CHAPTER 01 

 

07.03.01 – RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY 

 
000. LEGAL AUTHORITY. 
The Idaho Building Code Board of the Division of Building Safety is authorized under Section 39-4107, Idaho Code, 
to promulgate rules concerning the enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building Code Act. (3-30-06) 
 
001. TITLE AND SCOPE. 
 
 01. Title. These rules shall be cited as IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of 
Building Safety.  (3-30-06) 
 
 02. Scope. These rules prescribe the criteria for enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building 
Code Act by the Idaho Building Code Board and the Building Bureau of the Division of Building Safety. (3-30-06) 
 
002. WRITTEN INTERPRETATIONS. 
In accordance with Section 67-5201(19)(b)(iv), Idaho Code, this agency has statements that pertain to the 
interpretation of the rules of this chapter. These statements are available for review and copying at the offices of the 
Division of Building Safety. (3-30-06) 
 
003. ADMINISTRATIVE APPEALS. 
This chapter does not provide for administrative relief of the provisions contained herein. (3-30-06) 
 
004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE. 
Under the provisions of Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted and 
incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. Pursuant to 
Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the effective date of any edition of the codes adopted in this Section, or any amendments 
identified thereto, shall be January 1 of the succeeding year following legislative approval of the rulemaking 
establishing the edition or amendment. Copies of these documents may be reviewed at the office of the Division of 
Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from International Code Council, 5360 Workman Mill Road, 
Whittier, California 90601-2298 or the International Code Council at http://www.iccsafe.org. 
   (3-20-14) 
 
 01. International Building Code. 2015 2018 Edition with the following amendments: (3-29-17) 
 
 a. Delete section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling 
unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving such day 
care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14) 
 
 b. Delete section 308.2.4 and replace with the following: Five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial 
care. A facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy 
or shall comply with the International Residential Code. 
 
 c. Delete section 308.3.2 and replace with the following: Five (5) or fewer persons receiving medical 
care. A facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving medical care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy. 
 
 b. d. Delete section 308.65.4 and replace with the following: Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A 



 

Section 005 Page 2 BMyles_02082019  

facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or having 
five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with 
the International Residential Code. (3-20-14) 
 
 c. e. Delete section 310.54 and replace with the following: Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-
3 occupancies where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, E or 
I, including:  (3-29-17) 
 
 i. Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units; (3-20-14) 
 
 ii. Boarding houses (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14) 
 
 ii. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons receiving personal care, 
custodial care or medical care; 
 
 iii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14) 
 
 iii. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; 
     Boarding houses (nontransient) 
     Convents 
     Dormitories 
     Fraternities and sororities 
     Monasteries 
 
 iv. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care; (3-20-14) 
 
 iv. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; 
     Boarding houses (transient) 
 
 v. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14) 
 
 vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or (3-20-14) 
 
 vii. v. Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children. (3-20-14) 
 
 viii. vi. Lodging houses (transient) with five (5) or fewer guest rooms and ten (10) or fewer occupants. 
   (3-29-17) 
 
 d. f. Delete section 310.54.1 and replace with the following: Care facilities within a dwelling. Care 
facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving personal care 
or custodial care that are within a one or two single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International 
Residential Code. (3-20-14) 
 
 e. Delete the last paragraph of section 2107.2.1 Lap Splices, and replace with the following: In regions 
of moment where the design tensile stresses in the reinforcement are greater than eighty percent (80%) of the allowable 
steel tension stress, FS, the lap length of splices shall be increased not less than fifty percent (50%) of the minimum 
required length, but need not be greater than 72 db. Other equivalent means of stress transfer to accomplish the same 
fifty percent (50%) increase shall be permitted. Where epoxy coated bars are used, lap length shall be increased by 
fifty percent (50%). (3-28-18) 
 
 f. Add footnote (f) in the header row of the table column labeled “Drinking Fountains” of Table 2902.1 
Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and add footnote (f) under Table 2902.1 to state the following: 
Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer. (3-29-17) 
 
 g. Delete footnote (e) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures 
and replace with the following: For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies with an 



 

Section 005 Page 3 BMyles_02082019  

occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required. (3-29-17) 
 
 h. Delete footnote (f) from Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and add 
footnote (f) in the header row of the table column labeled “Drinking Fountains” of Table 2902.1 Minimum Number 
of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and delete footnote (f) under Table 2902.1 and replace with the following: Drinking 
fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer. 
 
 i. Delete IBC section 3113.1 and replace with the following: General. The provisions of this section 
shall apply to relocatable buildings. Relocatable buildings manufactured after the effective date of this code shall 
comply with the applicable provisions of this code and comply with the administrative rules and statutes adopted by 
the State of Idaho for modular buildings. 
  Exception: This section shall not apply to manufactured housing used as dwellings. 
 
 02. International Residential Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments: (3-20-14) 
 
 a. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (3-20-14) 
 
 b. Delete exception No. 2 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope, and replace with the following: 
Owner-occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance 
with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings. (4-11-15) 
 
 c. Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work exempt 
from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four (4) feet (one 
thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. (4-7-11) 
 
 d. Add the following item No. 11 at the end of the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - 
Work exempt from permit: Flag poles. (3-20-14) 
 
 e. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For 
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor, 
including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of the 
lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. (3-29-10) 
 
 f. IRC Table R302.1(1) Exterior Walls -- delete Table R302.1(1) and replace with the following: 
 

TABLE R302.1(1) 
EXTERIOR WALLS 

 

EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT 
MINIMUM FIRE-RESISTANCE 

RATING 

MINIMUM FIRE 
SEPARATION 

DISTANCE 

Walls 
Fire-resistance rated 

1 hour-tested in accordance with 
ASTM E 119 or UL263 with  
exposure from both sides 

< 3 feet 

Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours ≥ 3 feet 

Projections 
Fire-resistance rated 1 hour on the underside ≥ 2 feet to < 3 feet 

Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours ≥ 3 feet 

Openings Not allowed N/A < 3 feet 





 2

5.  Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language. 
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each 
separate proposal. 
 
IDAPA 07.03.01, 004      03     7 
Code      Section    Page 
 
 
Please note number of additional pages: 
 
 
03. International Existing Building Code. 2015 2018 Edition. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 3

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all 
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete 
proposals will not be accepted. 
 
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show: 
 

1. That it meets basic criteria – See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code 
amendment. 

2. The intended effect – See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the 
benefits and the problems addressed. 

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business – See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how 
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected. 

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to 
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions. 

5. Economic costs and benefits – Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits 
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and 
operation and maintenance. 

 
 
Part I ♦ Background information on amendment. 
 
Code references: IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 03  Title: International Existing Building Code 
 
Related Codes: Aligns with the International Building Code 
(Does this amendment change other related codes?) 
 
Proponent: Jason Blais    Phone: 208-608-7097   Date: 3/19/19 
 
NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate 
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below: 
 

� (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need. 
� (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute. 
 (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations. 
� (4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state. 
� (5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions. 

 
 
Part II ♦ Amendment Benefit: 
 
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment): 
 
Proposal to update the International Existing Building Code to the latest published edition, 
recommending adoption for up to date provisions in Idaho, to provide flexibility to permit the use of 
alternative approaches to achieve compliance with minimum provisions to safeguard public health, safety 
and welfare insofar as they are affected by the repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition and 
relocation of existing buildings. Proposal to update also allows for new methods/technologies and to align 
for consistency with the proposal to update the International Building Code to the latest published 
edition, as these two codes work hand in hand together. 
 
 
 



 4

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria 
listed above) 
 
Effectuating duties of the board under Title 39 Health and Safety, Chapter 41, Idaho Building Code Act, 
of state statute, continually studying the operation of adopted codes, standards and rules relating to the 
construction of buildings and facilities, with an ongoing effort to promote uniform adoption of building 
codes statewide, including the authority to recommend adoption of later editions of codes and to 
promulgate rules, including evaluating updates with the effect upon and in the interest of public safety.  
 
There are up to date provisions within the code, including Flood Hazard Area provisions that do align 
with current FEMA standards. Updating allows for new methods/technologies and to align for 
consistency with the proposal to update the International Building Code to the latest published edition, as 
these two codes integrate with each other. 
 
Regarding Executive Order No. 2019-02, Red Tape Reduction Act: 
 

1. Business/competitiveness impact statement – This updated code provides more flexibility and 
options of approaches to achieve compliance with minimum provisions when a business conducts 
a repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition or relocation to their building. New methods 
and technologies are also available as options within this code. 

 
2. Existing rules related to this code cannot be simplified or eliminated as there are no other existing 

amendment rules related to this specific code. 



jblais
Text Box
5



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 02d             International Residential Code 
 
PRESENTER: Patrick Sullivan, city of Nampa and Charlie Allen, city of Ammon 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Discuss and review for possible adoption of the 2018 IRC. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION:  Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic was addressed at a special meeting of the Board on December 

11, 2018.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL   
HISTORY:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Proposed changes to the IRC. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 1 

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 
APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF A PROPOSED STATEWIDE AMENDMENT 

TO STATE ADOPTED CODES 
2018 Code Adoption Cycle 

 
 

Log#_____________ 
           (Office Use Only) 
 

PLEASE FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE FIVE 
1.  State Building Code to be Amended: 
□ International Building Code □ International Energy Conservation Code 
☑ International Residential Code □ International Mechanical Code 
□ International Fuel Gas Code □ National Electrical Code 
□ International Existing Building Code ☑ IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02 
□ Idaho State Plumbing Code  
 
Section: IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02  Pages: 2-7 
 
2.  Applicant Name (Specific local government, organization or individual): 
 
Idaho Association of Building Officials (IDABO) 
 
3.  Signed: 

 
Patrick Sullivan   City of Nampa Building Official  3-22-2019 
Proponent      Title    Date 
 
 
4.  Designated Contact Person: 
 
Patrick Sullivan    City of Nampa Building Official 
Name       Title 
 
 
Address:  City of Nampa 
   411 3rd Street S 
   Nampa, ID 83656 
 
208-468-5445    208-249-5134 
Office Phone     Cell     Fax 
 
 
E-mail address: sullivanw@cityofnampa.us7 
 
5.  Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language. 



 2 

See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each 
separate proposal. 
 
IRC    IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02    2-7 
Code      Section    Pages 
 
 
Please note number of additional pages: 6 
 
To adopt the 2018 International Residential Code and present amendment update changes and 
deletions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02, to align the 2018 International Residential 
Code(IRC)with current IDAPA Rules. 
 
See separate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes. 
 
Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all 
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete 
proposals will not be accepted. 
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show: 
 

1. That it meets basic criteria – See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code 
amendment. 

2. The intended effect – See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the 
benefits and the problems addressed. 

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business – See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how 
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected. 

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to 
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions. 

5. Economic costs and benefits – Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits 
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and 
operation and maintenance. 

 
Part I ♦ Background information on amendment. 
 
Code references: IRC, IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02   Title: International Residential Code 
 
Related Codes: IECC 
(Does this amendment change other related codes?) 
 
Proponent: Patrick Sullivan    Phone: 208-249-5134  Date: 3-10-19 
 
NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate 
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below: 
 

 (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need. 
� (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute. 
 (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations. 
 (4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state. 
☑ (5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions. 

 
 
 



 3 

Part II ♦ Amendment Benefit: 
 
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment): 
 
Most of the proposed amendments to the IDAPA rules are only editorial in nature in order to align them 
with the 2018 edition of the International Residential Code (IRC). 
 
In proposing the 2018 IRC, some IDAPA rule amendments need some updating or deleting in order to 
align, for example:  
 

• Revised sprinkler exemptions for residences with lodging, custodial care, personal care, and 
daycare. R101.2 

• Deleted townhouse fire wall amendments due to the 2018 IRC townhouse fire wall provisions 
detailed the same requirements as the IDAPA amendment. R314.2.2 

• Added heavy timber and fire-retardant wood options to Table R302.1(1) amended IRC Table 
R302.1(1) now needs beneficial footnotes added to the Table.  

• Amendment language is also needed for the IRC Section R302.2 for acceptable townhouse wall 
separation requirements outlined in the IDAPA rules. 

• Expanded smoke detector exemptions. R314.2.2. 
• Deleted three 2018 IRC footing tables and replaced with 2012 IRC footing table R403.1. 
• The IDAPA rules have IRC Section R501.3 struck from the code but this code section has now 

changed to R302.13.   
• Deleted Tiny house amendments due to the 2018 IRC Tiny House provisions. Appendix Q 

 
A majority of changes in the 2018 IRC will reduce costs to builders and provide clarification and ease of 
finding code requirements. An exception to that is the new requirement for the number of king studs next 
to headers depending on the size of the header needed. An amendment was made to reduce the overly 
conservative numbers to align with more current framing practices. This was developed by the American 
Wood Council and has research to back their proposal.  
 
PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria 
listed above) 
 
This proposal to adopt the 2018 International Residential Code (IRC) updates 6 years of industry 
standards for building materials, corrects errors in the code, and consolidates many confusing 
requirements of the code into the correct chapters of the code for specific scopes of work. There is the 
need to update or delete some of the IDAPA rule amendments. Doing so will correct errors or omissions 
to align with the code text. The proposed IDAPA amendments to the 2018 International Residentials 
Code are consistent with the scope of past IDAPA Rules with no increases in construction costs due to 
these amendments.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 Division of Building Safety Page 4 of 5   

TYPE OF BENEFITS PROJECTED:   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Part III  Amendment Impacts or Benefits:  
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION: [  ] New Construction             [  ] Alteration/Tenant Improvement/Repair  
[  ] Residential-Single Family     [  ] Residential-Multi Family   [  ] Commercial         [  ] Industrial   
 
List businesses/industries affected by amendment:  
 
Manufacturers:  _______________________________________________________    
Specific Construction Contractors & Trades: _____________________________ __________________ 
Construction Supply Industry: ___________________________________________________      
Specialty Trades: __________________________________________              ______ 
Types of Buildings: _____________________________           ____________________  
Fire Protection Industry: ___________________________________   _______________________  
 
Types of Services Required:  
[  ] Reporting:  Brief Description_________________________________________________________ 
[  ] Record Keeping:  Brief Description____________________________________________________ 
[  ] Other:  Brief Description_____________________________________________________________  
[  ] Indirect Cost to Industry:  Indicate whether there are multiple sources to obtain the equipment, 
material or service required by this proposal.  If not, provide a justification of the benefit versus small 
business impact.  
 
Part IV  Amendment Costs and Benefits  
 

 
Building Type 

Construction1 Enforcement2 Operations & 
Maintenance3 

 Co
sts  

% 
impact4 

Benefits5  Costs  % 
impact 

Benefits  Costs  % 
impact 

Benefits  

Residential                    
Single family                    
Multi-family                    
Commercial/
Retail  

                  

Industrial                    
Institutional                    

 
1 $ / square foot of floor area or other cost.  Attach data. Construction costs are costs prior to occupancy, and include both design and direct 
construction costs that impact the total cost of the construction to the owner/consumer.  
2 Cost per project plan.  Attach data. Enforcement costs include governmental review of plans, field inspection, and mediated litigation required 
for enforcement.  
3 Cost to building owner/tenants over the life of the project.  
4 Cost differential over a specific size project or range of projects as determined by the proponent.  Provide sufficient cost and benefit detail to 
clarify the impact to the Council.  All data should be created and referenced to third party reputable sources for verification.  
5 Note sectors with measurable benefit from Part II, including benefits to a) the user, b) the public, c) the industry, and/or d) the economy; use e) 
for all of the above.  
  

sullivanw
Text Box
The adoption and subsequent IDAPA Amendments to the 2015 International Residential Code clarify and consolidate code language, resolve errata in the code, and update industry standards and testing for all building materials allowed in the code. 



 

Section 005 Page 2 BMyles_02082019  

 
 i. Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units; (3-20-14) 
 
 ii. Boarding houses (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14) 
 
 iii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14) 
 
 iv. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care; (3-20-14) 
 
 v. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14) 
 
 vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or (3-20-14) 
 
 vii. Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children. (3-20-14) 
 
 viii. Lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guest rooms. (3-29-17) 
 
 d. Delete section 310.5.1 and replace with the following: Care facilities within a dwelling. Care 
facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care that are 
within a single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14) 
 
 e. Delete the last paragraph of section 2107.2.1 Lap Splices, and replace with the following: In regions 
of moment where the design tensile stresses in the reinforcement are greater than eighty percent (80%) of the allowable 
steel tension stress, FS, the lap length of splices shall be increased not less than fifty percent (50%) of the minimum 
required length, but need not be greater than 72 db. Other equivalent means of stress transfer to accomplish the same 
fifty percent (50%) increase shall be permitted. Where epoxy coated bars are used, lap length shall be increased by 
fifty percent (50%). (3-28-18) 
 
 f. Add footnote (f) in the header row of the table column labeled “Drinking Fountains” of Table 2902.1 
Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and add footnote (f) under Table 2902.1 to state the following: 
Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer. (3-29-17) 
 
 g. Delete footnote (e) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures 
and replace with the following: For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies with an 
occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required. (3-29-17) 
 
 02. International Residential Code. 2012 2018 Edition with the following amendments: (3-20-14) 
 
 a. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (3-20-14) 
 
 b. Delete exception No. 2 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope, and replace with the following: 
Owner-occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance 
with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings. (4-11-15) 
 
 a. Delete the exception including items 1-5 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope, and replace 
with the following: Exception: The following shall also be permitted to be constructed in accordance with this code: 
 

i. Owner occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guest rooms and ten (10) or fewer 
total occupants. 
 

ii. A care facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care within a dwelling 
unit or single-family dwelling. 

 
iii. A care facility for five (5) or fewer persons receiving personal care that are within a 

dwelling unit or single-family dwelling. 
 



 

Section 005 Page 3 BMyles_02082019  

iv. A care facility with twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care within a dwelling unit 
or single-family dwelling. 

 
 b. c. Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work exempt 
from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four (4) feet (one 
thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. (4-7-11) 
 
 c. d. Add the following item No. 11 at the end of the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - 
Work exempt from permit: Flag poles. (3-20-14) 
 
 d. e. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For 
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor, 
including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of the 
lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. (3-29-10) 
 
 e. f.   IRC Table R302.1(1) Exterior Walls -- delete Table R302.1(1) and replace with the following: 
 

TABLE R302.1(1) 
EXTERIOR WALLS 

 

EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT MINIMUM FIRE-RESISTANCE 
RATING 

MINIMUM FIRE 
SEPARATION 

DISTANCE 

Walls 
Fire-resistance rated 

1 hour-tested in accordance with 
ASTM E 119, or UL263 or  

Section 703.3 of the International 
Building Code with  

exposure from both sides 

< 3 feet 

Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours ≥ 3 feet 

Projections 
Fire-resistance rated 

1 hour on the underside, or heavy 
timber, or fire retardant-treated 

wooda,b 
≥ 2 feet to < 3 feet 

Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours ≥ 3 feet 

Openings 
in 

Walls 

Not allowed N/A < 3 feet 

25% maximum of wall area 0 hours ≥ 3 feet to < 5 feet 

Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet 

Penetrations All 
Comply with Section R302.4 < 3 feet 

None required ≥ 3 feet 

 For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm. 
 N/A = Not Applicable 

a. The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on the underside of the eave 
overhang if fireblocking is provided from the wall top plate to the underside of the roof sheathing. 

b. The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on the underside of the rake 
overhang where gable vent openings are not installed. (4-11-15) 

 
 



 

Section 005 Page 4 BMyles_02082019  

 
 g. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2 -- Townhouses, and replace with the 
following two (2) exceptions: (3-25-16) 
 
 i. When provided with an automatic fire sprinkler system per section R313.1, a common one (1)-hour 
fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses if 
such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts, or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The 
wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides, and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls and the 
underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4.
 (3-25-16) 
 
 ii. Two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assemblies (as specified in Section R302.1) or a 
common two (2)-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 are 
permitted for townhouses. If two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls are used, plumbing and electrical 
installations within the wall cavity shall conform to fire-resistance penetration requirements in accordance with section 
R302.4 through R302.4.2 for each of the two (2) one (1)-hour rated walls penetrated. The two (2)-hour fire-resistance-
rated common wall shall not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents within its wall cavity. The 
wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides, and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior walls and the 
underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4.
 (3-25-16) 
 
 f. Delete IRC Section R302.13 Fire protection of floors, including the exceptions. 
 
 g. h. Delete IRC section R303.4 and replace with the following: R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation. 
Dwelling units shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1507.3 
M1505.4. 
 
 Exception: Where the air infiltration rate of a dwelling unit is equal to 5 air changes per hour or greater when 
tested with a blower door at a pressure of 0.2 inch w.c. (50 pa) in accordance with the Testing Section N1102.4.1.2 in 
the Residential Provisions of the adopted International Energy Conservation Code. (4-11-15) 
 
 h. i. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R313.1 -- Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler 
systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be required 
in townhouses where either two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls or a common two (2)-hour fire-resistance 
rated wall, as specified in exception item 2 of section R302.2.2 is installed between dwelling units or when additions 
or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed.
  (3-25-16) 
 
 i. j. Delete IRC section R313.2. (3-29-10) 
 
 j. Delete the exceptions contained under IRC section R314.2.2 - Alterations, repairs and additions, 
and replace with the following: Exceptions: 1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as, but not 
limited to, replacement of roofing or siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a 
porch or deck or electrical permits, are exempt from the requirements of this section; and 2. Installation, alteration or 
repairs of plumbing or mechanical systems are exempt from the requirements of this section. 
 
 k. Add the following to Delete the exceptions contained under IRC section R315.3 R315.2.2 - Where 
required in existing dwellings Alterations, repairs and additions, and replace with the following: Exceptions: 1. Work 
involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as, but not limited to, replacement of roofing or siding, or the 
addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch or deck or electrical permits, are exempt from 
the requirements of this section; and 2. Installation, alteration or repairs of non-combustion plumbing or mechanical 
systems are exempt from the requirements of this section. (3-20-14) 
 
 l. Delete IRC section R322.1.10. (3-29-10) 
 
 m. Delete IRC section R322.2.2 subparagraph 2.2 2.1, and replace with the following: The total net 



 

Section 005 Page 5 BMyles_02082019  

area of all openings shall be at least one (1) square inch (645 mm2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed area, 
or the opening shall be designed and the construction documents shall include a statement that the design and 
installation of the openings will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing the 
automatic entry and exit of floodwaters. (3-20-14) 
 
 n. Delete IRC section R501.3 and its exceptions. (3-20-14) 
 
 n. Delete IRC Section R403.1.1 and replace with the following: Minimum size. The minimum width, 
W, and thickness, T, for concrete footings shall be in accordance with Table R403.1 and Figure R403.1(1) or R403.1.3, 
as applicable. The footing width shall be based on the load-bearing value of the soil in accordance with Table R401.4.1. 
Footing projections, P, shall be not less than 2 inches (51 mm) and shall not exceed the thickness of the footing. 
Footing thickness and projection for fireplaces shall be in accordance with Section R1001.2. The size of footings 
supporting piers and columns shall be based on the tributary load and allowable soil pressure in accordance with Table 
R401.4.1. Footings for wood foundations shall be in accordance with the details set forth in Section R403.2, and 
Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3). Footings for precast foundations shall be in accordance with the details set forth in 
Section R403.4, Table R403.4 and Figures R403.4(1) and R403.4(2). 
 
 o.  Delete IRC Tables R403.1(1), R403.1(2), and R403.1(3) and replace with the following:  
 
   

TABLE R403.1 
MINIMUM WIDTH OF CONCRETE, 

PRECAST OR MASONRY FOOTINGS (inches)a  

  
LOAD-BEARING VALUE OF SOIL (psf) 

1,500 2,000 3,000 ≥ 4,000 
Conventional light-frame construction  

1-story 12 12 12 12 
2-story 15 12 12 12 
3-story 23 17 12 12 

4-inch brick veneer over light frame or 8-inch hollow concrete masonry 
1-story 12 12 12 12 
2-story 21 16 12 12 
3-story 32 24 16 12 

8-inch solid or fully grouted masonry  
1-story 16 12 12 12 
2-story 29 21 14 12 
3-story 42 32 21 16 

     
For SI: 1 inch = 25.4mm, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa. 
a. Where minimum footing width is 12 inches, use of a single wythe of solid or fully 
grouted 12-inch nominal concrete masonry units is permitted. 

 
 
 p. o. Delete IRC section R602.10 and replace with the following: Wall bracing. Buildings shall be braced 
in accordance with this section or, when applicable section R602.12, or the most current edition of APA System Report 
SR-102 as an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one (1) or more of the 
bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designated designed and constructed in accordance with 
section R301.1. (3-20-14) 
 



 

Section 005 Page 6 BMyles_02082019  

 p. Add an Appendix R, titled Tiny Homes to include the following provisions: (3-28-18) 
 
 i. Section AR101 Scope. This appendix shall be applicable to tiny houses used as single dwelling 
units. Tiny houses shall comply with this code except as otherwise stated in this appendix. (3-28-18) 
 
 ii. Section AR102 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this appendix, 
have the meanings shown herein. Refer to Chapter 2 of this code for general definitions. (3-28-18) 
 
 (1) Tiny House. A dwelling that is four hundred (400) square feet (thirty-seven (37) m) or less in floor 
area excluding lofts. (3-28-18) 
 
 (2) Escape and Rescue Roof Access Window. A skylight or roof window designed and installed to 
satisfy the emergency escape and rescue opening requirements in Section R310. (3-28-18) 
 
 (3) Landing Platform. A landing provided as the top step of a stairway accessing a loft. (3-28-18) 
 
 (4) Loft. A floor level located more than thirty (30) inches (762 mm) above the main floor and open to 
it on at least one (1) side with a ceiling height of less than six (6) feet eight (8) inches (2032 mm), used as a living or 
sleeping space.  (3-28-18) 
 
 (iii) Section AR103 Minimum Ceiling Height. Habitable space and hallways in tiny houses shall have a 
ceiling height of not less than six (6) feet eight (8) inches (2032 mm). Bathrooms, toilet rooms, and kitchens shall 
have a ceiling height of not less than six (6) feet four (4) inches (1930 mm). Obstructions shall not extend below these 
minimum ceiling heights including beams, girders, ducts, lighting and other obstructions. Exception: Ceiling heights 
in lofts are permitted to be less than six (6) feet eight (8) inches (2032 mm). (3-28-18) 
 
 iv. Section AR104 Lofts. (3-28-18) 
 
 (1) AR104.1 Minimum loft area and dimensions. Lofts used as a sleeping or living space shall meet the 
minimum area and dimension requirements of Sections AR104.1.1 through AR104.1.3. (3-28-18) 
 
 (a) AR104.1.1 Minimum area. Lofts shall have a floor area of not less than thirty-five (35) square feet 
(3.25 m).  (3-28-18) 
 
 (b) AR104.1.2 Minimum dimensions. Lofts shall be not less than five (5) feet (1524 mm) in any 
horizontal dimension. (3-28-18) 
 
 (c) AR104.1.3 Height effect on loft area. Portions of a loft with a sloping ceiling measuring less than 
three (3) feet (914 mm) from the finished floor to the finished ceiling shall not be considered as contributing to the 
minimum required area for the loft. Exception: Under gable roofs with a minimum slope of 6:12, portions of a loft 
with a sloping ceiling measuring less than 16 inches (406 mm) from the finished floor to the finished ceiling shall not 
be considered as contributing to the minimum required area for the loft. (3-28-18) 
 
 (2) AR104.2 Loft Access. The access to and primary egress from lofts shall be any type described in 
Sections AR104.3 through AR104.6. (3-28-18) 
 
 (3) AR104.3. Stairways. Stairways accessing lofts shall comply with this code or with Sections 
AR104.3.1 through AR104.3.5. (3-28-18) 
 
 (a) AR104.3.1 Width. Stairways accessing a loft shall not be less than seventeen (17) inches (432 mm) 
in clear width at or above the handrail. The minimum width below the handrail shall be not less than twenty (20) 
inches (508 mm). (3-28-18) 
 
 (b) AR104.3.2 Headroom. The headroom in stairways accessing a loft shall be not less than six (6) feet 
two (2) inches (1880 mm), as measured vertically, from a sloped line connecting the tread or landing platform nosings 
in the middle of their width. Exception: The headroom for a landing platform, where stairways access lofts, shall be 



Section 005 Page 7 BMyles_02082019 

not less than four (4) feet six (6) inches (1372 mm). (3-28-18) 

(c) AR104.3.3 Treads and Risers. Risers for stairs accessing a loft shall be not less than seven (7) inches
(178 mm) and not more than twelve (12) inches (305 mm) in height. Tread depth and riser height shall be calculated 
in accordance with one of the following formulas: (3-28-18) 

(i) The tread depth shall be twenty (20) inches (508 mm) minus 4/3 of the riser height, or (3-28-18)

(ii) The riser height shall be fifteen (15) inches (381 mm) minus 3/4 of the tread depth. (3-28-18) 

(d) AR104.3.4 Landing Platforms. The top tread and riser of stairways accessing lofts shall be
constructed as a landing platform where the loft ceiling height is less than six (6) feet two (2) inches (1880 mm) where 
the stairway meets the loft. The landing platform shall be eighteen (18) inches to twenty-two (22) inches (457 to 559 
mm) in depth measured from the nosing of the landing platform to the edge of the loft, and sixteen (16) to eighteen
(18) inches (406 to 457 mm) in height measured from the landing platform to the loft floor. (3-28-18) 

(e) AR104.3.5 Stairway Handrails. Handrails shall comply with Section R311.7.8. (3-28-18) 

(f) AR104.3.6 Stairway Guards. Guards at open sides of stairways shall comply with Section R312.1.
(3-28-18)

(4) AR104.4 Ladders. Ladders accessing lofts shall comply with Sections AR104.4.1 and AR104.4.2.
(3-28-18) 

(a) AR104.4.1 Ladder Size and Capacity. Ladders accessing lofts shall have a rung width of not less
than twelve (12) inches (305 mm) and ten (10) inches (254 mm) to fourteen (14) inches (356 mm) spacing between 
rungs. Ladders shall be capable of supporting a two hundred (200) pound (75 kg) load on any rung. Rung spacing 
shall be uniform within 3/8-inch (9.5 mm). (3-28-18) 

(b) AR104.4.2 Ladder Incline. Ladders shall be installed at seventy (70) to eighty (80) degrees from
horizontal. (3-28-18) 

(5) AR104.5 Alternating Tread Devices. Alternating tread devices accessing lofts, and handrails of
alternating tread devices shall comply with sections 1011.14.1 and 1011.14.2 of the International Building Code, 
excluding the exception. The clear width at and below the handrails shall be not less than twenty (20) inches (508 
mm).   (3-28-18) 

(6) AR104.6. Ships Ladders. Ships ladders accessing lofts, and treads and handrails of ships ladders
shall comply with sections 1011.15.1 and 1011.15.2 of the International Building Code. The clear width at and below 
handrails shall be not less than twenty (20) inches (508 mm). (3-28-18) 

(7) AR104.7 Loft Guards. Loft guards shall be located along the open side of lofts. Loft guards shall
not be less than thirty-six (36) inches (914 mm) in height or one (1)-half of the clear height to the ceiling, whichever 
is less.   (3-28-18) 

v. SECTION AR105. Emergency Escape and Rescue Openings. Tiny houses shall meet the
requirements of Section R310 for emergency escape and rescue openings. Exception: Escape and rescue roof access 
windows in lofts used as sleeping rooms shall be deemed to meet three (3) requirements of Section R310 where 
installed such that the bottom of the opening is not more than forty-four (44) inches (1118 mm) above the loft floor, 
provided the escape and rescue roof access window complies with the minimum opening area requirements of Section 
R310.  (3-28-18) 

03. International Existing Building Code. 2015 Edition. (3-29-17) 

04. International Energy Conservation Code. 2015 Edition with the following amendments:
(3-29-17) 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 03         Negotiated Rulemaking Schedule 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Change the June and August 2019 board meetings to align with the 

timeframe of the Administrative Bulletin for negotiated rulemaking. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Vote to change proposed meeting dates. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: The current dates are June 18th and August 20th.  The proposed dates are:  

June 11th and August 13th. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No Documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 04    Benefits and Practices of Installing Continuous 
Insulation for Buildings           
 
PRESENTER: Gunnar Gladics, Pivot North Design 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Discuss insulation installation practices and cost/benefit analysis from 

PNNL. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No Documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 05                Basic Rulemaking 
 
PRESENTER: Patrick J. Grace, Regional Manager 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Share information from a basic rulemaking class.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No Documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 06           Program Manager Report 
 
PRESENTER: Jeff Egan, Building Program Manager 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide the Board with an overview of the Program’s current activities. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No Documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 07         Administrator Report 
 
PRESENTER: Chris L. Jensen, Administrator 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide the Board with an overview of the Division’s current activities. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No Documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 07a        Financial Report 
 
PRESENTER: Chris L. Jensen, Administrator 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Review the Idaho Building Code Board’s financial report. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Financial Report 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 








	Agenda_Item01.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	bc_draftmin02192019.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday – February 19, 2019 – 9:30 a.m. (MST)
	Division of Building Safety
	Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:34 a.m. (MST)
	Board Members Present:  DBS Staff Members Present:
	Stan Browning  Jeff Egan, Building Program Manager
	Kent Soelberg  Larry Jeffres, Regional Manager, Region 1
	Allen Jensen   Patrick J. Grace, Regional Manager, Region 2
	John Cotner   Adam Bowcutt, Regional Manager, Region 3
	Chuck Bleth-Teleconference   Lisa Stover, Building Program Supervisor
	Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2

	Agenda_Item02a.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jerry Peterson, DBS Energy Program Manager and Dave Freelove, Idaho Energy Code Circuit Rider

	Agenda_Item02b.pdf
	______________________________________________________________________________

	Agenda_Item02c.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Board Member

	Tab02c_State Amendment App 2018 IBC 3-19-19.pdf
	State Amendment App Pages 1 Only 2018 IBC 3-19-19
	State Amendment App Pages 1-5 Only 2018 IBC 3-19-19
	State Amendment App Pages 6 Only 2018 IBC 3-19-19
	070301_Administrative_Rules_Jason_IBC_Changes 3-19-19

	Tab02c_State Amendment App 2018 IEBC 3-19-19.pdf
	State Amendment App 2018 IEBC 3-19-19
	State Amendment App Pages 1 Only 2018 IEBC 3-19-19
	State Amendment App Pages 2-4 Only 2018 IEBC 3-19-19

	State Amendment App Pages 5 Only 2018 IEBC 3-19-19

	Tab02d_State Amendment Application_2018 IRC_IDAPA 07-03-01-004-02_03222019_Final.pdf
	State Amendment App Pages 1-4_2018 IRC_IDAPA 07-03-01-004-02_03222019_Final
	rulemaking_BUILDING_comment_submittal_form page 4

	bc_agenda04162019.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday, April 16, 2019
	9:30 a.m. – 12:30 p.m. (MDT)


	New: Off
	Alt: Off
	Sngl: Yes
	Mult: Off
	Comm: Off
	Ind: Off
	Manufacturers: All manufactureres listed in code standards and references.
	Construction Supply Industry: All Suppliers
	Specific Construction Contractors  Trades: Residential Home Builders
	Specialty Trades: NA
	Types of Buildings: Single Family, Duplex, and Tri-Plex  Dwellings
	Fire Protection Industry: NA
	Rpt: Off
	Reporting Brief Description: 
	Rec: Off
	Other: Off
	Indirect: Yes
	Record Keeping Brief Description: 
	Other Brief Description: 
	Co stsResidential: 0
	 impact4Residential: 0
	Benefits5Residential: e
	CostsResidential: 0
	 impactResidential: 0
	BenefitsResidential: e
	CostsResidential_2: 0
	 impactResidential_2: 0
	BenefitsResidential_2: e
	Co stsSingle family: 
	 impact4Single family: 
	Benefits5Single family: 
	CostsSingle family: 
	 impactSingle family: 
	BenefitsSingle family: 
	CostsSingle family_2: 
	 impactSingle family_2: 
	BenefitsSingle family_2: 
	Co stsMultifamily: 
	 impact4Multifamily: 
	Benefits5Multifamily: 
	CostsMultifamily: 
	 impactMultifamily: 
	BenefitsMultifamily: 
	CostsMultifamily_2: 
	 impactMultifamily_2: 
	BenefitsMultifamily_2: 
	Co stsCommercial Retail: 
	 impact4Commercial Retail: 
	Benefits5Commercial Retail: 
	CostsCommercial Retail: 
	 impactCommercial Retail: 
	BenefitsCommercial Retail: 
	CostsCommercial Retail_2: 
	 impactCommercial Retail_2: 
	BenefitsCommercial Retail_2: 
	Co stsIndustrial: 
	 impact4Industrial: 
	Benefits5Industrial: 
	CostsIndustrial: 
	 impactIndustrial: 
	BenefitsIndustrial: 
	CostsIndustrial_2: 
	 impactIndustrial_2: 
	BenefitsIndustrial_2: 
	Co stsInstitutional: 
	 impact4Institutional: 
	Benefits5Institutional: 
	CostsInstitutional: 
	 impactInstitutional: 
	BenefitsInstitutional: 
	CostsInstitutional_2: 
	 impactInstitutional_2: 
	BenefitsInstitutional_2: 
	Benefits: 


