
DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 
 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
JULY 17, 2014 

 
 
 
 
 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 01               Agenda 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Approve agenda for the July 17, 2014 Idaho Building Code Board 

meeting. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Tentative agenda 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



TENTATIVE AGENDA 
 
 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC MEETING/PUBLIC HEARING 
 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho 
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho 

dbs.idaho.gov – (208) 332-7137 
 

Thursday, July 17, 2014  
9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MT) 

 
(Note:  North Idaho - Meeting Commences @ 8:30 a.m. PT) 

 
9:30 a.m. CALL TO ORDER – Andrew Bick, Chairman 

o Roll Call & Introductions 
o Open Forum 

 
  CONSENT AGENDA 

1. Approval of the July 17, 2014 Agenda 
 
2. Approval of the April 15, 2014 Board Meeting Minutes 

 
3. Approval of the May 15, 2014 Board Hearing Minutes 

 
PUBLIC HEARING 
4. Negotiated Rulemaking – Review proposed amendments to the currently 

adopted building and energy codes.  – Jason Blais, Code Collaborative 
Representative 
a. IRC Section R105.2 “Work Exempt From Permits” 

b. IRC Table R302.1(1) “Exterior Walls” 

c. IRC Section 303.4 “Mechanical Ventilation” 
 

ACTION AGENDA  
5.  Vote on proposed amendments to the currently adopted building and energy 

codes. – Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
a. IRC Section R105.2 “Work Exempt From Permits” 

b. IRC Table R302.1(1) “Exterior Walls” 

c. IRC Section 303.4 “Mechanical Ventilation” 



 
6.   IRC Section R101.2 “Bed and Breakfast” – Correction – Steve Keys 

 
INFORMATIONAL AGENDA 
7. 2013 Idaho Homeowners Energy Code Survey – Sharon Grant, Eco Edge 

 
8. Idaho Building Code – Ron Whitney 

 
9. Program Manager Report – Arlan Smith 

 
10. Operational Report – Steve Keys  

 
11. Administrator Report 

a. Financial Report – C. Kelly Pearce and Kathleen Watkins 

b. Administrator – C. Kelly Pearce 
 

12:30 p.m. ADJOURN 
 
All times, other than beginning, are approximate and are scheduled according to Mountain Time (MT), unless otherwise noted.  Agenda 
items may shift depending on Board preference.  07/01/14r 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 02              Minutes 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Approve minutes from the April 15, 2014 Idaho Building Code Board 

meeting. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Draft minutes 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

Page 1 of 5 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
Tuesday – April 15, 2014 – 9:30 a.m. (MT) 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho 
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho 

 
*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE APRIL 15, 2014 MEETING 

 
NOTE: The following report is not a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting, 

 but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions. 
 

Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:30 a.m. (MT). 
 
Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present: 
Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator 
Chuck Bleth Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations 

 Scott Buck Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration 
 Travis Beck Adam Warr, Deputy Attorney General 
 Jan Welch, P.E. Kathleen Watkins, Financial Manager 

Dennis Schaffner Arlan Smith, Program Manager 
Mike Tracy Terry Blessing, Regional Manager, Region 1 
Michael Arrington Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3 
Dan Hunter Adam Bowcutt, Regional Supervisor, Region 3 
Jason Blais Bill Hatch, Public Information Officer 
 Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Secretary 
 
 DBS Staff Members Absent: 

  Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General 
   
♦ Open Forum 

Proclamation – May 2014 is Building Safety Month in Idaho.  Chairman Bick read the 
Governor’s Proclamation. 
 
Code Amendments – As part of the negotiated rulemaking process, Board Member Hunter 
suggested the Board set dates for submission of any proposed amendments to the codes. 

 
♦ Approval of the April 15, 2014 Agenda 

MOTION:  Jan Welch made a motion to approve the agenda as presented.  Dan Hunter 
seconded. 
 
It was suggested if the Board wants to accept proposed amendments to the codes, the topic 
Solicitation of Proposed Code Changes should be added to the agenda for further discussion. 
 



 

Page 2 of 5 

Board Member Hunter withdrew his second.  Chairman Bick stated the topic would be added 
as item 4.5 under the informational agenda.  Board Member Welch removed her initial 
motion. 
 
MOTION:  Jan Welch made a motion to add the topic Solicitation of Proposed Code 
Changes to the informational agenda as item 4.5 for further discussion.  Mike Tracy 
seconded.  All in favor, motion carried. 
 

♦ Approval of the February 18, 2014 Board Meeting Minutes 
MOTION:  Mike Tracy made a motion to approve the minutes as written.  Scott Buck and 
Dennis Schaffner seconded.  All in favor, motion carried. 
  

♦ Indoor Air Quality/Combustion Air 
Intermountain Gas will host a collaborative meeting to discuss combustion air and air quality 
impacts.  The meeting will be held April 30, 2014, from 1–4 p.m. in the Hospitality Room of 
the Boise Intermountain Gas building.  To receive an invitation, contact Robert Peterson, 
Intermountain Gas; Jerry Peterson, DBS; or Steve Keys, DBS. 
 
A PowerPoint presentation on residential indoor air quality was presented by the HVAC 
Program Manager.  DBS created and played a public service announcement on carbon 
monoxide poisoning. 
 
The HVAC Program Manager will provide the Indoor Air Quality PowerPoint presentation at 
the May 14, 2014 HVAC Board meeting.  Building Code Board members were encouraged 
to attend. 
 

♦ IRC Bed and Breakfast Rule-Correction 
In July 2013, the Board approved the following proposed amendment to the International 
Residential Code (IRC) Section R101.2:  “Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer 
guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International 
Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings.” 
 
When submitted to the 2014 Legislature, the amended language was incorrect; stating three 
or fewer guestrooms.  A proposed amendment to correct the language from three or fewer to 
five or fewer guestrooms was submitted to the Board for review. 
 
The Division will bring to the July 17, 2014 Board meeting a temporary/proposed rule for the 
Board’s vote. 
 
ACTION:  DBS will provide a temporary/proposed rule with regard to IRC Section R101.2, 
owner-occupied lodging house occupancies (bed and breakfasts), at the July 17, 2014 Board 
meeting. 
 
ACTION:  The topic IRC Bed and Breakfast Rule-Correction will be placed on the July 17th 
agenda as an action item. 
 



 

Page 3 of 5 

 
♦ Solicitation of Proposed Code Changes 

At the encouragement of the Board, DBS will publish the Notice of Intent to Promulgate 
Rules in the Administrative Bulletin and notify the 13 entities recognized in statute. 
 
ACTION:  DBS will have the Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules published in the 
Administrative Bulletin and notify the 13 entities recognized in statute. 
 
The Deputy Administrator of Administration offered himself and Leon Duce, Association of 
Idaho Cities (AIC) Representative, to provide the Notice to the Collaborative Group 
 
ACTION:  The Deputy Administrator of Administration and AIC Representative will 
provide the Collaborative Group with the Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules. 

 
DBS staff discussed the following:  1) Negotiated rulemaking process, 2) Procedure in which 
the Idaho Residential and Idaho Energy Codes were created, 3) Method to amend the Codes, 
4) Means to incorporate amendments into the Codes, 5) Publication, cost, and effective date 
of the new code book, and 6) Possible placement of the Code online. 
 
It was suggested the Code Collaborative meet on an annual basis; bringing any code changes 
to the Board for consideration at its fall meeting. 
 
The Administrator offered to provide a sample of the new Idaho Building Code and cost 
estimates at the July 17th Board meeting. 
 
ACTION:  At the July 17th Building Code Board meeting, the Division will provide a 
sample of the new Idaho Building Code and cost to purchase the book. 

 
To assist the Board in understanding the legislative process for the new Idaho Building Code 
and future amendments, Board Member Schaffner requested the Division provide the Board 
with a chart or an outline of the protocol. 

 
ACTION:  DBS will provide the Board with a step-by-step procedure on the legislative 
processes to promulgate temporary/pending rules with regard to the new Idaho Building 
Code and future amendments. 

 
♦ Legislative Update 
 This item was addressed under the topic Solicitation of Proposed Code Changes. 
 
♦ Idaho State Residential and Idaho Energy Codes 
 Update – This item was addressed under the topic Solicitation of Proposed Code Changes. 
 

Rulemaking – This item was addressed under the topic Solicitation of Proposed Code 
Changes. 

 
 



 

Page 4 of 5 

♦ Program Manager Report 
Project DOX – The Division’s Project DOX computer program has been updated and is now 
compatible with Apple computers. 
 
Activity/Applications – There has been an increase in activity and applications within the 
Division’s contract areas of Ketchum, Hailey, and Lincoln County. 
 
2012 IBC – The Division has been using the 2012 International Building Code (IBC) for 
several months and has not seen any “big” negative effects of the new code. 
 

♦ Operational Report 
Revenue – As part of the Building program, DBS acts as the in-plant inspection agency 
(IPIA) and state administrative agency for the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban 
Development (HUD) in relation to manufactured housing. 
 
Since February 2014, the funding DBS has received in the IPIA role, not including funds 
received from HUD, is approximately 19% of the revenue for the Building Code fund.  
Ketchum and Hailey projects amount to over a quarter of the revenue for the fund. 
 

♦ Administrator Report 
Financial Report – The Idaho Building Code fund, FY 2014 financial statement as of 
February 28, 2014, was reviewed. 
 
Legislative Audit – An audit of the Division’s business practices has been completed. 
 
Salmon School District – Salmon Middle School has been condemned due to the roof 
structure.  Administrator Pearce explained the process to refurbish the Salmon elementary 
and high schools to include the middle school.  The estimated project cost is $1.4 million. 
 
Salaries and Wages – The Joint Finance Appropriations Committee has approved a 1% 
increase, on a permanent basis, to all eligible state employees and an additional 1% bonus to 
each unit of state government to use as bonuses on a one-time basis. 
 
Per Capita Production – Information from July 2010 to January 2014, based on quarterly per 
capita production for each full-time DBS employee, was provided. 
 
Permits – As of today, 68% of permits purchased through DBS are done electronically. 
 
School Inspections – Every year, DBS provides physical sight inspections on all schools in 
the state of Idaho.  The Division looks for work hazards related to work safety; however, the 
top priority is to look for any indication of structural problems.  Should problems fall into an 
imminent or serious hazard, the Administrator has specific authority to enforce the districts to 
address the issue(s). 
 



 

Page 5 of 5 

Earthquakes and Public Buildings – Southeastern Idaho is one of the most earthquake prone 
regions of Idaho.  With the recent earthquake in Challis, the question arose whether the 
Division needs to begin to assess public buildings in that region for damages. 
 
The Bureau of Homeland Security (BHS) is the only source of funding specific to earthquake 
evaluations.  DBS has been working closely with BHS and would ultimately like to compile 
information on every school/public building in the state of Idaho, particularly the southern 
half. 
 
A year ago, the Division performed a rapid visual assessment on a targeted number of school 
buildings following the Applied Technology Council (ATC)-20 process which is for seismic 
event survivability and safety of buildings. 
 
It was suggested, and DBS agreed, to send a notice to schools in the areas recently affected 
by the earthquakes; offering to provide visual evaluations. 
 
The Division’s public information officer will create/send a notice to schools in southeastern 
Idaho affected by the recent earthquakes; offering visual evaluations of their structures. 
 

♦ Adjournment 
MOTION:  Dan Hunter made a motion to adjourn the meeting.  Dennis Schaffner seconded.  
All in favor, motion carried. 
 
The meeting adjourned at 11:30 a.m. (MT). 
 
 
 
 

 ___________________________________ ___________________________________ 
ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR 
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 

 
 
 
 

___________________________________ ___________________________________ 
DATE DATE 
 
*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board.  05/29/14rb  



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 03              Minutes 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Approve minutes from the May 15, 2014 Idaho Building Code Board 

meeting. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Draft minutes 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

Page 1 of 2 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
VIDEOCONFERENCE HEARING 

 
Thursday – May 15, 2014 – 9:30 a.m. (MT) 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho 
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho 

 
*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE MAY 15, 2014 HEARING 

 
NOTE: The following report is not a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting, 

 but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions. 
 

Chairman Andrew Bick called the hearing to order at 9:31 a.m. (MT). 
 
Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present: 
Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator 
Dennis Schaffner Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations 

 Michael Arrington Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration 
 Dan Hunter Arlan Smith, Program Manager 

Jason Blais Terry Blessing, Regional Manager, Region 1 
 Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3 
 Aaron Reynolds, Regional Supervisor, Region 1 
 Adam Bowcutt, Regional Supervisor, Region 3 
 Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Secretary 
 

♦ Introductions 
As part of the negotiated rulemaking process for the Idaho Building Code Board two 
hearings must be held 60 days apart.  This is the first of two hearings.  Board members are 
invited but not required to attend this hearing. 

 
♦ Negotiated Rulemaking 

Review Proposed Amendments of the Currently Adopted Building and Energy Codes – 
Board Member Blais presented the following proposed amendments: 
 
• R105.2 Item 2 “Work Exempt From Permit” – The work exempt permit section of the 

2012 International Residential Code (IRC) has changed the fence requirements from six 
(6) feet to seven (7) feet.  The current rule amendment on this section states six (6) feet.  
At present the rule is more restrictive than the model code. 
 
It was recommended the rule amendment be updated to reflect the current code language. 
 

• Table R302.1(1) “Exterior Walls” – The 2012 IRC has created two tables in the code. 
 
The rule amendment would correct the applicable table reference.  It would also update 
the table for openings in walls (unlimited) and for penetrations to be consistent with 
amended minimum fire separation distance requirements for walls and projections. 



 

Page 2 of 2 

 
• R303.4 “Mechanical Ventilation” – During the adoption process of the 2012 IRC, the 

Code Collaborative recommended the Idaho Building Code Board approve the deletion 
of R303.4 from the code.  Since that time, data on the subject has been collected on 
homes across the state. 
 
The amendment would re-establish the scope in the building code to require mechanical 
whole-house ventilation in all new dwelling units.  An exception has been added where 
whole-house mechanical ventilation is not required when it can be shown air changes per 
hour (ACH) are at five (5) to less than seven (7) when a blower door test is conducted. 
 
For clarity, it was recommended the verbiage be changed to “... equal five (5) or greater 
ACH when tested with blower door …”. 

 
♦ Homeowner Energy Code Survey 

Sharon Grant, Eco Edge, will present the results of the 2013 Idaho Homeowners Energy 
Code Survey at the July 17, 2014 Idaho Building Code Board meeting. 
 

♦ 2014 AIC Annual Conference 
As part of the Association of Idaho Cities (AIC) Annual Conference, a Building Officials 
Track will be offered June 18-20, 2014 at the Boise Centre in Boise, Idaho.  To receive the 
membership price, write “Building Officials Track” next to Special Requests on the 
registration form. 
 

♦ Code Collaborative Meeting 
The Collaborative will meet Wednesday, May 28, 2014, at the AIC office in Boise. 
 

♦ Adjournment 
Chairman adjourned the meeting at 9:55 a.m. (MT). 
 
 
 
 

 ___________________________________ ___________________________________ 
ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR 
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 

 
 
 
 

___________________________________ ___________________________________ 
DATE DATE 
 
*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board.  05/21/14rb  



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 04a     IRC Section R105.2 “Work Exempt From Permits” 
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Review proposed amendment to the currently adopted building and energy 

codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: May 2014 – The work exempt permit section of the 2012 International 

Residential Code (IRC) has changed the fence requirements from six (6) 
feet to seven (7) feet.  The current rule amendment on this section states 
six (6) feet.  At present, the rule is more restrictive than the model code. 

 
It was recommended the rule amendment be updated to reflect the current 
code language. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: IRC Section R105.2 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

















IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 04b         IRC Table R302.1(1) “Exterior Walls” 
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Review proposed amendment to the currently adopted building and energy 

codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: May 2014 – The 2012 IRC has created two tables in the code. 

 
The rule amendment would correct the applicable table reference.  It 
would also update the table for openings in walls (unlimited) and for 
penetrations to be consistent with amended minimum fire separation 
distance requirements for walls and projections. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: IRC Table R302.1(1) 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

















IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 04c        IRC Section 303.4 “Mechanical Ventilation” 
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Review proposed amendment to the currently adopted building and energy 

codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: May 2014 – During the adoption process of the 2012 IRC, the Code 

Collaborative recommended the Idaho Building Code Board approve the 
deletion of R303.4 from the code.  Since that time, data on the subject has 
been collected on homes across the state. 

 
The amendment would re-establish the scope in the building code to 
require mechanical whole-house ventilation in all new dwelling units.  An 
exception has been added where whole-house mechanical ventilation is 
not required when it can be shown air changes per hour (ACH) are at five 
(5) to less than seven (7) when a blower door test is conducted. 

 
For clarity, it was recommended the verbiage be changed to “... equal five 
(5) or greater ACH when tested with blower door …”. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: IRC Section 303.4 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 

 













IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 05a     IRC Section R105.2 “Work Exempt From Permits” 
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Vote on proposed amendment to the currently adopted building and 

energy codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Accept or reject proposed amendment. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: May 2014 – The work exempt permit section of the 2012 International 

Residential Code (IRC) has changed the fence requirements from six (6) 
feet to seven (7) feet.  The current rule amendment on this section states 
six (6) feet.  At present, the rule is more restrictive than the model code. 

 
It was recommended the rule amendment be updated to reflect the current 
code language. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: See agenda item 04a for supporting documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 05b         IRC Table R302.1(1) “Exterior Walls” 
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Vote on proposed amendment to the currently adopted building and 

energy codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Accept or reject proposed amendment. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: May 2014 – The 2012 IRC has created two tables in the code. 

 
The rule amendment would correct the applicable table reference.  It 
would also update the table for openings in walls (unlimited) and for 
penetrations to be consistent with amended minimum fire separation 
distance requirements for walls and projections. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: See agenda item 04b for supporting documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 05c        IRC Section 303.4 “Mechanical Ventilation” 
 
PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Vote on proposed amendment to the currently adopted building and 

energy codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Accept or reject proposed amendment. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: May 2014 – During the adoption process of the 2012 IRC, the Code 

Collaborative recommended the Idaho Building Code Board approve the 
deletion of R303.4 from the code.  Since that time, data on the subject has 
been collected on homes across the state. 

 
The amendment would re-establish the scope in the building code to 
require mechanical whole-house ventilation in all new dwelling units.  An 
exception has been added where whole-house mechanical ventilation is 
not required when it can be shown air changes per hour (ACH) are at five 
(5) to less than seven (7) when a blower door test is conducted. 

 
For clarity, it was recommended the verbiage be changed to “... equal five 
(5) or greater ACH when tested with blower door …”. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: See agenda item 04c for supporting documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 06      IRC Bed and Breakfast Rule-Correction 
 
PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Vote on the proposed amendment to correct language in IRC Section 

R101.2 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Accept or reject the temporary/proposed rule. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: July 2013 – The Board approved the following proposed amendment to 

the International Residential Code (IRC) Section R101.2: “Owner-
occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted 
to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for 
One- and Two-family Dwellings.” 

 
April 2014 – When submitted to the 2014 Legislature, the amended 
language was incorrect; stating three or fewer guestrooms.  A proposed 
amendment to correct the language from three or fewer to five or fewer 
guestrooms was submitted to the Board for review. 

 
The Division will bring to the July 17, 2014 Board meeting a 
temporary/proposed rule for the Board’s vote. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL Another version of the amendment language for IRC Section R101.2 was 
HISTORY: approved by the Board. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: IRC Section R101.2 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 

 



 

 

 f. Delete footnote (g) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing 
Fixtures and replace with the following: For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies 
with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required. (3-20-14) 
 
 02. International Residential Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments: (3-20-14) 
 
 a. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (3-20-14) 
 
 b. Delete exception No. 2 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope, and replace with the following: 
Owner-occupied lodging houses with three (3)five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in 
accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings. Such occupancies shall be 
required to install smoke alarms and carbon monoxide alarms in accordance with sections R314 and R315 respectively 
of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings. (3-20-14) 
 
 c. Delete item No. 2 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work exempt 
from permit, and replace with the following: Fences not over six (6) feet (one thousand, eight hundred twenty-nine 
(1,829) mm) high may be exempted from the requirement for a building permit in the absence of any other applicable 
land use regulations governing the installation, height, type or other aspect. (4-7-11) 
 
 d. Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work exempt 
from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four (4) feet (one 
thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. (4-7-11) 
 
 e. Add the following item No. 11 at the end of the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - 
Work exempt from permit: Flag poles. (3-20-14) 
 
 f. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For 
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor, 
including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of the 
lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. (3-29-10) 
 
 g. IRC Table R302.1 Exterior Walls -- delete the figures contained in the last column of the table under 
the heading Minimum Fire Separation Distance for the “Walls” and “Projections” elements, and replace with the 
following: 

Minimum Fire Separation Distance 

Walls (fire-resistance rated): < Three (3) Feet 

Walls (not fire-resistance rated): ≥ Three (3) Feet 

Projections (fire-resistance rated): < Three (3) Feet 

Projections (not fire-resistance rated): ≥ Three (3) Feet 

 
   (3-20-14) 
 
 h. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2 -- Townhouses, and replace with the 
following: Exception: A common one-hour or two-hour fire resistance rated wall assembly tested in accordance with 
ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, 
ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides and shall 
extend to and be tight against the exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical 
outlet boxes shall be in accordance with section R302.4. (3-29-10) 
 
 i. Delete IRC section R303.4. (3-20-14) 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 07     2013 Idaho Homeowners Energy Code Survey 
 
PRESENTER: Sharon Grant, Eco Edge 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide the results of the 2013 Idaho Homeowners Energy Code Survey. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Survey 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

















































IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 08            Idaho Building Code 
 
PRESENTER: Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide cost estimates and sample of the new Idaho Building Code 

(residential and energy) 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: April 2014 – As part of the negotiated rulemaking process, Board Member 

Hunter suggested the Board set dates for submission of any proposed 
amendments to the codes. 

 
The Administrator offered to provide a sample of the new Idaho Building 
Code and cost estimates at the July 17th Board meeting. 

 
To assist the Board in understanding the legislative process for the new 
Idaho Building Code and future amendments, Board Member Schaffner 
requested the Division provide the Board with a chart or an outline of the 
protocol. 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Promulgation: Step-By-Step Procedures; Negotiated Rulemaking; and An 

Overview of the Process and Submittal Deadlines 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 

 

















IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 09           Program Manager Report 
 
PRESENTER: Arlan Smith, Building Safety Program Manager 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Update the Board on the Building program’s current activities. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 10             Operational Report 
 
PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide update on the daily operations of the Building program and 

division. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 11a        Financial Report 
 
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator and Kathleen Watkins, Financial Manager 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Review the Idaho Building Code Board’s financial report 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Financial report 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Class Budget
Fiscal Year To 

Date
YTD as a % of 

Budget 
Remaining 

Budget 

Projected for 
Remainder of 

Year
Projected Year 

End Totals

Projected 
Total as a % 

of Budget
Revenues: 759,000         542,367         71.5% 216,633          133,473         675,840         89.0%

Expenditures
Personnel: 526,000         468,122         89.0% 57,878            39,010           507,132         96.4%
Operating: 139,000         137,843         99.2% 1,157              30,909           168,752         121.4%
Capital: 30,000           12,897           43.0% 17,103            27,433           40,330           134.4%

Total Expenditures 695,000         618,863         89.0% 76,137            97,351           716,214         103.1%

Net for FY 2014 64,000           (76,496)          36,121           (40,374)          

July 1, 2013 
Beginning Cash 

Available

Fiscal Year to 
Date 

Revenues

Other 
Changes in 

Cash

Available Cash 
as of May 31, 

2014

Projected Year 
End Available 

Cash
1,005,440 542,367         (618,863)        (6,721)            922,223 36,121           958,344         

Fiscal Year to Date   
Expenditures and 
Encumbrances

Projected Change in Cash for 
Remainder of Year

Division of Building Safety

Fiscal Year 2014 Financial Statements
As of 5/31/2014

Statement of Revenues and Expenditures

Statement of Cash Balance

IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02



$0

$250,000

$500,000

$750,000

$1,000,000

$1,250,000

$1,500,000

$1,750,000

$2,000,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Fiscal Year 2011
Fiscal Year 2012
Fiscal Year 2013
Fiscal Year 2014

FY 11 - 14 Month-End Available Cash 

$0

$20,000

$40,000

$60,000

$80,000

$100,000

$120,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Revenues

Expenditures

FY 14 Revenues vs Expenditures  

IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02 

  



$0

$20,000

$40,000

$60,000

$80,000

$100,000

$120,000

$140,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Fiscal Year 2011
Fiscal Year 2012
Fiscal Year 2013
Fiscal Year 2014

FY 11-14 Expenditures  

IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02 

$0

$20,000

$40,000

$60,000

$80,000

$100,000

$120,000

$140,000

$160,000

$180,000

$200,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Fiscal Year 2011
Fiscal Year 2012
Fiscal Year 2013
Fiscal Year 2014

FY 11-14 Revenues 

  



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 11b         Administrator Report 
 
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide the Board with an overview of the Division’s current activities. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 


	Agenda_Item01.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	bc_agenda07172014.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Thursday, July 17, 2014
	9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MT)

	Agenda_Item02.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	bc_draftmin04152014.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday – April 15, 2014 – 9:30 a.m. (MT)
	Division of Building Safety
	Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:30 a.m. (MT).
	Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:
	Scott Buck Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration
	Travis Beck Adam Warr, Deputy Attorney General
	Jan Welch, P.E. Kathleen Watkins, Financial Manager
	DBS Staff Members Absent:
	Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General

	Agenda_Item03.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	bc_draftmin05152014.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE HEARING
	Thursday – May 15, 2014 – 9:30 a.m. (MT)
	Division of Building Safety
	Chairman Andrew Bick called the hearing to order at 9:31 a.m. (MT).
	Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:
	Michael Arrington Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration
	Dan Hunter Arlan Smith, Program Manager

	Agenda_Item04a.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative

	Agenda_Item04b.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative

	Agenda_Item04c.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative

	Agenda_Item05a.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative

	Agenda_Item05b.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative

	Agenda_Item05c.pdf
	PRESENTER: Jason Blais, Code Collaborative Representative

	Agenda_Item06.pdf
	PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations

	Agenda_Item07.pdf
	PRESENTER: Sharon Grant, Eco Edge

	Agenda_Item08.pdf
	PRESENTER: Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration

	Agenda_Item09.pdf
	PRESENTER: Arlan Smith, Building Safety Program Manager

	Agenda_Item10.pdf
	PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations

	0229-2_FY2014-May2014_BLDG_Pg1.pdf
	1

	0229-2_FY2014-May2014_BLDG_Pg2.pdf
	1BG

	0229-2_FY2014-May2014_BLDG_Pg3.pdf
	1BG2

	Agenda_Item11b.pdf
	PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator


