
DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 
 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
APRIL 10, 2012 

 
 
 
 
 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 01                        Agenda 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Approve the agenda for the April 10, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board 

meeting.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: April 10, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board tentative agenda    
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



TENTATIVE AGENDA  
 
 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING/MEETING 
 
 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho 

2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho  
dbs.idaho.gov – (208) 332-7137 

 
Tuesday, April 10, 2012 

9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MT) 
 

(Note:  Meeting Time is 8:30 a.m. PT) 
  

9:30 a.m. CALL TO ORDER – Andrew Bick, Chairman 
o Roll Call & Introductions 

o Open Forum 
 

  CONSENT AGENDA 
1. Approval of the April 10, 2012 Agenda 
 
2. Approval of  the February 14, 2012 Board Meeting Minutes  

 
PUBLIC HEARING 
3. Public Testimony – 2009 Code Amendments 
 
4. Proposed Code Change--IBC Section 903.2.7 – Andrew Bick  

 
INFORMATIONAL AGENDA 
5. Negotiated Rulemaking Process – Patrick Grace 
 
6. 2012 Codes – Steve Keys, Jerry Peterson, Arlan Smith and Lisa Stover 
 
7. Deputy Administrator Report – Steve Keys  

 
8. Administrator Report  

a. Financial Report – C. Kelly Pearce and Dave Decker 

b. Administrator – C. Kelly Pearce  
 

NEW BUSINESS 
 
  EXECUTIVE SESSION (If required) 
 
12:30 p.m. ADJOURN 
 
All times, other than beginning, are approximate and are scheduled according to Mountain Time (MT), unless otherwise 
noted.   Agenda items may shift depending on Board preference.  03/20/12r 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 02                       Minutes 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Approve the minutes from the February 14, 2012 Idaho Building Code 

Board meeting.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS: Draft minutes from the February 14, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board 

meeting  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

Page 1 of 3 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD  
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING 

 
Tuesday – February 14, 2012 – 9:30 a.m. (MT) 

 
Division of Building Safety 

1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho 
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho 

2055 Garrett Way, Building 2, Suite 7, Pocatello, Idaho  
 

*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE FEBRUARY 14, 2012 MEETING 
 

NOTE: The following report is not intended to be a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting, 
 but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions.  

 
Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:32 a.m. (MT).  
 
Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present: 
Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator 
Carol Alexander, Vice-Chairman Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator, Operations 

 Chuck Bleth  Janice Foster, Deputy Administrator, Administration 
 Scott Buck Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General 

Michael Arrington Rod Freligh, Regional Manager, Region 1 
Dan Hunter Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3 
 Dave Decker, Financial Specialist 
Board Members Absent: Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Secretary  

 Bobby Ball 
 Dennis Schaffner 
 Jan Welch 
 Mike Tracy 
 
♦ Open Forum 

No items or concerns were brought forth. 
 

♦ Approval of the February 14, 2012 Agenda 
MOTION:  Scott Buck made a motion to approve the agenda as presented.  Michael Arrington 
seconded.  All in favor, motion carried. 
 

♦ Approval of the October 11, 2011 Board Meeting Minutes 
MOTION:  Carol Alexander made a motion to approve the minutes as written.  Scott Buck 
seconded.  All in favor, motion carried. 

 
♦ Energy Code Presentation 

In September 2011, the Office of Energy Resources transferred the majority of their residential 
energy programs to DBS.  Jerry Peterson, HVAC and Residential Energy Program Manager, 
introduced himself and the types of training the Division has and will continue to provide to the 
HVAC industry.    
 



 

Page 2 of 3 

Eight area high schools were awarded energy equipment through a grant under the “Go Green" 
program.  Mr. Peterson has been asked to help develop curriculum; incorporating energy codes 
and energy efficiency into the school’s residential construction programs. 

 
♦ Proposed Code Change – IBC Section 903.2.7 

Andrew Bick reiterated the background on the proposed change to the International Building 
Code (IBC) section 903.2.7.   
 
At the 2012 legislature session, State Fire Marshal Mark Larson submitted a pending rule that 
would amend the section of the 2009 International Fire Code (IFC) with the verbiage reflected 
in the proposed change to IBC section 903.2.7 and the 2012 IFC.  The rule passed the House 
Business Subcommittee, Senate Commerce and Human Resources Committee, and House 
Business Committee and will become effective upon sine die of the session. 
 
For cohesiveness between the IFC and IBC, the Board was asked to proceed with the change in 
the IBC as a temporary rule.   
 
MOTION:  Carol Alexander made a motion that as of today, February 14, 2012, the Board’s 
intention is to move forward with a temporary rule on the code change to IBC Section 903.2.7 at 
the April 10, 2012 meeting.  Scott Buck seconded.  All in favor, motion carried.  
 

♦ Deputy Administrator Report 
State Building Inspections – DBS has assumed responsibility for performing building 
inspections on state projects.  The building program staff was introduced. 
 
DBS Building Program – Overall, the Division’s building program continues to be challenged 
by lack of work and low revenue. 

 
Proposed Legislation and Rules – HB 407 changes the organizational structure of the Division 
from pre-existing bureau chief to regional manager format.  The bill is being considered by the 
House Business Committee. 
 
The majority of the Division’s rules have moved forward.  However, anything that pertains to 
the adoption of new codes or additional fees is difficult to get approved by the legislature.    
 

♦ Administrator Report 
Administrative Staff – As of January 23, 2012, DBS Financial Manager Kirk Weiskircher has 
accepted a position with the Idaho Department of Administration as Chief Financial Officer.  
 
Financial Report – Dave Decker reviewed the Idaho Building Code fund FY 2012 financial 
statements as of December 31, 2011. 
 
Budget – Included in the budget is a reduction of ten additional authorized full-time personnel.  
If approved by the 2012 legislature, the Division’s authorized strength will be reduced to 131 
employees. 
 



 

Page 3 of 3 

Personnel – In 2007, the Division was authorized 152 full-time positions.  As of today, there are 
101 employees working for DBS. 
 
Wind Farms – The assembly of wind farms across the state of Idaho has become a source of 
revenue for DBS, specifically the electrical program. 
 
Boise State University (BSU) Projects – The proposed expansion of BSU’s football stadium will 
consist of:  1) new football training facility and locker rooms at north end, 2) current end zone 
bleachers to be moved to new track facility (currently under construction), 3) temporary 
bleachers placed at end zones, and eventually, 4) new permanent seating at end zones and in 
area currently occupied by the track.    
 
Tribe Contracts – DBS has contracts with the Coeur d’Alene, Nez Perce, and Shoshone-
Bannock Tribes to provide plan review and building, electrical, HVAC, and plumbing 
inspections.  The following projects are under construction:  Coeur d’Alene – medical and 
transportation facilities, Nez Perce – expansion of casino, and Shoshone/Bannock – casino/hotel 
complex with recreational facility to include aquatic center. 
 

♦ New Business 
There was no new business to discuss. 
 

♦ Executive Session 
An executive session was not required. 
 
MOTION:  Chuck Bleth made a motion to adjourn the meeting.  Scott Buck seconded.  All in 
favor, motion carried.  The meeting adjourned at 10:30 a.m. (MT).

 
 
 
 
 _____________________________________ ___________________________________ 

ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR 
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY 

 
 
 
 

_____________________________________ ___________________________________ 
DATE DATE 
 
*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board  03/05/12rb 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 03        Public Testimony – 2009 Code Amendments 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: To seek information and comments from the Board and industry with 

regard to any amendments to the 2009 codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS: 2009 IRC-R315.2 & 2009 IBC-Table 2902.1 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 













































IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 04         Proposed Code Change-IBC Section 903.2.7 
 
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: To modify section 903.2.7 of the 2009 IBC to define the requirements to 

install automatic sprinkler system in buildings with Group M occupancy.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: Section 903.2.7 clause 4 of the International Building Code (IBC) requires 
an automatic sprinkler system be provided throughout buildings containing a Group M 
occupancy when used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture.  

 
For flexibility within the clause, Andrew Bick presented a proposal that would require an 
automatic sprinkler system be installed where occupancy is greater than 5000 square feet.  

 
At the 2012 legislature session, State Fire Marshal Mark Larson submitted a pending rule that 
would amend the section of the 2009 International Fire Code (IFC) with the verbiage reflected in 
the proposed change to IBC section 903.2.7 and the 2012 IFC.  The rule passed the House 
Business Subcommittee, Senate Commerce and Human Resources Committee, and House 
Business Committee and will become effective upon sine die of the session. 
 
For cohesiveness between the IFC and IBC, at the January 2012 Idaho Building Code Board 
meeting the Board was asked to proceed with the change in the IBC as a temporary rule.   
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS:  Proposed Amendment to IBC section 903.2.7 clause 4 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 





903.2.7 Group M.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings containing a 
Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

  1.  A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2). 

  2.  A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.  

3.  The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines exceeds     
24,000 square feet (2230 m2). 

4.  A Group M occupancy is used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses 
and exceeds 5000 square feet (464 m2) in area. 

 

 
004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE. 
Under the provisions of Section 39‐4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted 
and incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. The 
effective date of a 2009 edition of any of the codes adopted in this Section with any amendments identified 
thereto shall be January 1, 2011. Until such time, the 2006 edition of any such code enumerated in this Section 
without amendment will remain effective pursuant to Section 39‐4109, Idaho Code. Copies of these documents 
may be reviewed at the office of the Division of Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from 
International Code Council, 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601‐2298 or the International Code 
Council at http:/ /www.iccsafe.org.               (3‐29‐10)  

01.   International Building Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments.   (3‐29‐10) 

a.  Delete subparagraph 4 of Section 903.2.7 ‐ Group M, and replace with the following: A Group M 
occupancy is used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses and exceeds 5000 square feet 
(464 m2) in area.                    (_‐__‐13) 

02.   International Residential Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments.  (3‐29‐10)  

a.   Delete the exception contained under IRC section R101.2 ‐ Scope.     (4‐7‐11)  

b.   Delete item No. 2 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 ‐ Work 
exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Fences not over six (6) feet (one thousand, eight hundred 
twenty‐nine (1,829) mm) high may be exempted from the requirement for a building permit in the absence of any 
other applicable land use regulations governing the installation, height, type or other aspect.   (4‐7‐11)  

c.   Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 ‐ Work 
exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four 
(4) feet (one thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep.         (4‐7‐11)  

d.   Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For 
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor, 



including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of 
the lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322.         (3‐29‐10)  

e.   IRC Table R302.1 Exterior Walls ‐‐ delete the figures contained in the last column of the table 
under the heading Minimum Fire Separation Distance, and replace with the following: 

Minimum Fire Separation Distance 

Walls (Fire-resistance rated):                   <     Three (3) Feet 

Walls (Not fire-resistance rated):             ≥     Three (3) Feet 

Projections (Fire-resistance rated):          <     Three (3) Feet 

Projections (Not fire-resistance rated):     ≥    Three (3) Feet 

 

f.   Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2 ‐‐ Townhouses, and replace with the 
following: Exception: A common one‐hour or two‐hour fire resistance rated wall assembly tested in accordance 
with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical 
equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both 
sides and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. 
Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with section R302.4.     (3‐29‐10)  

g.   Delete the exception contained under IRC section R313.1 ‐‐ Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler 
systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be 
required in townhouses where a two‐hour fire‐resistance rated wall is installed between dwelling units or when 
additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler 
system installed.                    (3‐29‐10)  

h.   Delete IRC section R313.2. (3‐29‐10) i. Delete IRC section R322.1.10. (3‐29‐10) j. Delete IRC 
section R322.2.2 paragraph 2.2, and replace with the following: The total net area of all openings shall be at least 
one (1) square inch (645 mm2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed area, or the opening shall be designed 
and the construction documents shall include a statement that the design and installation of the openings will 
provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing the automatic entry and exit of 
floodwaters.                     (3‐29‐10)  

03.   International Existing Building Code. 2009 Edition.         (3‐29‐10)    

04.   International Energy Conservation Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments. 

(4‐7‐11)  

a.   Add the following footnote to the title of Table 402.1.1 ‐ Insulation and Fenestration 
Requirements by Component: k. For residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see 
section 402.6.                     (4‐7‐11)  

b.   Add the following section: 402.6 Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope. Residential log home 
construction shall comply with sections 401 (General), 402.4 (Air Leakage), 402.5 (Maximum Fenestration U‐Factor 
and SHGC), 403.1 (Controls), 403.2.2 (Sealing), 403.2.3 (Building Cavities), sections 403.3 through 403.9 (referred 



to as the mandatory provisions), Section 404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either Subparagraph 
004.04.b.i., ii., or iii. as follows:                 (4‐7‐11)  

i.   Sections 402.2 through 402.3, 403.2.1, 404.1 and Table 402.6;     (4‐7‐11)  

ii.   Section 405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or     (4‐7‐11)  

iii.   REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program).     (4‐7‐11)  

c.   Add Table 402.6 Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements By Component to be 
used only in accordance with Subparagraph 004.04.b.i above to appear as follow: 

TABLE 402.6 
                          LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT 

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm. 

a.   The fenestration U‐factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration. 

b.    R‐5 shall be added to the required slab edge R‐values for heated slabs. 

c.   90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance heating 
equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is considered compliant with the high 
efficiency equipment path). 

d.               “15/19” means R‐15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R‐19 cavity insulation at the interior of 
the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R‐13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R‐5 continuous 
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R‐10 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the 
home or R‐13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.  

CLIMATE 
ZONE 

FENESTRATION 
U-FACTOR a

SKYLIGHT  
U-FACTOR 

GLAZED 
FENESTRATION

SHGC 
CEILING
R-VALUE 

Min. 
Average

LOG Size 
in  inches

FLOOR
R-VALUE

BASEMENT  
WALL 

R-VALUE d

SLAB R-
VALUE 

& DEPTH b

CRAWL 
SPACE 

WALL R-
VALUE     d

5, 6 - High 
efficiency 
equipment 

path c

0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30      15/19 10, 4 ft 10/13 

5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30      10/13 10, 2 ft 10/13 

6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30      15/19 10, 4 ft 10/13 

 

  05.  References to Other Codes. Where any provisions of the codes that are adopted in this section 
make reference to other construction and safety‐related model codes or standards which have not been adopted 
by the involved authority having jurisdiction, to the extent possible, such reference should be construed as 
pertaining to the equivalent code or standard that has been duly adopted by such jurisdiction.   (4‐7‐10) 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 05           Negotiated Rulemaking Process 
 
PRESENTER: Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: To inform the Board on the negotiated rulemaking process with regard to 

possible proposed amendments to the 2009 Building and Energy Codes. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND:  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 06         2012 Codes 
 
PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations; Jerry Peterson, HVAC 

Program Manager; Arlan Smith, Building Safety Program Manager; and 
Lisa Stover, Plans Examiner 

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Discussion and review of the 2012 IBC, IRC, IEBC, and IECC.   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Consent 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: Contingent on receiving proposals advocating the adoption of the 2012 

IBC, IRC, IECC, and IEBC, agency staff is prepared to give short 
presentations relating to the changes incorporated into the new editions of 
the codes.  We have also made arrangements to procure for board 
members copies of publications outlining significant changes to the codes, 
and to assure that board members have on-line access to the whole of the 
codes.  Through the cooperation of ICC, we also have reference copies of 
the code available in the room today.     

______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 07              Deputy Administrator Report 
 
PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Report on the recent activities within the Building program.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings.   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 08a                  Financial Report 
 
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator and Dave Decker, Financial Specialist 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Review the Idaho Building Code Board Financial Report.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational   
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
ATTACHMENTS: Idaho Building Code Board Financial Report 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Class Budget
Fiscal Year To 

Date
YTD as a % of 

Budget *
Remaining 

Budet 

Projected for 
Remainder of 

Year
Projected Year 

End Totals

Projected Total 
as a % of 

Budget
Revenues: 500,000          322,489          64.5% 177,511          177,500          499,989          100.0%

Expenditures
Personnel: 510,000          361,186          70.8% 148,814          177,360          538,546          105.6%
Operating: 135,000          131,442          97.4% 3,558              48,000            179,442          132.9%
Capital: 24,000            981                 4.1% 23,019            22,000            22,981            95.8%

Total Expenditures 669,000          493,609          73.8% 175,391          247,360          740,969          110.8%

Net for FY 2012 (169,000)        (171,120)        (69,860)          (240,980)        

Beginning Cash 
Available Revenues

Other 
Changes in 

Cash Available Cash

Projected Year 
End Available 

Cash
1,183,267 322,489 (493,609)        (88,853)          923,294 (69,860)          853,434          

Division of Building Safety
IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02

Fiscal Year 2012 Financial Statements
As of 2/29/2012

Statement of Revenues and Expenditures

Statement of Cash Balance

Expenditures
Projected Change in Cash for 

Remainder of Year



Date Prepared: 3/27/2012

$0
$200,000
$400,000
$600,000
$800,000

$1,000,000
$1,200,000
$1,400,000
$1,600,000
$1,800,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Fiscal Year 2009
Fiscal Year 2010
Fiscal Year 2011
Fiscal Year 2012

FY 09 - 12 Month-End Available Cash

$0

$20,000

$40,000

$60,000

$80,000

$100,000

$120,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MA APR MAY JUN

Revenue
Expenditure

FY 12 Revenues vs Expenditures 

$0
$20,000
$40,000
$60,000
$80,000

$100,000
$120,000
$140,000
$160,000
$180,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Fiscal Year 2009
Fiscal Year 2010
Fiscal Year 2011
Fiscal Year 2012

FY 09-12 Expenditures 

IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND

$0
$20,000
$40,000
$60,000
$80,000

$100,000
$120,000
$140,000
$160,000
$180,000

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

Fiscal Year 2009
Fiscal Year 2010
Fiscal Year 2011
Fiscal Year 2012

FY 09-12 Revenues

As of February 29, 2012FUND 2292



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
 
 

Agenda Item No. 08b             Administrator 
 
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
OBJECTIVE: Provide an overview of the Division’s current activities.  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ACTION: Informational  
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code 

Board Meetings. 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
PROCEDURAL 
HISTORY: 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
ATTACHMENTS: No documentation 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 


	bc_agenda04102012.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday, April 10, 2012
	9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MT)




