DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

APRIL 10, 2012



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 01 Agenda

PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

OBJECTIVE: Approve the agenda for the April 10, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL

HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: April 10, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board tentative agenda




TENTATIVE AGENDA

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING/MEETING

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho
dbs.idaho.gov — (208) 332-7137

Tuesday, April 10, 2012
9:30 a.m.-12:30 p.m. (MT)

(Note: Meeting Time is 8:30 a.m. PT)

9:30 a.m. CALL TO ORDER - Andrew Bick, Chairman
o Roll Call & Introductions

0 Open Forum

CONSENT AGENDA
1. Approval of the April 10, 2012 Agenda

2. Approval of the February 14, 2012 Board Meeting Minutes

PUBLIC HEARING
3. Public Testimony — 2009 Code Amendments

4. Proposed Code Change--IBC Section 903.2.7 — Andrew Bick

INFORMATIONAL AGENDA
5. Negotiated Rulemaking Process — Patrick Grace

6. 2012 Codes — Steve Keys, Jerry Peterson, Arlan Smith and Lisa Stover

7. Deputy Administrator Report — Steve Keys

8. Administrator Report
a. Financial Report — C. Kelly Pearce and Dave Decker

b. Administrator — C. Kelly Pearce
NEW BUSINESS
EXECUTIVE SESSION (If required)
12:30 p.m.  ADJOURN

All times, other than beginning, are approximate and are scheduled according to Mountain Time (MT), unless otherwise
noted. Agenda items may shift depending on Board preference. 03/20/12r



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 02 Minutes
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: Approve the minutes from the February 14, 2012 Idaho Building Code

Board meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: Draft minutes from the February 14, 2012 ldaho Building Code Board
meeting




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Tuesday — February 14, 2012 — 9:30 a.m. (MT)

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho
2055 Garrett Way, Building 2, Suite 7, Pocatello, Idaho

*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE FEBRUARY 14, 2012 MEETING

NOTE: The following report is not intended to be a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting,
but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions.

Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to orderat 9:32 a.m. (MT).

Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:
Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator
Carol Alexander, Vice-Chairman  Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator, Operations
Chuck Bleth Janice Foster, Deputy Administrator, Administration
Scott Buck Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General
Michael Arrington Rod Freligh, Regional Manager, Region 1
Dan Hunter Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3
Dave Decker, Financial Specialist
Board Members Absent: Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Secretary
Bobby Ball
Dennis Schaffner
Jan Welch
Mike Tracy
Open Forum

No items or concerns were brought forth.

Approval of the February 14, 2012 Agenda
MOTION: Scott Buck made a motion to approve the agenda as presented. Michael Arrington
seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

Approval of the October 11, 2011 Board Meeting Minutes
MOTION: Carol Alexander made a motion to approve the minutes as written. Scott Buck
seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

Energy Code Presentation

In September 2011, the Office of Energy Resources transferred the majority of their residential
energy programs to DBS. Jerry Peterson, HVAC and Residential Energy Program Manager,
introduced himself and the types of training the Division has and will continue to provide to the
HVAC industry.

Page 1 of 3



Eight area high schools were awarded energy equipment through a grant under the “Go Green™
program. Mr. Peterson has been asked to help develop curriculum; incorporating energy codes
and energy efficiency into the school’s residential construction programs.

Proposed Code Change — IBC Section 903.2.7
Andrew Bick reiterated the background on the proposed change to the International Building
Code (IBC) section 903.2.7.

At the 2012 legislature session, State Fire Marshal Mark Larson submitted a pending rule that
would amend the section of the 2009 International Fire Code (IFC) with the verbiage reflected
in the proposed change to IBC section 903.2.7 and the 2012 IFC. The rule passed the House
Business Subcommittee, Senate Commerce and Human Resources Committee, and House
Business Committee and will become effective upon sine die of the session.

For cohesiveness between the IFC and IBC, the Board was asked to proceed with the change in
the IBC as a temporary rule.

MOTION: Carol Alexander made a motion that as of today, February 14, 2012, the Board’s
intention is to move forward with a temporary rule on the code change to IBC Section 903.2.7 at
the April 10, 2012 meeting. Scott Buck seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

Deputy Administrator Report
State Building Inspections — DBS has assumed responsibility for performing building
inspections on state projects. The building program staff was introduced.

DBS Building Program — Overall, the Division’s building program continues to be challenged
by lack of work and low revenue.

Proposed Legislation and Rules = HB 407 changes the organizational structure of the Division
from pre-existing bureau chief to regional manager format. The bill is being considered by the
House Business Committee.

The majority of the Division’s rules have moved forward. However, anything that pertains to
the adoption of new codes or additional fees is difficult to get approved by the legislature.

Administrator Report
Administrative Staff — As of January 23, 2012, DBS Financial Manager Kirk Weiskircher has
accepted a position with the Idaho Department of Administration as Chief Financial Officer.

Financial Report — Dave Decker reviewed the ldaho Building Code fund FY 2012 financial
statements as of December 31, 2011.

Budget — Included in the budget is a reduction of ten additional authorized full-time personnel.
If approved by the 2012 legislature, the Division’s authorized strength will be reduced to 131
employees.

Page 2 of 3



Personnel — In 2007, the Division was authorized 152 full-time positions. As of today, there are
101 employees working for DBS.

Wind Farms — The assembly of wind farms across the state of Idaho has become a source of
revenue for DBS, specifically the electrical program.

Boise State University (BSU) Projects — The proposed expansion of BSU’s football stadium will
consist of: 1) new football training facility and locker rooms at north end, 2) current end zone
bleachers to be moved to new track facility (currently under construction), 3) temporary
bleachers placed at end zones, and eventually, 4) new permanent seating at end zones and in
area currently occupied by the track.

Tribe Contracts — DBS has contracts with the Coeur d’Alene, Nez Perce, and Shoshone-
Bannock Tribes to provide plan review and building, electrical, HVAC, and plumbing
inspections. The following projects are under construction: Coeur d’Alene — medical and
transportation facilities, Nez Perce — expansion of casino, and Shoshone/Bannock — casino/hotel
complex with recreational facility to include aquatic center.

New Business
There was no new business to discuss:

Executive Session
An executive session was not required.

MOTION: Chuck Bleth-made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Scott Buck seconded. All in
favor, motion carried. The meeting adjourned at 10:30 a.m. (MT).

ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
DATE DATE

*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board 03/05/12rb

Page 3 of 3



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 03 Public Testimony — 2009 Code Amendments
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: To seek information and comments from the Board and industry with

regard to any amendments to the 2009 codes.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: 2009 IRC-R315.2 & 2009 IBC-Table 2902.1
















(ExuzsxT )
dtate ol UUa\slAiij\'OM Awmendment

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 10-03-098, filed 1/20/10;
effective 7/1/10)

WAC 51-51-0315 Section R315--Carbon monoxide alarms.

R315.1 Carbon Monoxide Alarms. For new construction, an approved
carbon monoxide alarm shall be installed ((by denuary—I7—26+%7))
outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of
the bedrooms in dwelling units’ (= ot —wirere—a terancy

- . Al - " 1 s i | - o L . Pl v At J 1 ]
Caloloy i cengllc Slirar L i LlIICardr UIRE UV aldllill oo DLJUL.LJ._J..CLA Wy Ll

mearrafacturer .J'_u\..luuu.und J.!:'ylai...v.:uu::ut of—tie—latter _;.t:.'::a)) and on each
level of the dwelling and in accordance with the manufacturer's
recommendations.

R315.2 Existing Dwellings. Existing dwellings shall be equipped
with carbon monoxide alarms ((by Jduty—3+—26%%t)) when alterations,
repairs or additions requiring a permit occur, or when one or more
sleeping rooms are added or created.

EXCEPTIONS: ((Ewner-oceupicd-detrched-ome-famity-dwelingstcpatiy-oceupred priortoFuty+-2648:)) 1. Work involving the exterior

surfaces of dwellings, such as the replacement of roofing or siding. or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the
addition of a porch or deck, or electrical permits, are exempt from the requirements of this section.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of noncombustion plumbing or mechanical systems are exempt from the requirements

this section.

R315.3 Alarm Requirements. Single station carbon monoxide alarms
shall be listed as complying with UL 2034 and shall be installed in
accordance with this code and the manufacturer's installation
instructions.

[ & ] QTE=3808 .2









Carbon Monoxide Detectors | Building | Community Planning & Sustainable Developmen... Page 1 of 2

bovg\o\; Couvd-y’ (olurado (EXHIGETC

QO = P wi v L ey

Douglas County AsZ Berviens | Governmient | Busitioss | Laud Use Residents | Trufispurency | Newsroon
Douglas County | Building | Carbon Monoxide Detectors Search
‘Help With: Carbon Monoxide Detectors

Apply Tor Building Permits For ail open building parmits that are completed on or after July 1, 2008, Douglas County will be enfercing fne iy

Building Applications "L ofgren and Johnson Families Carbon Monoxide Safety Act” (C.R §. 38-45). This is Colorado State Law i {

Building Design Infor involving the instaliation of carbon menoxide detectors. ot

Building FAQS -"" ==

In regarcs to the enforcement of Building Cades, this Law addresses both Single and Multi Family Dwelings X A
for New Construction, Interior Alterations, Permitted repairs, Fuel-Fired Appliance replacement. and Additions
of one or more rooms.

Building Inspections

Building Permit Fees / Worksheets
Contractor Registration

DESC

Driveway Permits

The Law states, in part, “that approved carbon monaxide detectors need to be located within fifteen (15) feet
of the entrance to all rooms used lawfully for sleeping purposes. In addition, if the permit is for & muitifamily
rental unit, a carbon monoxide detector needs (o be located within twenty-five (25) fest of any fuel-fired

Monthly Permit Statistics heater, fuel-fired appliancs. fireplace or garage. ™
Sequence of Inspections )
= 3 It s recommended that the Carbon Monoxide Detectors be hard wired with a battery backup, if this is
Wildfire Mitigation . o,
Impractical, then @ plug-in unit with a battery backup 1s acceptable.
Wildfire Mitigation Permitting . .
Process ‘When are Carbon Monoxide Detectors Required?

An individual dwelling unit with an attached garage gr containing a fuel fired appliance shall be equipped with & carbon monoxide

Zoning
alarm when intericr work such as alterations, repairs, additions or replacement of a fuel fired appliance ocours requinng & permit

Online Services:
All single station carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed as complying with UL 2034 ana shall be installed as described balow and

Schedule Inspections ; 3 : .
in accardance the manufaeturer's installation instructons,

Search Permits
Search Contractors _—9 Exceptian: Work limited to the exterior of dwellings. such as the réplacement of roofing, siding or the addition of @ deck or patio

Real Estate Search cover are exempt from the requirements of this section.

Property Tax Inquiry Where should a Carbon Monoxide Detector be located?
Carbon monoxide alarms shall be installed within 15 feet of the bedrooms entrance

Maplt
R ded D tS h VWhen mare than one carbon monoxide alarm is required to be installed within an individual dwelling unit the alarm devices shall be
p—— e intercarnectad In such a manner that the actuation of one alarm will activate all of the alarms in the Individual unit
Building Division
Chief Building Official
Korby Lintz ) Exception: interconnection of carbon monoxide alarms in existing areas shall not be required where the alferations or repairs do
é:oaost}-e h?ﬂg:m;é 23:54020 riot result in the removal of Interior wall or celling finishes exposing the structure, unless there is an atfic, crawl space or basement
g availahle which could provide access forinterconnection without the remaval of intemor finishes.
Phone: 303.660.7487
Fax: 303.660.0041 Power Sources for Carbon Monoxide Detectors.
DCBuliding@douglas.co.us Carbon menoxide alarms shall be supplied from two separate power sources. The prmary power shall be from the building wiring
Office Hours when such wiring is served from a commercial source, and when primary power is interrupted, shall receive power front a batiery.
8:00 am. - 5:00 p.m, Wiring shall be permanent and without a discannecting switch other than those required for overcurrent protection.
Permits Issued: Exceptions:
B:00a.m. - 4:00p.m.
1. Carhon monoside alarms shall be permifted to be battery operated when installed in buildings withaut commercial power. Bartery
-powered alarms shall be attached to the wall or ceiling In accordance with the manufactures instaliation instructions.
2 Hard-wiring of carben moncxide alams in existing areas shall not be required where the alterafions or repairs do not result in the
removal of interior wall or ceiling finishes exposing the structure, unless there is an atfic . crawl space or basement available which
could provide access for hard-wiring without the removal of intedor fimishes.
*ss carbon Monoxide Detectors are avallable at mostiocal retail or hardware stores.”
Online Services Other Governments Quick Links Residents
CPSD - Project Records Onling Chies & Towns Sneriffs Office Driver's License Renewals
BCC Minutes Search DC Liprary Ad Hoo Committees Snow Removal
Building Permit Search DC School District Capital Improvement Projects Food Banks
Mapit DC Water Resource Autharity Cammunity ‘Wildfire Protection Plan Propery Information
Marriage License Applications One Roxbarough Camprehensive Master Plan 2030 Tax Payment Infarmation
Planning What's New/Hot Topics Parnershup of DC Gowvis Demagraphy Planning Information

http://www.douglas.co.us/building/Carbon_Monoxide Detectors.html 3/8/2012






State of Califernia Awmendwment (FXHWITQ>

R315.1.4 2 Power supply. For new construction required carbon monoxide alarms shall receive their primary
power from the building wiring where such wiring is served from a commercial source and shall be equipped with a
battery back-up. Alarm wiring shall be directly connected to the permanent building wiring without a disconnecting
switch other than as required for overcurrent protection.

Exceptions:
1. In dwelling units where there is no commercial power supply the carbon monoxide alarm may be solely
battery operated.

2. In existing dwelling units a carbon monoxide alarm is permitted to be solely battery operated where repairs
or alterations do not result in the removal of wall and ceiling finishes or there is no access by means of attic,
basement or crawl! space.

3. In existing dwelling units. a carbon monoxide alarm is permifted to be solely battery operated or plug-in with
battery back-up where repairs or alterations are limited to the exterior surfaces of dwellings. such as the

replacement of roofing or siding. or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of & porch

or deck.

4. In existing dwelling units,_a carbon monoxide alarm is permitted to be solely battery operated or plug-in with

battery back-up when work is limited to the installation, alteration or repair of plumbing or mechanical systems.

R315.1.2 3 Interconnection. Where more than one carbon monoxide alarm is required to be installed within the
dwelling unit or within a sleeping unit the alarm shall be interconnected in a manner that activation of one alarm
shall activate all of the alarms in the individual unil.

Exceptions:
1. Interconnection is not required in existing dwelling units where repairs do not result in the removal of wall
and ceiling finishes, there is no access by means of attic, basement or crawl space, and no previous method

for interconnection existed.

2 In existing dwelling units, carbon monoxide alarms are not required to be interconnected where no
construction is taking place.

3. In existing dwelling units, carbon monoxide alarms are not re uvired to be interconnected where repairs or
alterations are limited to the exterior surfaces of dwellings. such as the replacement of roofing or siding, or the
addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch or deck.

4. In existing dwelling units, carbon monoxide alarms are not required to be interconnected when work is
limited to the installation, alteration or repair of plumbing or mechanical systems.

('r{—::;s.z Where When required in existing dwellings. Prior to July 1, 2011, Where when a permit is required for

—>

alterations, repairs or additions_with a total cost or calculated valuation exceeding one thousand dollars ($1,000),
existing dwellings or sleeping units that have attached garages or fuel-burning appliances shall be provided with a
carbon monoxide alarm in accordance with Section R315.1. Carbon monoxide alarms shall only be required in the
specific dwelling unit or sleeping unit for which the permit was obtained.

R315.2.1 Carbon monoxide alarms on or after July 1, 2011. All existing detached single-family dwelling units
intended for human occupancy. shall have a carbon monoxide alarm, approved and listed by the State Fire

Marshal installed on or before July 1, 2011. See Health and Safety Code Sections 17926, 17926.1 and 17926.2.
Carbon monoxide alarms a j erafed or plug-in with ba back-up in existin
buildings where no construction is taking place. When a permit is required for alterations. repairs or additions
existing dwellings or sleeping units that have attached garages or fuel-burning a liances shall be provided with &

carbon monoxide alarm in accordance with Section 315.1.

R315.2.2 Carbon monoxide alarms on or after January 1, 2013. All other existing dwelling units intended for
human occupancy as defined in Health and Safety Code Section 13262 (b) shall have a carbon monoxide alarm
approved by the State Fire Marshal installed on or before January 1, 2013. See Health and Safety Code
Sections 17926. 17926.1 and 17926.2. Carbon monoxide alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated or
plug-in with battery back-up in existing buildings where no construction is taking place. When a permit is required
for alterations, repairs or additions, existing dwelling units that have aftached garages or fuel-burning appliances
shall be provided with a carbon monoxide alarm in accordance with Section 315.1.

Proposed Express Terms — Emergency 40f5 April 6, 2011
2010 CBC and CRC (Title 24, Parts 2 and 2.5) — Carbon Monoxide Devices
Housing and Community Development (HCD)










This proposal seems to be consistent with neighboring states and would greatly assist code
officials in the State of Idaho for uniform and reasonable application of the code on when to
require drinking fountains and service sinks in commercial businesses. This proposal also works
to reduce costs for small businesses to improve the economic impact in Idaho while still
requiring these plumbing fixtures in commercial businesses where occupant loads are greater
than 30 persons. This amendment would be a win for both building officials and small business

OWICETS.



PLUMBING SYSTEMS

21001 IRC <E¥\-\'x.(3>11 A)

[P] TABLE 2902.1—continued
3w e g ﬂN[MUM NUM_BER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTUFI_ES_’
WATER CLOSETS DRINKING
(URINALS SEE SECTION 419.2 OF FOUNTAINS® |
THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING (SEE SECTION
N CODE) LAVATORIES 410.1 OF THE
— | BATHTUBS/ | INTERNATIONAL
No. | CLASSIFICATION | OCCUPANCY |  DESCRIPTION MALE |  FEMALE MALE J_FEl.mLs 'SHOWERS | PLUMBING CODE)| OTHER
Congregate living | -
R-3 facilities with 16 or 1 per 10 1 per 10 1 per8 1 per 10¢ Sn?r\l:cc
- fewer persons =
7 |Residential — Tt I T —
Residential | GGV
R4 | careassisted living | per 10 1 per 10 I per 8 Tperl00 | 'SV
L — facilities el S el - [ _5’1_
Structures for the See Secti
storage of goods, 4?: of th:“
541 warshuises, . 1 service
8 |Storage ) YR AN | per 100 I per 100 fmema_nonaf 1 per 1,000 sink
e Plumbing
freight depots, low Cod
| | and moderate hazard o 4 (| S EeeeeEn A L [

a. The fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction of the namber of persons indicated.
The number of occupants shall be determined by this code.
b, Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.
¢. A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient sleeping units shall be permitted where such room
is provided with direct access from each patient sleeping unit and with provisions for privacy.
d. The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and eqtertainment areas shall be incladed when determining the minimum number of ficilities required.
(? ¢. The minimum number of required drinking fountains shall comply with Table 2902.1 and Chapter 11.
£ Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of 15 or fewer.

A ™ A e e St
[P] 2902.1.1 Fixture calculations. To determine the occu- [P] 2902.3 Reguired public toilet facilities. Customers,
pant load of each sex. the total occupant load shall be patrons and visitors shall be provided with public toilet facili-
divided in half. To determine the required number of fix- ties in structures and tenant spaces intended for public utiliza-

tures. the fixture ratio or ratios for each fixture type shall be tion. The number of plumbing fixtures located within the
applied to the occupant load of each sex in accordance with required toilet facilities shall be provided in accordance with
Table 2902.1. Fractional numbers resulting from applying Section 2902.1 for all users. Employees shall be provided with
the fixture ratios of Table 2902.1 shall be rounded up to the toilet facilities in all occupancies. Employee toilet facilities
next whole number. For calculations involving multiple shall either be separate or combined employee and public toilet
occupancies, such fractional numbers for each occapancy facilities.

;ha]lbﬁ:st be summed and then rounded up to the next whole [P] 2902.3.1 Access. The route 10 the public toilet facilities
umber. required by Section 2902.3 shall not pass throu gh kitchens,
Exception: The total occupant load shall not be required storage rooms or closets. Access to the required facilities
to be divided in half where approved statistical data indi- shall be from within the building or from the exterior of the
cate a distribution of the sexes of other than 50 percent of building. All routes shall comply with the accessibility
each sex. requirements of this code. The public shall have access to

the required toilet facilities at all times that the building is
2902.1.2 Family or assisted use toilet and bath fixtures. occupied.
Fixtures located within family or assisted use toilet and
bathing rooms required by Section 1109.2.1 are permitted
to be included in the number of required fixtures for either
the male or female occupants in assembly and mercantile

[P] 2902.3.2 Location of toilet facilities in occupancies
other than covered mall buildings. In occupancies other
than covered mall buildings, the required public and
employee toilet facilities shall be located not more than one

\ paar story above or below the space required to be provided with
) [P] 2902.2 Separate facilities. Where plumbing fixtures are toilet facilities and the path of travel to such facilities shall

I' required, separate facilities shall be provided for each sex. not exceed a distance of 500 feet (152 400 mm).
f Exceptions: Exception: The location and maximum travel distances
required employee facilities in factory and industrial
1. Separate facilities shall not be required for dwelling g:(':c?i:uancies an;eppgn;itted :0 - tha:yrequjred by this
units and sleeping units. section, proyided that the location and maximum travel

' 2. Separate facilities shall not be required in structures distance are approved.

i or tenant spaces with a total occupant load, including [P] 2002.3.3 Location of toilet facilities in covered mall
bath employees and customers, of 15 or less. buildings. In covered mall buildings, the required public
3. Separate facilities shall not be required in mercantile and employee toilet facilities shall be located not more than
occupancies in which the maximum occupant load is one story above or below the space required to be provided

! 50 or less. with toilet facilities. and the path of travel to such facilities

2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®
——



2012 IBC ( EXHIRTT &} PLUMBING SYSTEMS

P] TABLE 2902.1—continued
MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURES®
(See Sections 2902.2 and 2902.3)

WATER CLOSETS
SECTION41920F FOUNTAINS:
- BATHTUBS
No. | CLASSIFICATION| OCCUPANCY |  DESCRIPTION THE HVTaNES OR o iy OTHER
bbbt Sgﬂg SHOWERS | |\ TERNATIONAL
PLUMBING CODE)
MALE ]FEM.I\LE MALE |FEMALE
Retail stores, ser-
vice stations,
6 |Mercantile M shops, salesrooms, 1 per 500 I per 750 o~ 1 per 1,000 1 service sink?
markets and shop-
ping centers
Hotels, motels, 1 fasaitie | léii 1 per
R-1 boarding houses s i PEE SEERARE sleeping — 1 service sink
i unit unit ;
(transient) umit
Dormitories, frater-
nities, sororities
R-2 and boarding 1 per 10 | per 10 1 per 8 1 per 100 1 service sink
houses (not tran-
sient)
1 kitchen sink
per dwelling
o . 1 per unit; 1 auto-
R-2 Apartment house I perl;dﬂv;r: lng | 1p erg;;f Mg dwelling — matic clothes
; 7 |Residential unit washer connec-
' tion per 20
dwelling units
1 kitchen sink
per dwelling
; ’ : 1 per unit; 1 auto-
R-3 .One ‘md. bibtae | 1per d\?ej]mg 1 per 10 dwelling — matic clothes
ily dwellings U unit washer connec-
tion per dwelling
unit
Congregate living
R-3 facilities with 16 or 1 per 10 1 per 10 1 per8 1 per 100 1 servyice sink
fewer persons
Congregate living
R-4 facilities with 16 or 1 per 10 1 per 10 1 per 8 1 per 100 1 service sink
fewer persons
Structures for the fif)i 841513]-
storage of goods, of the
5-1 warchouses, store- &1
8 Store ] - "
torage 52 houses and freight 1 per 100 1 per 100 Ir;f;;r;iz 1 per 1,000 1 service sink
depots, low and oAl
L moderate hazard Phé,’:g;ng

i :Fhe fixtures shown are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons mdicated or any fraction of the number of persons
indicated, The number of occupants shall be determined by this code.
_h- Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or care recipients. |
& A Single-uccupam toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than 1wo adjacent patient sleeping units shall be permitted where such
T00m is provided with direct access from each patient sleeping unit and with provisions for privacy.
& Gecupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the minimum number of facilities required.
£ Th? minimum number of required drinking foumains shall comply with Table 2902.1 and Chapter 11.
Drinking fountains are ot required for an occupant load of 15 or fewer.

5 For business and mercantile occupancies with an occupant load of 15 or fewer, service sinks shall not be required, []

W\_w

.
212 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 549




S o \)‘H/\e_(‘ N N evada 'A e et
the height does not exceed 10 feet, ('E Wi by + C.)

the length does not exceed 60 feet,

the area does not exceed 500 square feet,

the light-transmitting plastic is a minimum CC1 material,

is listed and labeled in accordance with nationally recognized standards,

the space in which the sign is installed is protected with an automatic sprinkler
system of at least Ordinary Hazard Group 2, and

g. a Fire Protection Report is provided to substantiate the preceding requirements are

met.

e e TP

2611.5 Encasement. Backs of wall mounted signs and non-illuminated portions of all signs regulated by
this section shall be fully encased in metal.

Section 2612.6 Exterior use.
Delete Exceptions No. 1 and No. 2 from Section 2612.6, as follows:

2612.6 Exterior use. Fiber reinforced polymer or fiberglass reinforced polymer shall be permitted to be
installed on the exterior walls of buildings of any type of construction when such polymers meet the
requirements of Sections 2603.5 and is fireblocked in accordance with Section 717. The fiber reinforced
polymer or the fiberglass reinforced polymer shall be designed for uniform live loads as required in Table
1607.1 as well as for snow loads, wind loads and earthquake loads as specified in Sections 1608, 1609

and 1613 respectively.

Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures.

Revise Table 2902.1, by adding A-2 Casinos, revising the column titles and footnote “f, and by adding
new footnotes “g” and “h", as follows:
[P] Table 2902.1

MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURES®
(See Sections 2902.2 and 2902.3)

A
=
= =
= Z g L~
= - -
= = WATER CLOSETS = ; %
% 3] (URINALS") LAVATORIES 5 DRINKING &
18 |8 MALE FEMALE  p— ;
] DESCRIPTION MA MAL E |ma OTHER
1:1-100 3:1-50 1:1-200
——- 4:51-100 2:201-400
-
= 2:101-200 6:101-200 3:401-750
1 S | A-2° | Casinos -- - I service sink
4 3:201-400 | 8:201-400
Qver 750, add one fixture
Over 400, add one fixture for each additional 500
each additional 250 males, persons
and one for each 150 females.

Remainder of rows 1 though 8 to remain unchanged.

2. The fixtures are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction of the number of
persons indicated. The number of occupants shall be determined by this code.
. Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.
c. A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient sleeping units shall be
permitted where such room is provided with direct access from each patient sleeping unit and with provisions fro privacy.

Southern Nevada Amendments Page 59 2009 International Building Code






WAC 51-50-2900: Chapter 29 — Minimum plumbing fixtures and sanitation facilities. Page 2 of 8

Stake of Wasthhiagton A vnend maent (E‘xa:i&l‘\‘ C)

preparation of food for service to the public or residents of Group R-2 boarding homes and
residential treatment facilities licensed by Washington state.

2902.2.2 Multiple tenants. Access to toilets serving multiple tenants shall be through a
common use area and not through an area controlled by a tenant.

2902.2.3 Multistory buildings. Required fixtures shall not be located more than one vertical
story above or below the area served.

SECTION 2903 -- FACILITIES.
2903.3 Facilities.

2903.3.1 Requirements. Separate toilet facilities shall be provided for each sex.

EXCEPTION: In occupancies serving 15 or fewer persons, one toilet facility
designed for use by no more than one person at a time shall be
permitted for use by both sexes.

2903.3.2 Food service establishments. When customers and employees share the same
toilet rooms, customer access to the to the toilet rooms shall not pass through food
preparation and unpackaged food storage areas.

2903.4 Pay facilities. Required facilities shall be free of charge. Where pay facilities are
installed, they shall be in addition to the minimum required facilities.

2903.5 is not adopted.

SECTION 2904 —- SPECIAL PROVISIONS.
2904.1 Dwelling units. Dwelling units shall be provided with a kitchen sink.

2904.2 Water closet space requirements. The water closet stool in all occupancies shall be
located in a clear space not less than 30 inches (762 mm) in width, with a clear space in front
of the stool of not less than 24 inches (610 mm).

2904.3 Water. Each required sink, lavatory, bathtub and shower stall shall be equipped with
hot and cold running water necessary for its normal operation.

( 2904.4 Drinking fountains.

> 2904.4.1 Number. Occupant loads over 30 shall have one drinking fountain for the first 150
occupants, then one per each additional 500 occupants.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Sporting facilities with concessions serving drinks shall have
one drinking fountain for each 1000 occupants.

2. A drinking fountain need not be provided in a drinking or dining
establishment.

2904.4.2 Multistory buildings. Drinking fountains shall be provided on each floor having

g
3/8/2012

http://apps.leg.wa.gov/wac/default.aspx?cite=51-50-2900



State 6C washington Amendment

(extrexT c)

: 1245
TABLE 2802.1 — MINIMUM PLUMBING FIXTURES kevv\b‘l t& Sevryste ; S K

WATER CLOSETS LAVATORIES®
(fixtures per person) (fixtures per person) BATHTUB OR SHOWER
TYPE OF BUILDING OR
1
OCCUPANCY® MALE™ FEWALE MALE ’ FEMALE I {fixtures per person}

For the occupancies listed below use 30 square fesat (2.79 mZ} per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Group A

Assembly places -

Conference rooms. dining | 1:1-25 1-1-25 Cne per 2 water closets
rooms, drinking

establishments, exhibit 2:26-75 2:26-75

Tooms. gymnasiums. 3:76-125 3.76-125

lounges, stages and

similar uses including 4:126-200 4-126-200

restaurants classified as 5 >

Group B Occupancies S:251-300 5:201-300
6:301-400 5:301400

Over 400. add one fixture for each
additional 200 males or 150 females

For the assembly occupancies listed below, use the number of fixed seating or, where no fixed seating is provided, use 15 square
feet (1.39 m*®) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Asgembiy PIECES _F 1.4-100 One per 25 1:1-200 1:1-200
Thesters. auditoriums. 2:101-200 Up to 400 2:201-400 2:201400
convention halls. dance 3:201-400 3:401-750 3.401-750
floors. lodge rooms.
casinos. and such places | Over 400. add one fixture for each Over 750, add one fixture for
which have limited time for | additional 250 males or 50 females each additional 500
fixture use (intermissions} persons
Assembly places - 1:1-100 One per 50 1:1-200 1:1-200
Biadiiins, afona a5d Siher 2:101-200 Up to 400 2:201-400 2.201-400
sporting facilities where | 3.201.400 3401750  3:401-750
fixture use is not limited to
intermissions Over 400. add one fixture for each Over 750, add one fixture for

additional 300 males or 100 females each additional 500

persons

For the assembly occupancies listed below. use the number of fixed seating or. where no fixed seating is provided. use 30 square
feet (2. 79 m*) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Worship places
Principal assembly area One per 150 One per 76 One per 2 water closets

Educational & activity unit | One per 125 One per 75 | One per 2 water closets

For the occupancies listed below, use 200 square feet (18 58 m¥) per occupant for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Group B 1:1-15 1:1-15 One per 2 water closets
and other clerical or 2:16-35 2:16-35
administrative employee | 3-35-55 3:36-55
accessory use
Over 55, add one for each additional 50
persons ’ | |

For the occupancies listed below, use 100 square feet ( 9.3 m?} per student for the minimum number of plumbing fixtures.

Group E 1-1-15 1:1-15 One per 2 water closets
Schaols - for staff usa 2:16-35 2:16-35

All schools 3:36-55 3:36-55

{One staff per 20 QOver 65, add ane fixture for each

students} additional 40 persons

Schools - for student use  1:1-20 1:1-20 1:1-20 1:1-20

Day care 2:21-50 2:21-50 2:21-50 2:21-50

e 9 Meuagat.



PLUMBING SYSTEMS

separated from food preparation and storage rooms as speci-
tied in Section 1210.5,

2902.6 Dwelling units. Dwelling units shall be provided with a
kitchen equipped with a kitchen sink. Dwelling units, congre-
cate residences and lodging houses shall be provided with a
bathroom equipped with facilities consisting of a water closet.
Lavatory and either a bathtub or shower. Each sink, lavatory and
either a bathtub or shower shall be equipped with hot and cold
running water necessary for its normal operation.

2902.7 Water closet space requirements. In all eccupancies.
the water closet stoo] shall be located in a clear floor space not
less thun 30 inches (762 mm ) in width. The clear floor space in
front of the water closet stool shall not be less than 24 inches
{610 mum). See Chapter 11 for accessible water closets.

SECTION 2903
DRINKING FOUNTAINS

2903.1 General. Drinking fountains shall be provided where
required by this section. Drinking fountains shall be accessible
as required by Chapter 11.

Exception: Drinking fountaing are not required when the

occupant load is 30 or less.

2903.2 Where required. In Group A occupancies. at least one
drinking fountain shall be provided at each floor level in an
appraved location.

Exception: A drinking fountain need not be provided in a
drinking or dining establishment,

In Group E occupancies. there shall be at least one drink-
ing fountain on each floor of elementary and secondary
schools. Drinking fountains shall not be installed in toilet
rOONIs.

592

Stake of O(‘@jov\ Avrend et

(E)(HI&:L’T C)

SECTION 2904
ALTERATION OF EXISTING
GROUP A CCCUPANCIES

20041 Definitions.

SUBSTANTIAL ALTERATION. Any alteration where the
total cost of all alterations (including. but not limited to, electri-
cal. mechanical. plumbing and structural changes) for a build-
ing or facility within any 12-month period amounts 1o 60
percent or more of the appraised value.

STRUCTURALLY IMPRACTICAL. An alteration that has
little likelihood of being accomplished because existing struc-
tural conditions would require removing or altering a load-
bearing member that is an essential part of the structural frame,
or because site constraints prohibit modification or addition of
elements, spaces or features which are in full and strict compli-
ance with the minimum requirements for new construction.

2904.2 Requirements. Where substantial alterations are made
to an existing Groups A, M and E occupancy with an occupant
foad in excess of 300. waler closets, as specified in Table 29-A
for new construction. shall be provided.

Exception: The building official may approve substantial
alterations without the installation of additional water clos-
ets only where it is structurally infeasible to make such alter-
ations: where existing site conditions. including the size of
existing public water or sewer lines, prohibit such installa-
tions: or where zoning regulations prohibit adding floorarea
to the existing building. The number of water closets pro-
vided shall be the maximum number feasible but need not
exceed the number required for new construction.

2010 OREGON STRUCTURAL SPECIALTY CODE







IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 04 Proposed Code Change-I1BC Section 903.2.7
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: To modify section 903.2.7 of the 2009 IBC to define the requirements to

install automatic sprinkler system in buildings with Group M occupancy.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: Section 903.2.7 clause 4 of the International Building Code (IBC) requires
an automatic sprinkler system be provided throughout buildings containing a Group M
occupancy when used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture.

For flexibility within the clause, Andrew Bick presented a proposal that would require an
automatic sprinkler system be installed where occupancy is greater than 5000 square feet.

At the 2012 legislature session, State Fire Marshal Mark Larson submitted a pending rule that
would amend the section of the 2009 International Fire Code (IFC) with the verbiage reflected in
the proposed change to IBC section 903.2.7 and the 2012 IFC. The rule passed the House
Business Subcommittee, Senate Commerce and Human Resources Committee, and House
Business Committee and will become effective upon sine die of the session.

For cohesiveness between the IFC and IBC, at the January 2012 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting the Board was asked to proceed with the change in the IBC as a temporary rule.

ATTACHMENTS: Proposed Amendment to IBC section 903.2.7 clause 4




Date: 4-11-2011 original, rev. 10-8-2001

Proponent: City of Hailey, Dave Ferguson (Building Official)
Name: Andrew Bick, Idaho State Building Coade Board Member
Address: P O Box 3911 Hailey, Idaho 83333

Email: akbick@mindspring.com Phone: 208-726-8608

Specific Code to Considered for Amendment (IBC): International Building Code

Section 903.2.7 Clause 4.

Modify Clause to read as follows: A Group M occupancy is used for the display and sale of
upholstered furniture or mattresess exceeds 5.000 square feet.

Revision (10-8-2011)



903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings containing a
Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m?).
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines exceeds
24,000 square feet (2230 m?).

4. A Group M occupancy is used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses
and exceeds 5000 square feet (464 m?) in area.

004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE.
Under the provisions of Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted

and incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. The
effective date of a 2009 edition of any of the codes adopted in this Section with any amendments identified
thereto shall be January 1, 2011. Until such time, the 2006 edition of any such code enumerated in this Section
without amendment will remain effective pursuant to Section 39-4109, Idaho Code. Copies of these documents
may be reviewed at the office of the Division of Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from
International Code Council, 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601-2298 or the International Code

Council at http:/ /www.iccsafe.org. (3-29-10)

01. International Building Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments. (3-29-20)

a. Delete subparagraph 4 of Section 903.2.7 - Group M, and replace with the following: A Group M
occupancy is used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses and exceeds 5000 square feet
(464 m?) in area. (-_-13)

02. International Residential Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments. {3-29-10}

a. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (4-7-11)

b. Delete item No. 2 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work

exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Fences not over six (6) feet (one thousand, eight hundred
twenty-nine (1,829) mm) high may be exempted from the requirement for a building permit in the absence of any
other applicable land use regulations governing the installation, height, type or other aspect. (4-7-11)

c. Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work
exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four
(4) feet (one thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. (4-7-11)

d. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor,



including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of
the lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. (3-29-10)

e. IRC Table R302.1 Exterior Walls -- delete the figures contained in the last column of the table
under the heading Minimum Fire Separation Distance, and replace with the following:

Minimum Fire Separation Distance

Walls (Fire-resistance rated):

N

Three (3) Feet

Walls (Not fire-resistance rated):

v

Three (3) Feet

Projections (Fire-resistance rated):

N

Three (3) Feet

Projections (Not fire-resistance rated): = Three (3) Feet

f. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2 -- Townhouses, and replace with the
following: Exception: A common one-hour or two-hour fire resistance rated wall assembly tested in accordance
with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical
equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both
sides and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing.
Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with section R302.4. (3-29-10)

g. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R313.1 -- Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler
systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be
required in townhouses where a two-hour fire-resistance rated wall is installed between dwelling units or when

additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler
system installed. (3-29-10)

h. Delete IRC section R313.2. (3-29-10) i. Delete IRC section R322.1.10. (3-29-10) j. Delete IRC
section R322.2.2 paragraph 2.2, and replace with the following: The total net area of all openings shall be at least
one (1) square inch (645 mm?2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed area, or the opening shall be designed
and the construction documents shall include a statement that the design and installation of the openings will
provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing the automatic entry and exit of

floodwaters. (3-29-10)

03. International Existing Building Code. 2009 Edition. (3-29-10)

04. International Energy Conservation Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments.

(4-7-11)

a. Add the following footnote to the title of Table 402.1.1 - Insulation and Fenestration
Requirements by Component: k. For residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see
section 402.6. (4-7-11)

b. Add the following section: 402.6 Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope. Residential log home

construction shall comply with sections 401 (General), 402.4 (Air Leakage), 402.5 (Maximum Fenestration U-Factor
and SHGC), 403.1 (Controls), 403.2.2 (Sealing), 403.2.3 (Building Cavities), sections 403.3 through 403.9 (referred



to as the mandatory provisions), Section 404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either Subparagraph
004.04.b.i., ii., oriii. as follows:

i Sections 402.2 through 402.3, 403.2.1, 404.1 and Table 402.6;

ii. Section 405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or

Cc.

REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program).

used only in accordance with Subparagraph 004.04.b.i above to appear as follow:

For SI:

1 foot = 304.8 mm.

TABLE 402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

(4-7-11)
(4-7-11)
(4-7-11)

(4-7-11)

Add Table 402.6 Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements By Component to be

) CRAWL
GLAZED Min. BASEMENT | SLAB R- SPACE
CLIMATE |FENESTRATION| SKYLIGHT |FENESTRATION| CEILING | Average | FLOOR WALL VALUE WALL R-
ZONE U-FACTOR? |U-FACTOR SHGC R-VALUE | LOG Size R-VALUE R-VALUE® |& DEPTH®| yaLUE®
in inches
5, 6 - High
efficiency 0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30 15/19 10, 41t 10/13
equipment
path ¢
5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10, 2 ft 10/13
6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 15/19 10, 4 ft 10/13

[oN

The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.

R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance heating
equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is considered compliant with the high
efficiency equipment path).

d. “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the interior of
the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the
home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

05.

References to Other Codes. Where any provisions of the codes that are adopted in this section

make reference to other construction and safety-related model codes or standards which have not been adopted
by the involved authority having jurisdiction, to the extent possible, such reference should be construed as

pertaining to the equivalent code or standard that has been duly adopted by such jurisdiction.

(4-7-10)




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 05 Negotiated Rulemaking Process
PRESENTER: Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General
OBJECTIVE: To inform the Board on the negotiated rulemaking process with regard to

possible proposed amendments to the 2009 Building and Energy Codes.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 06 2012 Codes

PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations; Jerry Peterson, HVAC
Program Manager; Arlan Smith, Building Safety Program Manager; and
Lisa Stover, Plans Examiner

OBJECTIVE: Discussion and review of the 2012 IBC, IRC, IEBC, and IECC.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND: Contingent on receiving proposals advocating the adoption of the 2012
IBC, IRC, IECC, and IEBC, agency staff is prepared to give short
presentations relating to the changes incorporated into the new editions of
the codes. We have also made arrangements to procure for board
members copies of publications outlining significant changes to the codes,
and to assure that board members have on-line access to the whole of the
codes. Through the cooperation of ICC, we also have reference copies of
the code available in the room today.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 07 Deputy Administrator Report
PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations

OBJECTIVE: Report on the recent activities within the Building program.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 08a Financial Report
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator and Dave Decker, Financial Specialist
OBJECTIVE: Review the lIdaho Building Code Board Financial Report.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: Idaho Building Code Board Financial Report




Division of Building Safety

IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02
Fiscal Year 2012 Financial Statements
As of 2/29/2012

Statement of Revenues and Expenditures

Projected for Projected Total

Fiscal Year To YTD as a % of Remaining Remainder of Projected Year as a % of

Class Budget Date Budget * Budet Year End Totals Budget

Revenues: 500,000 322,489 64.5% 177,511 177,500 499,989 100.0%

Expenditures

Personnel: 510,000 361,186 70.8% 148,814 177,360 538,546 105.6%

Operating: 135,000 131,442 97.4% 3,558 48,000 179,442 132.9%

Capital: 24,000 981 4.1% 23,019 22,000 22,981 95.8%

Total Expenditures 669,000 493,609 73.8% 175,391 247,360 740,969 110.8%
Net for FY 2012 (169,000) (171,120) (69,860) (240,980)

Statement of Cash Balance

Other Projected Year

Beginning Cash Changes in Projected Change in Cash for End Available

Available Revenues Expenditures Cash  Available Cash Remainder of Year Cash

1,183,267 322,489 (493,609) (88,853) 923,294 (69,860) 853,434



Date Prepared:

3/27/2012

IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND

FY 09 - 12 Month-End Available Cash

FY 12 Revenues vs Expenditures

$1,800,000 $120,000
$1,600,000 - B Revenue
$1,400,000 $100,000 -~ B Expenditure |
$1,200,000 $80,000 M-
$1,000,000 A
$800,000 | $60000 +---p@--B-® B B
$600,000 - $40000 - B0 B B B Bl Wl
00000 |2 el Ve 208 20000
$200,000 1| TESSE Vear 2012 |
$0 - $0 - —
JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MA APR MAY JUN
FY 09-12 Expenditures FY 09-12 Revenues
$180,000 Fiscal Year 2009 $180,000 Fiscal Year 2009
$160,000 oo Fiscal Year 2010 $160,000 | m Fiscal Year 2010 |- -1
514000 - reaven st || oo IEEenih
$120,000 1 $120,000 - -
$100,000 A $100,000 -
$80,000 +---1 g g : R $80,000 -
$60,000 | - i B B R B B $60,000 -4 - - -3k
$40,000 | e B B B B $40,000 -
$20,000 $20,000 | N B Y
$0 - $0 -

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

FUND 2292

As of February 29, 2012




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 08b Administrator
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator

OBJECTIVE: Provide an overview of the Division’s current activities.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board Meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




	bc_agenda04102012.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday, April 10, 2012
	9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MT)




