DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

APRIL 26, 2016




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 01 Agenda

PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

OBJECTIVE: Approve agenda for the April 26, 2016 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL

HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: Tentative agenda




TENTATIVE AGENDA

NOTICE OF PUBLIC MEETING/PUBLIC HEARING

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello

dbs.idaho.gov — (208) 332-7137

Tuesday, April 26, 2016
9:30 a.m.-12:30 p.m. (MDT)

(Note: North Idaho - Meeting Commences @ 8:30 a.m. PDT)

9:30 a.m. CALL TO ORDER - Andrew Bick, Chairman
o Roll Call & Introductions
0 Open Forum

CONSENT AGENDA
1. Approval of the April 26, 2016 Agenda

2. Approval of the February 23, 2016 Board Meeting Minutes

ACTION AGENDA
3. Election of Officers — Andrew Bick

PUBLIC HEARING
4. Negotiated Rulemaking - Review proposed amendments to the currently
adopted building and energy codes.

INFORMATIONAL AGENDA
5. Program Manager Report — Arlan Smith

6. Operational Report — Steve Keys

7. Administrator Report — C. Kelly Pearce
a. Financial Report — Fred Sisneros

12:30 p.m.  ADJOURN

All times, other than beginning, are approximate unless otherwise noted. Agenda items may shift depending on Board preference.
04/06/2016r



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 02 Minutes

PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

OBJECTIVE: Approve minutes from the February 23, 2016 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL

HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: Draft minutes




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Tuesday - February 23, 2016 - 9:30 a.m. (MST)

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello

*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE FEBRUARY 23, 2016 MEETING

NOTE: The following report is not a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting,
but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions.

Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:34 a.m. (MST).

Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:
Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator
Michael Arrington Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations
Mike Tracy Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration
Travis Beck Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General
Chuck Bleth Fred Sisneros, Financial Manager
Jason Blais Arlan Smith, Building Program Manager
Dennis Schaffner Bill Hatch, Public Information Officer
Jan Welch, P.E. Larry Jeffres, Regional Manager, Region 1
Chuck Knapp, Regional Supervisor, Region 1
Board Members Absent: Adam Bowcutt, Regional Supervisor, Region 3
Scott Buck Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Support

DBS Staff Members Absent:
Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3

Open Forum
Recognition - Dan Hunter was recognized for his years of service on the Board with a
commemorative plaque.

New Website - Hailey Reyes, Associated General Contractors (AGC) Representative, made a
presentation on a new website created by the AGC titled webuildidaho.org. It is the desire of
the AGC to attract, as well as encourage, younger generations into pursuing careers in the
construction industry.

Approval of the February 23, 2016 Agenda
MOTION: Mike Tracy made a motion to accept the agenda as presented. Dennis Schaffner
seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

Approval of the October 27, 2015 Board Meeting Minutes
MOTION: Mike Tracy made a motion to approve the minutes as written. Jason Blais
seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

Page 1 of 3



Code Collaborative Group Report

Leon Duce, Association of Idaho Cities’ Representative and moderator for the Code
Collaborative Group, provided an overview of the group’s multiple meetings with regard to
the adoption of the 2015 International Residential and Energy Codes.

Negotiated Rulemaking Process

The process for negotiated rulemaking was briefly addressed. The Idaho Building Code
Board has scheduled two public hearings, April 26, 2016 and June 28, 2016, to allow
interested parties the opportunity to recommend proposed amendments to the currently
adopted building and energy codes.

Program Manager Report
Cities of Meridian and Garden City - The Division has contracts with the cities of Meridian
and Garden City to provide building code services.

Building Program - As of January 1, 2016, the Building program has processed over 270 plan
reviews with the majority of them being new single family dwellings in Meridian. Currently,
the program has three plans examiners, five inspectors and one full-time administrative
personnel. The turn-around time for a plan review is ten working days or less.

Operational Report

Leqislation - The two Administrative Rule dockets (Fire alarm requirements in Group E and
new single annual permit for state entities) have passed the House and Senate Committees
and will become effective upon adjournment of the legislature.

Administrator Report
Revenue - The city of Meridian’s revenue dropped 15-20 percent from December 2015 to
January 2016.

Financial Report - The Idaho Building Code fund, FY 2016 financial statement as of January
31, 2016, was reviewed.

Shoshone-Bannock Casino - The Shoshone-Bannock Tribes have terminated its services with
the original architectural firm on Phase Il of the Casino project. The Tribe is moving
forward to secure another architectural/engineering firm to provide professional design and
construction administrative services for the project.

Budget - The Division requested, and the Governor approved, a $12,000,000 budget to
include monies for the School Safety and Security Program, as well as five additional full-
time employees (four inspectors and one administrative support).

School Safety and Security Program - A draft proposal to create a new School Safety and
Security program is currently being reviewed at the 2016 legislature. The purpose of the
program is to enhance the safety and security of students and educators who use Idaho’s
public schools and campuses. If the legislation passes, the program will be under the
direction of the DBS.

Page 2 of 3



Damage Prevention Board - Proposed legislation to create a dig line board is currently in the
House of Representatives for a reading. The purpose of the Board would be to provide for
the protection of public health and safety with regard to underground facilities and to reduce
damages to those facilities. If the legislation passes, the new Board will be under the
direction of the DBS.

Merging of Boards - Currently, there is legislation to combine the Manufactured Housing and
Modular Building Advisory Boards; creating a new board titled Factory Built Structures
Board.

Governor’s Legislation - Due to the recent ruling in North Carolina, with regard to anti-trust
laws, a proposal by the Governor has been presented to the legislature. The legislation
amends the existing law; revising the qualifications of the various licensure boards so that all
members will serve at the pleasure of the Governor and each board will have at least one
consumer member.

Adjournment
MOTION: Jan Welch made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Mike Tracy seconded. All in
favor, motion carried.

The meeting adjourned at 10:42 a.m. (MST).

ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
DATE DATE

*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board. 04/04/2016rb

Page 3 of 3



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 03 Election of Officers
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: Appoint a chairman and vice-chairman to the Idaho Building Code Board

from the active board members.

ACTION: Vote for a chairman and vice-chairman to oversee the Board.

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL Idaho Code 39-4106 (2) states in part, “...elect by majority vote of the
HISTORY: members of the board, a chairman shall preside at meetings of the board.”

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 04 Negotiated Rulemaking
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

OBJECTIVE: Review proposed amendments to the current building code.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL Idaho Code § 39-4109(5) states in part: “In addition to the negotiated

HISTORY: rulemaking process set forth in section 67-5221, Idaho Code, the board
shall conduct a minimum of two (2) public hearings, not less than sixty
(60) days apart.”

ATTACHMENTS: Proposed amendments.




Agenda 04 - 2015 IBC

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF A PROPOSED STATEWIDE AMENDMENT
TO STATE ADOPTED CODES
2015 Code Adoption Cycle

Log#
{Office Use Only)
PLEASE FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE FIVE
1. State Building Code to be Amended:
@ International Building Code O International Energy Conservation Code
O International Residential Code O International Mechanical Code
O International Fuel Gas Code O National Electrical Code
O International Existing Building Code @ IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01
rJ Idaho State Plumbing Code
Section: IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01 Pages: 1&2
2. Applicant Name (Specific local government, organization or individual):
Code Collaborative Subcommittee
3. Signed:
e 4 City of Boise Building Official 3-30-16
roponent Title Date
4. Designated Contact Person:
Jason Blais City of Boise Building Official
Name Title
Address: City of Boise — Planning & Development Services
P.O. Box 500
Boise, ID 83701
384-3807
Office Phone Cell Fax

E-mail address: jblais@cityofboise.org

Page 1 of 6



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IBC

5. Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language.
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each
separate proposal.

IBC IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01 1&2
Code Section Pages

Please note number of additional pages: 2

To adopt the 2015 International Building Code and make editorial amendment update changes or
deletions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01, accordingly to align.

See separate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes.

Page 2 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IBC

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete

proposals will not be accepted.

The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show:

1. That it meets basic criteria — See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code
amendment.

2. Theintended effect — See Part I1 to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the
benefits and the problems addressed.

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business — See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected.

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions.

5. Economic costs and benefits = Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and
operation and maintenance.

Part I ¢ Background information on amendment.

Code references: IBC, IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 01 Title: International Building Code

Related Codes: None
(Does this amendment change other related codes?)

Proponent: Jason Blais Phone: 384-3807 Date: 3/30/16

NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below:

{1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need.

{2} The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute.

(3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations.
(4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state.

(5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions.
Part II ¢ Amendment Benefit:
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment):

The proposed amendments to the IDAPA rules are only editorial in nature in order to align them with the
2015 edition of the International Building Code (IBC).

For example, the IBC Section 907.2.3 amendment was added to the 2012 edition of the code based on
language from the 2015 edition before the 2015 version being adopted. Now that the 2015 edition of the
IBC is being proposed to be adopted, this amendment is no longer needed as the language is now in the
published base code. The Code Collaborative agreed to adopt the 2015 IBC and concluded that some
IDAPA rule amendments would need some minor updating or deleting in order to align.

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria
listed above)

With the proposal of adopting the 2015 [BC, there is the need to update or delete some existing IDAPA
rule amendments. Doing so will correct errors or omissions. The Code Collaborative understood this.

Page 3 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IBC

TYPE OF BENEFITS PROJECTED:

Part il ¢ Amendment Impacts or Benefits:
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION: [XX]New Construction D Alteration/Tenant Improvement/Repair
[CIResidential-Single Family esidential-Mutti Family & Commercial B Industrial

List businesses/industries affected by amendment:

Manufacturers:
Specific Construction Contractors & Trades: _Co—serefal /rav \ X '~ F oy
Construction Supply Industry: =
Specialty Trades:
Types of Buildings: Cowmnereial/i d+i-fa omTly
Fire Protection Industry:

Types of Services Required:
[1Reporting: Brief Description
[:]Record Keeping: Brief Description
[_|Other: Brief Description
[ ]Indirect Cost to Industry: Indicate whether there are multiple sources to obtain the equipment,
material or service required by this proposal. If not, provide a justification of the benefit versus small
business impact.

Part IV ¢ Amendment Costs and Benefits

Construction’ Enforcement* Operations &
Building Type Maintenance®
Co % Benefits® | Costs % Benefits | Costs % Benefits
sts | impact! impact impact
-Residential-
Multi-family | of NJA 1 & Na R & VA A
Commercial/ "F‘,‘;"‘f{‘ v rojg “f?:ni
Retail New MR A Eas
Industrial \ 2t prisy . Ty pht E it io-)
Institutional N % v 4 v b 2 v

1 $ / square foot of floor area or other cosl. Attach data. Construction cosls are costs prior 1o occupancy, and inciude both design and direct
construclion cosls thal impact the lotal cost of the construction 1o the owner/consumer,

2 Cost per project plan. Attach dala. Enforcement costa Include governmental review of plans, field inspection, and mediated litigation required
for enforcement.

3 Cost to bullding owner/tenants over the life of the project,

4 Cosl differential over a specific size project or range of projects as determined by the proponenl. Provide sufficient cost and benefit detail io
clarify the impact to the Councll. Al data should be created and referenced to third party reputable sources for verification,

5 Nole sectors with measurable benefit from Part I, including benefits to a) the user, b) Ihe public, ¢} the Indusiry, and/or d) the ecanomy; use &)
far all of the above.

Division of Building Safety Page 4 of §

Page 4 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IBC

IDAPA 07
TITLE 03
CHAPTER 01

07.03.01 - RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
The Idaho Building Code Board of the Division of Building Safety is authorized under Section 39-4107, Idaho Code,
to promulgate rules concerning the enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building Code Act. (3-30-06)

001. TITLE AND SCOPE.

01. Title. These rules shall be cited as IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of
Building Safety. {3-30-06)

02. Scope. These rules prescribe the criteria for enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building
Code Act by the Idaho Building Code Board and the Building Bureau of the Division of Building Safety. (3-30-06)

002. WRITTEN INTERPRETATIONS.

In accordance with Section 67-5201(19)(b)(iv), Idaho Code, this agency has statements that pertain to the
interpretation of the rules of this chapter. These statements are available for review and copying at the offices of the
Division of Building Safety. (3-30-06)

003. ADMINISTRATIVE APPEALS.
This chapter does not provide for administrative relief of the provisions contained herein. (3-30-06)

004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE

Under the provisions of Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted and
incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. Pursuant to
Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the effective date of any edition of the codes adopted in this Section, or any amendments
identified thereto, shall be January | of the succeeding year following legislative approval of the rulemaking
establishing the edition or amendment. Copies of these documents may be reviewed at the office of the Division of
Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from International Code Council, 5360 Workman Mill Road,
Whittier, California 90601-2298 or the International Code Council at http://www.iccsafe.org,

(3-20-14)
01. International Building Code. 2842 20135 Edition with the following amendments: (4-4-13)
a. Delete section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling

unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving such day
care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

b. Delete section 308.6.4 and replace with the following: Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A
facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or having
five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with
the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

c. Delete section 310.5 and replace with the following: Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3
occupancies where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, E or [,
including: {3-20-14)

Section 038 Page 1
Page 5 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IBC

Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units; (3-20-14)
Bearding houses (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14)
Boarding houses (transient} with ten (10) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14)

Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (3) or fewer persons receiving care; (3-20-14)

Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14)
Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or (3-20-14)
Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children. (3-20-14)

Lod in houses with five or fewer uest rooms.

d. Delete section 310.5.1 and replace with the following. Care facilities within a dwelling. Care
facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care that are
within a single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

. Delete Add footnote (f) contained in the header of columnla 1 % rinkin Fountains” under of
Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and add footn n er Table 2902.1
stating the following: Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer.

f. Delete footnotle () (¢) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing
Fixtures and replace with the following: For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies
with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required. (3-20-14)
02. International Residential Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments: (3-20-14)
a. Delete exception No. | contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (3-20-14)

Section 038 Page 2

Page 6 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IEBC

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF A PROPOSED STATEWIDE AMENDMENT

TO STATE ADOPTED CODES
2015 Code Adoption Cycle

Log#
(Office Use Only)

PLEASE FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE FIVE
1. State Building Code to be Amended:
O International Building Code O International Energy Conservation Code
O Intermational Residential Code O International Mechanical Code
O International Fuel Gas Code O National Electrical Code
& International Existing Building Code & IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 03

O Idaho State Plumbing Code

Section: IDAPA 07.03.G1, 004, 03 Page: 5

2. Applicant Name (Specific local government, organization or individual):

Jason Blais

3. Signed:

: ;m—'v;:g La-«:' City of Boise Building Official 4-4-16

Title Date

4, Designated Contact Person:

Yason Blais

City of Boise Building Official

Name Title
Address: City of Boise — Planning & Development Services
P.O. Box 500
Boise, ID 83701
384-3807
Office Phone Cell Fax
E-mail address: jblais@cityofboise.org

Page 1 of 6



rbryant
Highlight

rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IEBC

5. Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language.
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each
separate proposal.

IEBC IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 03 5
Code Section Page

Please note number of additional pages: 2

To adopt the 2015 International Existing Building Code and make editorial amendment update
changes or deletions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 03, accordingly to align.

See separate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes.

Page 2 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IEBC

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete

proposals will not be accepted.
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show:

1. That it meets basic criteria — See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code
amendment.

2. The intended effect — See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the
benefits and the problems addressed.

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business — See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected.

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions.

5. Economic costs and benefits — Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and
operation and maintenance.

Part I ¢ Background information on amendment.

Code references: [EBC, IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 03 Title: International Existing Buildilig Code

Related Codes: None
(Does this amendment change other related codes?)

Proponent: Yason Blais Phone: 384-3807 Date: 4/4/16

NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below:

(1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need.
(2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute.

FA(3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations.
{(4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state.
(5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions.

Part I1 ¢ Amendment Benefit:
PROBLEM({(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment):

The proposed amendment to the IDAPA rules are only editorial in nature in order to update the year of
the code edition to align with the proposal to adopt the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building
Code (IEBC).

Also, the 2015 International Building Code (IBC) has deleted Chapter 34 from the code. This makes it
even more important that the edition of the IEBC matches the IBC for regulation of code requirements on
existing buildings.

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria
listed above)

With a separate Code Collaborative proposal to adopt the 2015 International Building Code, it is also

necessary to adopt the 2015 International Existing Building Code to have consistent codes that interact
and cross reference each other.

Page 3 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IEBC

TYPE OF BENEFITS PROJECTED:

Part lll ® Amendment Impacts or Benefits:

TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION: [_JNew Construction eration/Tenant Improvement/Repair
[]Residential-Single Family EResldential—Multi Family Commercial & Industrial

List businesses/industries affected by amendment:

Manufacturers:
Specific Construction Contractors & Trades; _Ce=~2reial f Ayl b T-Paaac) ¥ Leuapgdtle S
[

Construction Supply Industry:
Specialty Trades: .
Types of Buildings: el g roaxi8ws 4o Q¥Yifi{~q (Bwa~n N Ww |4 o ~fRim, ly
Fire Protection Industry: "

Types of Services Required:

[]Reporting: Brief Description
[CJRecord Keeping: Brief Description
[Jother: Brief Description
[Jindirect Cost to Industry: Indicate whether there are multiple sources to obtain the equipment,

material or service required by this proposal. if not, provide a justification of the benefit versus small
business impact.

Part IV ¢+ Amendment Costs and Benefits

Construction’ Enforcement’ Operations &
Building Type Maintenance®
Co % Benefits’ {| Costs % Benefits [ Costs % Benefits
sts | impact! impact li impact
Residential—

Sngte tamy
Multtamly [ @ | N[A | 1 z NTA 7 TR
Commercial/ Code for Cege for
Retall | Q)\t\:"r ] | [ easd
Industrial ) Ligag, . 1. ) AR bldqs.
Institutional 4 b A e $ \‘L J’ v

1§/ square foot of floor area or other cost. Attach data. Construction costs are cosls prior 16 occupancy, and include both design and direct
consiruction costs that impact the lotal cost of the construction to the owner/consumer.

2 Cosl per project plan. Altach dala. Enforcement cosls include governmental review of plans, field inspeclion, and mediated litigation required
for enforcement.

3 Cost {o buiiding owner/tenants over lhe [ife of the project.

4 Cost difterential over a specific size project or range of projects as determined by the proponent, Provide sufficient cost and benefil detail to
ciarity the impact (o the Councll, All data should be created and referenced 1o third party reputable scurces for verification.

§ Note sectors with measurable benefil from Part I, including benefits to a} the user, b) the public, c) the Indusiry, and/or d) the economy; use &)
for alf of the above.

Division of Building Safety Page 4 of 5

Page 4 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IEBC

IDAPA 07
TITLE 03
CHAPTER 01

07.03.01 - RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
The Idaho Building Code Board of the Division of Building Safety is authorized under Section 39-4107, Idaho Code,
to promulgate rules concerning the enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building Code Act. {(3-30-06)

001. TITLE AND SCOPE.

1. Title. These rules shall be cited as IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of
Building Safety. (3-30-06)

02, Scope. These rules prescribe the criteria for enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building
Code Act by the Idaho Building Code Board and the Building Bureau of the Division of Building Safety. (3-30-06)

002. WRITTEN INTERPRETATIONS.

In accordance with Section 67-5201(19)(b)(iv), Idaho Code, this agency has statements that periain to the
interpretation of the rules of this chapter. These statements are available for review and copying at the offices of the
Division of Building Safety. (3-30-06)

003. ADMINISTRATIVE APPEALS.
This chapter does not provide for administrative relief of the provisions contained herein, (3-30-06)

004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE

Under the provisions of Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted and
incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. Pursuant to
Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the effective date of any edition of the codes adopted in this Section, or any amendments
identified thereto, shall be January 1 of the succeeding year following legislative approval of the rulemaking
establishing the edition or amendment. Copies of these documents may be reviewed at the office of the Division of
Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from Interational Code Council, 5360 Workman Mill Road,
Whittier, California 90601-2298 or the International Code Council at http://www.iccsafe.org.

(3-20-14)
01. International Building Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments: (4-4-13)
a. Delete section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling

unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving such day
care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

b. Delete section 308.6.4 and replace with the following: Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A
facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12} or fewer children receiving day care or having
five (5} or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with

the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

c. Delete section 310.5 and replace with the following: Residential Group R-3. Residential
occupancies where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R4, E or 1,
including: (3-20-14)
Section 038 Page 1

Page 5 of 6


rbryant
Highlight


iii.

Agenda 04 - 2015 IEBC

Table N1102.1.1 (Table R402.1.1) - Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component;
(3-20-14)
Table N1102.1.3 (Table R402.1.3 - Equivalent U-Factors; (3-20-14)

Table N1102.2.6 (Table R402.2.6) - Steel-Frame Ceiling, Wall and Floor Insulation (R-Value);

(3-20-14)

iv, Section N1102.4.1 (R402.4.1) Building Thermal Envelope; (3-20-14)

V. Section N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1) - Insulation; (3-20-14)

vi. Table N1102.4.1.1 (Table R402.4.1.1) - Air Barrier and Insulation Installation; (3-20-14)

Vil Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing Option; (3-20-14)

viii. Add Section N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) - Visual Inspection Option; (3-20-14)

ix. Add Section N1102.6 (R402.6) - Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope; (3-20-14)

X. Add Table N1102.6 (Table R402.6) - Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements by

Component; and (3-20-14)

Xi. Section N1104.1 (R404.1) - Lighting Equipment. (3-20-14)

03. International Existing Building Code. 2812 20135 Edition. {4-4-13)

04. International Energy Conservation Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments.

(3-20-14)

a. Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.1 (Table N1102.1.1) for climate zone **5 and Marine 4”

and climate zone “6” and replace with the following: (3-20-14)

TABLE R402.1.1
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT
Wood
Climate | Fenestratio | Skylight e Ceiling | Frame k] Floor Basemen Slab S
Fenestratio Wall tWall Wall
Zone | nU- Factor | U-factor R-Value | Wall R-Value R-Value
n SHGC R-Value R-Value R-Value
R-Value
§ and 20 or
Marine 4 0.35 0.60 NR 38 13+5h 1317 30g 10/13 10,2 ft 10113
6 0.35 0.60 NR a9 | 200" | 4519 | 309 | 1519 |10,4%| 10013
: ’ 13+5h ’
(3-20-14)
b. Add the following footnote to the title of Table R402.1.1 - Insulation and Fenestration Requirements

by Component: * For residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see section R402.6.

(4-7-11)

c.

Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.3 (Table N1102.1.3) for climate zone “5 and Marine 4”

Section 038
Page 6 of 6

Page 5


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF A PROPOSED STATEWIDE AMENDMENT
TO STATE ADOPTED CODES
2015 Code Adoption Cycle

Log#
(Office Use Only)
PLEASE FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE FIVE
1. State Building Code to be Amended:
O International Building Code i International Energy Conservation Code
O International Residential Code O International Mechanical Code
O International Fuel Gas Code O National Electrical Code
O International Existing Building Code O IDAPA

O Idaho State Plumbing Code

Section: C403.3.1 (2012) or C403.3 (2015) Pages: C-52 (2012) C-61 (2015)
2. Applicant Name (Specific local government, organization or individual):

Code Collaborative Subcommittee

3. Signed:
-
: ;w%k-ﬂv/ City of Boise Building Official 4-14-16
/B(oponent & Title Date

4. Designated Contact Person:

Jason Blais City of Boise Building Official

Name Title

Address: City of Boise — Planning & Development Services
P.O. Box 500

Boise, ID 83701

384-3807
Office Phone Cell Fax

E-mail address: jblais@cityotboise.org

Page 1 of 11



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

5. Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format’ including both old and new language.
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each
separate proposal.

IECC C403.3.1 (2012) or C403.3 (2015) C-52 (2012) C-61 (2015)
Code Section Pages

Please note number of additional pages: 6

Depending on which edition of the Energy Code is adopted.

Add an additional exception to 2012 IECC Section C403.3.1 Economizers to read as follows:

7. Unusual outdoor air contaminate conditions — Systems where special outside air filtration and
treatment for the reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air
economizer infeasible.

OR

Add an additional exception to 2015 IECC Section C403.3 Economizers (Prescriptive) to read
as follows:

10. Unusual outdoor air contaminate conditions — Systems where special outside air filtration and
treatment for the reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air
economizer infeasible.

Page 2 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all

statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete

proposals will not be accepted.
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show:

1. That it meets basic criteria — See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code
amendment.

2. The intended effect — See Part I1 to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the
benefits and the problems addressed.

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business — See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected.

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions.

5. Economic costs and benefits — Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and
operation and maintenance.

Part I ¢ Background information on amendment.

Code references: IECC C403.3.1 (2012) C403.3 (2015) Title: Intenational Energy Conservation Code

Related Codes: None
(Does this amendment change other related codes?)

Proponent: Jason Blais Phone: 384-3807 Date: 4/14/16

NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below:

@ The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need.
(2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute.
(3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations.
{4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state.

B(5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions.
Part I1 ¢ Amendment Benefit:
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment):

This particular issue was brought to light from a Code Collaborative member who is a mechanical
engineer.

In specific applications, i.e server rooms and clean rooms that may be present in hospitals, industrial
processes, and research facilities, it is not cost effective to filter the outside air from an economizer so that
it is safe for these environments. The additional upfront costs for the additional filtration equipment and
ducting may cost more than the potential energy savings could save. This is particularly true when
existing buildings are adding capacity to server rooms and or clean rooms where access and/or space is
limited. Because of the high degree of filtration needed it may be more cost effective to add additional
cooling used a closed system (ductless).

Ductless systems can be much more efficient than roof top systems and may be a cost effective option if
outdoor air (economizers) are not required.

Page 3 of 11


rbryant
Highlight

rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

The State of Washington has added the following exception to their state energy code which warrants
being proposed in Idaho.

“Exception - Unusual outdoor air contaminate conditions — Systems where special outside air filtration
and treatment for the reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air economizer
infeasible.”

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria
listed above)

See reasoning noted above for justification. Doing so will address a safety component and correct errors

or omissions with the code and the practical application of economizers in these specific noted cases. The
Code Collaborative had short discussion on this.

Page 4 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


TYPE OF BENEFITS PROJECTED:

Part lll ¢ Amendment Impacts or Benefits:
ew Construction

TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION:
[]Residential-Single Family

Manufacturers:

PAlteration/Tena
Residential-Muiti Family [\JCommercial

List businessesl/industries affected by amendment:

Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

t Improvement/Repair

n
ﬂ@dusﬂial

Specific Construction Contractors & Trades:

Mechion: cal (o~iogcdovs

Construction Supply Industry: ____&¢snsnize/HiAC 0 polf€rF

Specialty Trades:

Types of Buildings:

Fire Protection Industry:

Types of Services Requlred:
[C]Reporting: Brief Description
[CJRecord Keeping: Brief Description

O €r C . Al

[]Other: Brief Description
[Jindirect Cost to Industry: Indicate whether there are multiple sources to obtain the equipment,
material or service requited by this proposal. If not, provide a justification of the benefit versus small

business impact.

Part IV ® Amendment Costs and Benefits

Construction’ Enforcement® Operations &
Building Type ! Maintenance®
Co % Benefits® [ Costs % Benefits (§ Costs % Benefits
sts | impact! impact impact
~Residential—— e =
_smg' |E fam“F —
Cpti-famity =
Commercial/ P O No (W1
Retail o O% | Lo, 0% | VA Foe O% NP‘_
Industrial n £ A i \ 3 pd ] A / | /.
institutional N Y N \\ \ i \'%

1§/ square fool of floor area or other cost. Atlach data. Construction costs are cosis prior 10 occupancy, and include bolh design and direct

consiruction costs that impac! the lotal cost of the construction to the owner/consumer.

2 Cost per project plan. Allach dala. Enforcement costs include govemmental review of plans, field inspection, and mediated liligation required

for enforcement,

3 Cosl to building owner/tenants over the life of the project.

4 Casl differential over a specific size project or range of projecis as delenmined by the proponent. Provide sufficient cost and benefit detail to
clarify the impact ta the Cauncll, All data should be created and referenced to third party repulable sources for verificalian.

§ Note sectors with measurable benefil from Part Il, including benefits to &) the user, b) tha public, c) the industry, and/or d) the economy. use e)

for all of the above,

Page 5 of 11

Division of Building Safety

Page 4ol §


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers
Eco omizer

JULY 2011 = VOLUME 1, ISSUE 1

WHAT IS THE PURPOSE OF THIS REQUIREMENT?

Economizing refers to the use of outdoor air to provide building cooling Th s approach reduces
the annual hours of mechamical cocling systemn operation. There are two types of economizer
systems — air economizer and water econamizer Proper apphication of these systems can
significantly reduce mechanical cooling energy used by air conditioning systems

Fundamentals of air economizer

An air economizer 15 an tntegrated system of outside air and return air dampers, | nkages,
actuators, sensors and controllers in an air handling system. Operational controls provide the
capability of automatically modulating outside and return air dampers to provide 100% of the
design supply air as outside air to reduce or eiminate the need far mechanical cooling

There are two methods of economizer control;

, 1 Comparative Dry Bulb - Employs standard temperature sensing in both return and
- outside air streams.
- ‘“_. . Differential Enthalpy - Uses enthalpy sensors to compare energy content of retum
® 0w and outside air streams.
“‘}\ FIGURE 1 - Ax Hand er with Dampers fo
- RETURN Economizer Contro
oAMPER
Woror 4
There are four operating modes in an air
OUTSIOE economizer system:
Al —l=
DAMPER Heating made — During cold weather,
the outside air damper is adjusted to the
minimum ventilation position to Imit the

amount of cold outdoor air that is mixed
with the return air The resulting mixed air is then heated to provide the necessary supply air
temperature to heat the building

Modulated economizer mode — Dunng cool weather, outdoor air is mixed at varying per-
centages with return air so the resulting mixed awr temperature is sufficient to condition the
building This 1s accomplished without mechamcal heating or cooling. This is also referred to
as “free cooling "

Integrated economizer made Dunng moderate weather, outdoor air can provide a
percentage of the required cooling but not enough to meet the building loads. The outside
air damper 1s adiusted to full open position the return air damper is fully closed, and the
mechanical cookng systern is then operated simulteneously,

Mechanical cooling mode Dunng hot weather, integrated economizer is disabled and the
outside air damper 15 adjusted to the minimum ventilation position. The mechanical cooling
system provides all necessary cooling This mode is triggered by the high limit temperature
where excess outdoor air would cause the air handling system to use more energy than if it
did not have air economizer

Page 6 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

AIR ECONOMIZER CONTROL EXAMPLE

]

DUTLINE AR ANS-ECTUN AS)
e AT oY vt s
|Eaxalaiationts] VP LA CAITEIN A} Tl el
CE  ERESREFEEVNSSEFEG5EFORFERERGRENNE
DUTNOY AN T RAURE

FIGURE 2 - Air Economizer Control Examp e

NOTE - Ventilation airflow and control requirements
are prescribed in Chapter 4 of the 2009 International
Mechanil Code with Washington State Amendments.

It1s \mport nt that all components of an air econom zer
system fu ction properly Outside air sensors must be

wnsta led where they can sense the true outdoor ar
temperature Dampers, actuators and linkages need to
respond correctly when the controller calls for damper
position adjustment, At minimum a poorly functioning air
economizer represents a loss of opportunity for mechani-
cal cooling energy savings. Warst case it can sign f cantly
increase energy usage by mtroducing too much autdoor arr
during very cold and very warm cutdoor conditions There-
fore it 1s important that air economizer systems be tested for
proper performance when nstalled and serviced regularly to
ensure a | components continue to function optimally

Fundamentals of water economizer

A waler economizer is a system by which the supply air

of a cooling system is cooled directly, indirectly or both, by
evaporation of water or by other appropriate fluid in order
to reduce or ehminate the need for mechanical refrigeration
(WSEC 201). There are two primary types of water econo-
mizer - systems with chillers and systems without

Water economizer systems without chillers are also referred
to as air pre-cooling economizer. This approach uses a coadling
tower or dry cooler to reduce condenser water system
temperature below that required for cooling through the
use of a supplemental cooling coil in the terminal units, This
approach is most commonly used in packaged water-cooled
data center equipment. It is occassionally used in hydronic
heat pump systems, although several manufacturers no
longer carry economizer coil options.

Page 7 of 11

45°F WET BuLB
AMBIENT

‘ VENT AIR

RETURN
AR

CONDENSER
WATER
uPrLY

WATER
AETURN

FIGURE 3 = Water Economizer - Supply Air Pre-Coolng

-y T
uunm =T
s ‘ wr
®
WATER
CILLED CHLLED
PRECOOL WATER  WATER
RETURN SUPPLY

FIGURE 4 — Water Economizer in Ch  ed Water System

NOTE - This fact sheet discusses economizer reguire
ments in a condensed and paraphrased fashion The
actual code requirements referred to herein must be
read closely and in their entirety 1o comectly interpret
the applicab ity of all prowssions, due to the exacting
datails and complexities within all of the code econo-
mizer mandates.


rbryant
Highlight


WHAT DOES THE WSEC REQUIRE?

The WSEC define application, operat onal requirements and
exceptions for air and water econom zer systems As a
general rule, ful air econormizer capability is required

for all new systems Air economizer requirements and
excepbions for Simple Systems (WSEC 1424 are identical

to those required for Complex Systems (WSEC 1433)

Sirmple Systems rafer to packaged unitary equipment

Alr Economizers

An ar economizer system shall be capable of adjusting bot
outside ar and return a r dampers to the 100% outside ar
position when outdoor canditions are suitable to reduce or
eliminate the need for mechanical cooling This includes
appropriate provisions for relief of this excess outside ar to
prevent bullding over-pressunzat on (WSEC 1413 1) Relef ar
dampers shall be motonzed (WSEC 1412 4 1 with excephions)

Air economizer controls shall be capable of integrated opera
tion where economizer operation and mechanical cooling
can oceur simu tanecusly when needed to meet the cooling
load. An except on s al owed for d rect expansion units with
a rated capacity less than 65,000 btuh (WSEC 1413 3)

NOTE - Economizer damper and control packages
are available for small fan coils and can be controlled
from appropnate stand alone thermostats Building
management systems are not required for cost
effective and reliable economizer installations on
small systems

If hurmid fication equipment  needed to maintain min mum
indoor humidity levels in a system with air economizer, then
the humidifier shall be the adiabat ¢ type (direct evaporative
media or fog atomization type} Exceptions to this require-
ment apply to: spe ific health car fa (lites, 100% outsid ar
systemns, stand alone or duct mounted hurmidifiers senang n
more than 10% of the a r econom zer capacity of all me
chanical systems servng the building, or systems wath water
econormizer, (WSEC 1413 4)

There are a variety of exceptions to the ar economizer require-
ments under WSEC 1433 Some exceptions demonstrate alter
natve options that if appl ed with'n the parameters defined will
Ikely provide similar energy savings to an equally sized system
with ar economizer A few appy to unique situaions where
the air econormizer wou'd actua ly increase the energy used by
the mechanical system Many exceptions require that equip-
ment have efficiency ratings that are better than the mummum
requirements listed n mechanical equ pment effiaency WSEC
Tables 14 1A through 14 1G

Page 8 of 11

Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

The following represents a summary of the ava lable
exceptions to air economizer and the requirements of
these exceptions

Qualifying small equipment - Exception 1

Capacity of an individual urit can be no greater than
33,000 bitwh Equipment must have SEER and EER values
at least 15% better than the efficency table values. In
addition, the total capacity of all qualifying small systems
in a building cannot exceed either 72,000 btwh or 5%

of the arr econormzer capadity of all mechanical systems
serving the building, whichever 1s greater. This exception
does not apply to unitary cooling equ pment nstalled out-
doors or located in any room that has an exterior buld ng
envelope element, be it wall, floor, or ceiling This excep-
tion shall not be used for the shell-and-core permit or for
the iniyial tenant improvement It only appl es 1o existing
buildings with previous tenant improvement build-outs

Chilled water terminal units - Exception 2

Appties to chilled water terminal units connected to
systems with chilled water generation equipment with
IPLV values that are at least 25% better than min mum
part load efficiences listed in WSEC Table 14-1C. The
total capacity of all systems in the bullding that do not
comply with air economizer requirements cannot exceed
480,000 biuh/h or 20% of the air economizer capacity of
al mechan cal systems serving the building, whichever i1s
greater Additionat imitations apply. This exception shall
not be used for the shell-and-core permit or for the initial
tenant improverment. It only applies o existing buildings
with previous tenant improvement build-cuts.

Onsite energy — Exception 4

Applies to a system where at least 75% of the annual
energy it uses for mechanical cooling 1s being generated
with site-recovered or site-solar energy sources Recov
ered en roy I1s defined as energy captured and utlized
which wou d otherwise have been wasted Solar energy
sour es are defined as natural daylighting and thermal,
chem cal or electrical energy derived directly from conver
sion of incident solar radiation.

Unusual outdoor air contaminate conditions -
Exception 5

Systems where special outside arr filtrat'on and treatment,
for the reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor
contarminants, makes an air economizer infeastble

Dehumidification — Exception 6

Systems w th dehumidification requirements where air
economizer would increase overall bullding energy
consumption


rbryant
Highlight


> Water source heat pump systems - Exception 7
All required parameters must be met to be eligible. It
shall consist of multiple water source heat purmps that are
connected to a common loop. Heat purnps shall have a
cooling EER and heating COP that are at least 15% better
than the WSEC equipment elfidency table values, Air
systems shall have at least 60% air economizer and a
minimum of 50% heat recavery effectiveness. if provided
with a boiler or furnace that is less then 199,000 btu/h,
this equipment shall be rated to at least 90% AFUE.

> Group R occupancy small system — Exception 8
For equipment installed outdoors or in a room adjacent
to the outdoors, cooling capacity of an individual unit can
be no greater than 20,000 btuwh. For all other applicable
equipment, cooling capacity of an individual unit can be
no greater than 54,000 btwh. For split systems, these
limits are based on the cooling capadity of individual fan
coils. Cooling units shall have SEER and EER values at least
15% better than listed in WSEC Tables 14-14, 14-1B and
14-1D. Chillers with fan coil units or variable refrigerant
flow (VRF) systems do not qualify for this exception as
they are not cavered in WSEC Tables 14-14, 14-18, and 14-1D.

> Computer and data processing center cooling
equipment - Exception 9, parts Fand G

Applies to equipment used to cool any dedicated server
room, electronic equipment room or telecom switch room
provided that they completely comply with Option 9a,

Sh, or 9c in the Exception 9 Table below, This applies to
equipment subject to the performance requirements of
ASHRAE Standard 127-2007 Method of Testing for Rating
Computer and Data Processing Roorn Unitary Air-Con-
ditioners. EER and IPLV values shall be equal to or better
than the WSEC equipment efficiency table values.

Higher
Equipment | Equipment | Part-Load
Type Efficiency | Control Economizer
Option | Table 14-1A +15%® Required None
93 and 14-18* Over 85,000 Required
Btwhr
QOption { Table 14-1A +594 Required Waterside
9b and 14-1@¢ Over BS,000 | Economizer
Biuh*
Option ASHRAE +0%? Required Walerside
9 Standard 127 Over 3;;000 Economizer
Bruh*

WSEC 1433 - Exception 9 Table

> Variable refrigerant flow (VRF) systems - Exception 10
Systern shall be capable of serving multiple zones in both
heating and coaling mode simultaneously by transferring
energy from one zone to the other. System shall serve

2004 Washington Siate Srergy Code (WSEC)

at least 20% nternal and 20% permeter zones for load
diversity. Outdoor unit shall be a reverse-cycle heat pump
with variab'e speed compressor and condenser fan with at
least 65,000 btwh in total capacity. This exception is Imited
to buddings of 60,000 SF ar less. It cannot be applied to
portions of buildings

Water Economizers

A water economizer system may be provided in lieu of an air
economizer system when allowed under WSEC 1132.2 Excep-
tion 1 or WSEC 1433 Excaptions 3 and 9. When selected as an
alternative to air ecanomizer, the water econornizer system shall
be capable of providing the total concurrent cooling load served
by the connected terminal equipment lacking air economizer.
This concurrent Ioad is calculated based on outside air tem-
peratures of 50°F dry-bulb/45°F wet-bulb and below. For this
calculation all load factors including solar gain and internal loads
(such as occupant and plug loads) shall be based on load peaks,
except for the outside tempearatures (WSEC 1413.1), Specific
documentation requirements for this system type are defined in
WHSEC 1413 .2, System controls shall be capable of integrated
operation similarly to air economizer systems. The only excep-
tion to the integrated operation requirement is for water-cooled
water chillers.

Under WSEC 1433, the two exceptions that allow water econo-
mizer systems are:

> Chilled beams and chilled celling systems -
Exception 3

Applies io water-cooled refrigeration equipment serving
chilled beams and chilled ceiling (space cooling) systems only,
which are provided with a waler economizer meeting the re-
quirements of WSEC 1413, Maximum capacity of this system
shall not excead 500 tons, Terminal chilled water units ather
than chilled beams and chilled ceilings do not qualify under
this exception.

> Cooling equipment serving dedicated server rooms,
electronic equipment rooms or telecom switch rooms -
Exception 9, parts A through E
Applies to equipment used to cool any dedicated server
room, electronic equipment room o telecom switch room
provided that they completely comply with option 93, 9b,
or 9cin the Exception 9 Table. In addition to the waler
economizer requirements described above, this equipment
shall be served by a dedicated condenser water system
A non-dedicated condanser water system may be approved
if it can provide appropriate water temperatures during hours
when waterside economizer cooling is available. Under this
exception the total allowed capacity of cooling systems
without economizers shall not exceed 240,000 btwh or
10% of the ar economizer capacity of all mechanical
systems serving the building. Additional requirements apply.



rbryant
Highlight


Existing Mechanical System Additions,
Alternation and Repairs

New mechanical systems installed in an existing building, or
existing mechamical systems that are altered or replaced, shall
comply with all requirements of WSEC Chapter 14 Mechanical
Systerns. This includes all economizer performance and
integrated operation requirements identified in WSEC 1413,
1423 and 1433. Refer to WSEC 1132 2 Alterations and
Repairs, Mechanical Systems for complete requirements.

Alterations to existing mechanical cooling systems cannot
decrease the existing economizer capacity unless provisions
are included that make the system eligible for an economizer
exception. Such systems applying for economizer exceptions
have to comply with individual equipment sizing limits and
whole building capacity imits based on the air economizer
capacity of all mechanical systems serving the buillding. For
existing mechanical cooling systems that do not comply with
WHSEC 1413 and either WSEC 1424 or 1433, including ind:-
vidual unit size imits and total building capacity imits, the
alteration shall then comply with WSEC Table 11-1.

There are three categories per equipment type in WSEC Table
11.1. Under each category umique exceptions to WSEC 1433
requirements are hsted

> Replacement unit of the same type with the same or
smailer output capacity
In general, if the replaced unit did not have economizer,
economizer will not be required with certain caveats such
as high efficiency required for compressarized gear.

> Replacement unit of the same type witha
larger output capacity
In general, if the replaced unit did nat have economizer,
and was originally installed prior to 1991, econormnizer may
not be required with certain caveats. Otherwise,
full compliance with WSEC 1433 is required.

> New equipment added to existing system
or replacement unit of a different type

If new terminal equipment is added to particular pre-1591
central systems, economizer may not be required with
certain caveats. Otharwise, full compliance with WSEC
1433 is required

Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers

Recommendations for optimal long-term
economizer performance

Economizer commissioning procedure

> Observe damper position at vanous outdoor air tempera-
tures and compare to the design intent (high limit
settings, low-hmit lockourt).

> Setup false temperature readings through the building
management system or by increasing the temperature
at outdoor air temperatura sensor (electric hair dryer
or similar approach). Compare the response of the
economizer damper to the design intent.

> Instalf ternperature data-foggers or use building manage-
ment system (BMD5) trend logging capabilities to measure
the outside air, return air, supply air, and mixed air streams.
Monitor dataloggers or BMS trending for a minimum
period of two weeks.

> If post occupancy, look for farge peaks compared to his-
toncal bitling data in energy use during summer & winter

Economizer recommended maintenance

> Asair flows over the outside-air damper and into the
building, dirt and moisture accumulate on the damper
and its linkages. Unless regularly cleaned and lubricated,
these components can eventually corrode and lock up.

> Check for burned out damper motors

> Check for actuators that come loose from their mounting
pasition with difficulty transferring torque to the damper

> Check and calibrate temperature sensors

> Annually re-commission the economizer. Run a functional
performance test to demonstrate proper operation of the
physical components of the system

Additional Resources

> Energy Design Resources, Economizers Design Brief -
http:/ivww energydesignresources. comiresources/
publications/design-briefs/design-bnef-economizers aspx

> Trane Engineers Newsletter Edition 35-2,
Air Economizers - htip./imww trane com/commerciall
uploads/pdff673/admapn020en_0406 pdf

> NREC Compliance Forms, MECH-ECO Economizer
Flowchart — www.neec.netfenergy <htip:/fwww neec,
netlenergy> codes

> PECI Functional Testing for Air Handlers -
Chapter 3. Economizer and Mixed Air

> CED Engineering Economizers in Air Handling Systems
> ASHRAE 90.1- 2007 User’s Manual

Technical content contributed by:

RUSHING

Hazhington State Energy Code {WSEC)



rbryant
Highlight


No ergy

Agenda 04 - IECC Economizers
ciency C neil

Several technical resources are available in support of the
2009 Washington State Non-Residential Energy Code (NREC).

Refer to the NEEC website under the Energy Codes tab — http://iwww.NEEC.net/energycodes
All of these resources are available for download from our website.

COMPLIANCE FORMS

NREC compliance forms have been designed as tools to
help designers comply with the Energy Code, and to
assist bu [ding officials, plans reviewers and inspectors
with enforcement of the Energy Code The following
forms are available

> Building Envelope Complance Forms
> Lghting Complance Forms

> Energy Metenng Comphiance Forms
>

Mechamcal Systemns Compliance Forms

WEBINARS

Recorded webinars are available for the following topics

> NREC Chapter 13 Buiding Envelope

> NREC Chapter 14 Mechamcal System

> NREC Chapters 12 & 15 - Lighting and Energy Metenng
> NREC Compliance Forms Instructions
=

Continuous Insulation

RESIDENTIAL ENERGY CODE
TECHNICAL SUPPORT

NEEC prowides techrucal support for the Non Residential
sections of the Energy Code, which includes Mult-Fami y
Residential buildings For Energy Code techn cal support for
Single-Farmuly Residential buildings contact the Washington

State University Energy Extension Office - http /ivww.energy

wsu edu/BuitdingEfficiency/EnergyCode.aspx

Page 11 of 11

FACT SHEETS

Detailed fact sheets are available for several key topics in
the NREC that provide context to Code requirements and
perspective from industry experis

Air Barrier Management
Continuous Insulation
Daylighting Controls
Economizer

Energy Recovery
Solar Gain Management

vV VvV V V VvV V¥

ADDITIONAL RESOURCES

> 2009 NREC Technical Reference Manual — This manual
provides useful guidance and information for the Energy
Code by vanous industry experts

Classroom Training Presentation — NEEC presented
classroom trainings around the state that provided a
summary of updates and additions to the NREC from
the 2006 to the 2009 Energy Code edition. Presentation
matenal is avalable,

Air Leakage Test Protocol for Measuring Air Leakage
in Buildings — The 2009 NREC has requirements for air
pressurization/depressurization testing for some building
The U.5 Amy Corps of Engmeers has published an air
leakage test protocol that may be helpful to those need
ing more information on this procedure


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Page 1 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

5. Proposed Code Amendment, Use ‘legislative format® including both old and new language.
See instructions on page five for specific details, Please attach a separate sheet for each
separate proposal.

IRC IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02 2-5
Code Section Pages

Please note number of additional pages: 7

To adopt the 2015 International Residential Code and make editorial amendment update changes
or deletions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02, accordingly to align.

Sec separate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes.

Page 2 of 11



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete

proposals will not be accepted.
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show:

1. That it meets basic criteria — See Part I to specify liow this proposal meets the criteria for code
amendment.

2. The intended effect — See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, inchading the
benefits and the problems addressed,

3, The potential impacts or benefits to bnsiness — See Part III'Types of Construction, to explain how
methods in construction businesses, industries and services wonld be affected,

4. The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Reqnired, to
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions.

5. Economic costs and benefits — Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and
operation and maintenance,

Part I ¢ Background information on amendment.

Code references: IRC, IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 02 Title: International Residential Code

Related Codes: IECC
(Does this amendment change other related codes?)

Proponent: Charlie Allen Phone: 612-4022 Date: 4/14/16

NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below:

0 (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need.

0 (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute.

(] (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations.
0 (4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state.

M(5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions.
Part IT ¢ Amendment Benefit:
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment):

Most of the proposed amendments to the IDAPA rules are only editorial in nature in order to align them
with the 2015 edition of the fnternational Residential Code (IRC).

For example, amended IRC Table R302.1(1) now needs beneficial footnotes added to the Table.
Amendment language is also needed for the IRC Section R302.2 for acceptable townhouse wall
separation requirements outlined in the IDAPA rules. The IDAPA rules have IRC Section R501.3 struck
from the code but this code section has now changed to R302.13. In proposing the 2015 IRC, some
IDAPA rule amendments need some updating or deleting in order to align.

A majority of changes in the 2015 IRC will reduce costs to builders and provide clarification and ease of
finding code requirements. An exception to that is the new requirement for the number of king studs next
to headers depending on the size of the header needed. An amendment was made to reduce the overly
conservative numbers to align with more current framing practices. This was developed by the American
Wood Council and has research to back their proposal.

Page 3 of 11



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria
listed above)

With the proposal of adopting the 2015 IRC, there is the need to update or delete some of the IDAPA rule
amendments. Doing so will correct errors or omissions to align with the code text.

Page 4 of 11



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Page 5 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Page 6 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Page 7 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Page 8 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

Page 9 of 11


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

April 14, 2016

To: IDABO Government Affairs Committee
Fr: Teri Ottens, IDABO Staff
Re: Executive Order - Establishing a Federal Earthquake Risk Management Standard

On February 2, 2016, the White House issued an Executive Order applying to the
earthquake safety of any “buildings that are owned, leased, financed, or regulated by the
Federal Government” (copy of full order is attached). It applies to any construction of a
new building or alteration to existing buildings. Section 2(c) of the order defines this as:

(c) Federal Assistance Programs. Each agency assisting in the financing, through
Federal grants or loans, or guaranteeing the financing, through loan or mortgage
insurance programs, of a newly constructed building shall consider updating its
procedures for providing the assistance to be consistent with section 3(a) of this order, to
assure appropriate consideration of earthquake safety. (emphasis added)

It goes on to state how to meet the requirements that the earthquake provisions of the
2015 IBS and IRC must be met:

Sec. 3. Codes, Standards, and Concurrent Requirements.

(a) Commencing within 90 days after the date of this order, each agency shall ensure
that every new building for which the agency has not started programming is in
compliance with the earthquake-resistant design provisions of the 2015 editions
of the International Building Code (IBC) or the International Residential
Code (IRC), nationally recognized building codes promulgated by the
International Code Council (ICC), or equivalent codes, consistent with the
provisions of and to the extent required by 40 U.S.C. 3312, When the ICC releases
a new version of the IRC or IBC, each agency that constructs buildings shali
determine whether the new version is a nationally recognized code for the
purposes of 40 U.S.C. 3312(b), as expeditiously as practicable, but not later than
2 years after the release of the new version. If an agency determines that a new
version is a nationally recognized code, it shall ensure that any building, for which
the agency has not started programming, shall be in compliance with that new
version or an equivalent code.

This Order gives federal agencies 90 days to comply. It applies to all federal programs
including loans, or guaranteeing the financing, leasing, mortgage insurance programs, as
well as disaster relief. This definition includes the following:

o VA, FHA and other federally funded guaranteed loans
o Federal insurance programs, such as flood insurance

e Disaster relief (although Section 8 (d) makes it clear it does not apply to
emergency work essential to save lives and protect property or temporary housing

Page 10 of 11



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IRC

assistance in a disaster. It does apply in a “declared major disaster or emergency
when assistance actions involve new construction or alterations to an existing
building.

The International Code Council’s Government Affairs Committee feels that if a jurisdiction
does not have the earthquake provisions of the 2015 IBC and IRC in place that will put
federal loans and grants at risk of not being available as funding sources for Idahoans.

Conclusion:

It is IDABQ’s belief that delay in adoption of the 2015 IBC and IRC with the required
earthquake provisions will jeopardize funding sources for new and existing buildings and
homes in Idaho. Federal loan and insurance programs cannot be made available for
financing residential properties and could significantly impact the citizens of Idaho,
particularly the low income and veterans. It will have major impact if a disaster is declared
in a jurisdiction without current codes. It will have major impact on private property
owners who lease to the federal government.

And while there is the possibility of a proposal to just adopt the specific earthquake
regulations throughout both codes it would make a complicated and unwieldy adoption
process and add confusion for the public, designers, builders and code officials on the use
and enforcement of the codes.

Recommendation:

It appears that in order to avoid questions of federal programs being applied in Idaho, the
State of Idaho needs to adopt both the 2015 IBC and IRC in full as quickly as the process
will allow and to set up a system that allows for the state and its jurisdictions to stay on
track in adopting all new versions of the code within 2 years after the release of that
version of the code.

Note: We are currently seeking opinions from affected state agencies on how they will handle
this Order.

A copy of the full executive order is available upon request.

Page 11 of 11



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 1 of 10


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

5. Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format® including both old and new language.
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each
separate proposal.

IECC IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04 5-8
Code Section Pages

Please note number of additional pages: 7

To adopt the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code and make editorial amendments and
other amendment update changes or deletions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04, accordingly to align.

See separate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes.

Page 2 of 10



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete

proposals will not be accepted.
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show:

1. That it meets basic criteria — See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code
amendment.

2. The intended effect — See Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the
benefits and the problems addressed.

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business — See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected.

4, The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part III/Types of Services Required, to
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions.

5. Economic costs and benefits — Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and
operation and maintenance.

Part I ¢ Background information on amendment.

Code references: IECC, IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04 Title: International Energy Conservation Code

Related Codes: IRC
(Does this amendment change other related codes?)

Proponent: Charlie Allen Phone: 612-4022 Date: 4/14/16

NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below:

O (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need.

0 (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute.

[} (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations.
4(4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state.

(5) The amendment corrects errors and omissions.
Part IT 4 Amendment Benefit:
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment):

Many of the proposed amendments to the IDAPA rules are editorial in nature in order to align them with
the 2015 edition of the Infernational Energy Conservation Code (IECC).

There are amendments with compromise in some areas. Some amendments provide other viable options
that align with current construction practices where it has been shown already meet compliance with the
2015 IECC. For example, providing a footnote to Table R402.1.2 to allow R-38 attic insulation where R~
21 is provided in the exterior walls in Climate Zone 5. Numerous Reschecks on the 2015 IECC for
current construction of homes are showing compliance with R-38 attic insulation and R-21 wall insulation
which is very typical of current construction practice of homes today.

The existing amendment on lighting to be 50% high efficacy is proposed to be deleted. The 2015 IECC

requires 75% of lighting to be high efficacy which still allows 25% of lighting to be of any type for
decorative purposes. Light bulbs are being regulated nationally whereas most are high efficacy that are

Page 3 of 10



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

available anyway with prices having dropped significantly as well. Efficient lighting also has substantial
energy savings with a very quick payback of 1-2 years for homeowners.

An exception is added clarifying piping insulation is not required for single family dwellings for items 1,
2 and 4 listed under IECC section R403.5.3.

Adopting the 2015 IECC also allows another option for builder compliance using the Energy Rating
Index (ERI) method (such as the HERS rating). Adding another option is a good thing and many builders
are currently already utilizing this method but typically still have to submit tradjtional energy code
compliance documents instead. This change would allow jurisdictions to accept the ERI documents and
independent rater inspections/reports. An amendment adjusts Table R406.4 Maximum Energy Rating
Index in Climate Zones 5 and 6 to more of a tiered approach based on square footages of the homes. This
is needed due to volume differences between smaller homes and larger homes.

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria
listed above)

With the proposal of adopting the 2015 IECC, there is the need to update or delete some of the IDAPA
rule amendments. Doing so will correct errors or omissions to align with the code text,

Mandating a blower door test on every home is likely not feasible especially in the more rural parts
(unique character) of the state. Qualified individuals to perform the blower door tests in rural areas may
be scarce. The amendment to retain the visual inspection option and an option for a blower door test along
with the existing specified air changes per hour (ACH) amendment will remain. Across the state, blower
door tests are showing new homes with an average of 3.6 ACH, indicating tight construction.

Providing a footnote to Table R402.1.2 to allow R-38 attic insulation where R-21 is provided in the
exterior walls in Climate Zone 5 as another option is good and complies with the 2015 IECC in most
typical cases. This construction is typical practice in Climate Zone 5 of the state.

The market has already taken care of the availability of low U-values on windows and high efficacy light
bulbs, Even though the code has minor changes on these, there really is no change in actual construction
practice with these changes.

An exception added clarifying piping insulation is not required for single family dwellings for items 1, 2
and 4 listed under IECC section R403.5.3. There appears to be no sound available data backing these
requirements.

If builders are choosing to do an ERI method in their construction, why not allow this method as another
option for meeting the energy code? They could then just submit the ERI documents/design and rater
information/reports to applicable jurisdictions for review and approval. The 2015 IECC allows this
method as an option. Options are good and this can save redundancy in eliminating submittal of
traditional energy compliance documents. The ERI target is amended with a tiered approach based on size
of the homes for our Climate Zones in Idaho.

In current construction practices, costs will likely remain the same because of the above mentioned
amendments with some slight increases in lighting.

Page 4 of 10



rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 5 of 10


rbryant
Highlight

rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 6 of 10


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 7 of 10


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 8 of 10


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 9 of 10


rbryant
Highlight


Agenda 04 - 2015 IECC

Page 10 of 10


rbryant
Highlight


IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 05 Program Manager Report
PRESENTER: Arlan Smith, Building Safety Program Manager

OBJECTIVE: Update the Board on the Building program’s current activities.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 06 Operational Report

PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations

OBJECTIVE.: Provide an update on the daily operations of the Building program and
division.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 07 Administrator Report
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator

OBJECTIVE: Provide the Board with an overview of the Division’s current activities.
ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 07a Financial Report
PRESENTER: Fred Sisneros, Financial Manager

OBJECTIVE: Review the Idaho Building Code Board’s Financial report.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: Financial report




Division of Building Safety
IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02

Fiscal Year 2016 Financial Statements
As of 03/31/2016

Statement of Revenues and Expenditures

Projected for Projected
Fiscal Year To YTD as a % of Remaining Remainder of | Projected Year | Total as a %
Class Budget Date Budget Budget Year End Totals of Budget
Revenues: 969,000 887,737 91.6% 81,263 327,482 1,215,218.20 125.4%
Expenditures
Personnel: 572,000 670,951 117.3% (98,951) 234,833 905,784 158.4%
Operating: 143,000 114,939 80.4% 28,061 33,361 148,300 103.7%
Capital: 18,600 17,502 94.1% 1,098 1,098 18,600 100.0%
Total Expenditures 733,600 803,392 109.5% (69,792) 269,292 1,072,684 146.2%
Net for FY 2016 235,400 84,344 58,189 142,534

Statement of Cash Balance

July 1, 2015 Fiscal Year to Fiscal Year to Date Other Available Cash Projected Year

Beginning Cash Date Expenditures and = Changes in as of March Projected Change in Cash for End Available
Available Revenues Encumbrances Cash 31, 2016 Remainder of Year Cash

1,154,747 887,737 (803,392) (7,086) 1,232,006 58,189 1,290,195



IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02

$2,000,000

$1,750,000

$1,500,000

$1,250,000

$1,000,000

$750,000

$500,000

$250,000

$0

FY 12 - 16 Month-End Available Cash

Fiscal Year 2012

@Fiscal Year 2013

mFiscal Year 2014

Fiscal Year 2015

mFiscal Year 2016

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

$250,000

FY 16 Revenues vs Expenditures

$200,000

BRevenues BExpenditures|

$150,000

$100,000

$50,000 -

$0 -

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN




IDAHO BUILDING CODE FUND 0229-02

$250,000

$200,000

$150,000

$100,000

$50,000

$0

FY 12-16 Revenues

Fiscal Year 2012

@Fiscal Year 2013

mFiscal Year 2014

Fiscal Year 2015

mFiscal Year 2016

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN

$140,000

$120,000

$100,000

$80,000

$60,000

$40,000

$20,000

$0 -

Fiscal Year 2012

@Fiscal Year 2013

m Fiscal Year 2014

Fiscal Year 2015

mFiscal Year 2016

JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN




	Agenda_Item01.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	bc_agenda04262016.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday, April 26, 2016
	9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MDT)

	Agenda_Item02.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	bc_draftmin02232016.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday - February 23, 2016 - 9:30 a.m. (MST)
	Division of Building Safety
	Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:34 a.m. (MST).
	Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:
	Mike Tracy Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator-Administration
	Travis Beck Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General
	Chuck Bleth Fred Sisneros, Financial Manager
	Jason Blais  Arlan Smith, Building Program Manager
	Dennis Schaffner Bill Hatch, Public Information Officer
	Jan Welch, P.E. Larry Jeffres, Regional Manager, Region 1
	DBS Staff Members Absent:

	Agenda_Item03.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

	Agenda_Item05.pdf
	PRESENTER: Arlan Smith, Building Safety Program Manager

	Agenda_Item06.pdf
	PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations

	0229-2_FY2016-Mar2016.BLDG.1.pdf
	Financial Statement

	0229-2_FY2016-Mar2016.BLDG.2.pdf
	Chart 1

	0229-2_FY2016-Mar2016.BLDG.3.pdf
	Chart 2

	Agenda_Item04.pdf
	PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman




