DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

JUNE 12, 2012




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 01 Agenda

PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

OBJECTIVE: Approve the agenda for the June 12, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL

HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: June 12, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board tentative agenda




TENTATIVE AGENDA

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING/MEETING

IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho
dbs.idaho.gov — (208) 332-7137

Tuesday, June 12, 2012 -- 9:30 a.m.—12:30 p.m. (MT)

(Note: Meeting Time is 8:30 a.m. PT)

9:30 a.m. CALL TO ORDER - Andrew Bick, Chairman
o Roll Call & Introductions

0 Open Forum

CONSENT AGENDA
1. Approval of the June 12, 2012 , 2012 Agenda

2. Approval of the April 10, 2012 Board Meeting Minutes
3. Approval of the April 26, 2012 Special Board Meeting Minutes

ACTION AGENDA
4. Public Testimony — 2009 Code Amendments
a. 2009 IRC-R315.2 — Jason Blais, City of Boise

b. 2009 IBC-Table 2902.1 — Jason Blais, City of Boise
c. 2009 IECC 402.4.3 — Casey J. Bryntesen, lronstone, Inc.

5. Proposed Code Change--IBC Section 903.2.7 — Andrew Bick

INFORMATIONAL AGENDA
6. Deputy Administrator Report — Steve Keys

7. Administrator Report
a. Financial Report — C. Kelly Pearce and Dave Decker

b. Administrator — C. Kelly Pearce
12:30 p.m.  ADJOURN

All times, other than beginning, are approximate and are scheduled according to Mountain Time (MT), unless
otherwise noted. Agenda items may shift depending on Board preference. 05/24/12r



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 02 Minutes

PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman

OBJECTIVE: Approve the minutes from the April 10, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL

HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: April 10, 2012 Idaho Building Code Board meeting draft minutes




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Tuesday — April 10, 2012 — 9:30 a.m. (MT)

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho

*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE APRIL 10, 2012 MEETING

NOTE: The following report is not intended to be a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting,
but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions.

Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to orderat 9:30 a.m. (MT).

Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:

Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator

Carol Alexander, Vice-Chairman  Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator, Operations

Chuck Bleth Janice Foster, Deputy Administrator, Administration
Scott Buck Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General

Michael Arrington Rod Freligh, Regional Manager, Region 1

Dan Hunter Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3

Jan Welch Dave Decker, Financial Specialist

Dennis Schaffner Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Secretary

Board Members Absent:
Bobby Ball
Mike Tracy

¢ Open Forum
2009 Energy Code — Casey Bryntesen, president of Ironstone Distributors in Hayden, Idaho,
questioned the effect the 2009 energy code would have on his business and the HVAC industry
with regard to gasketed doors for wood burning fireplaces.

This topic was addressed under agenda item 4c¢ “Public Testimony--2009 Code Amendments--
2009 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) 402.4.3".

¢ Approval of the April 10, 2012 Agenda
Steve Keys requested item 6 “2012 Codes” be addressed immediately after item 3 “Negotiated
Rulemaking Process”. This allows DBS staff to address the changes in the codes prior to
testimony being heard to amend the current codes.

MOTION: Scott Buck made a motion to accept the agenda as amended. Dan Hunter seconded.
All in favor, motion carried.

Page 1 of 4



¢ Approval of the February 14, 2012 Board Meeting Minutes
MOTION: Dan Hunter made a motion to approve the February 14, 2012 Board meeting
minutes as written. Scott Buck seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

¢ Negotiated Rulemaking Process
As of 2009, the Idaho Building Code Board is required to adopt and amend editions of the codes
through a negotiated rulemaking process. Patrick Grace provided an overview of said process.

¢ 2012 Codes
The Board has not made a decision whether to support amendments to the 2009 codes or adopt
the 2012 codes. The following staff provided changes reflected in the codes: Arlan Smith,
building code; Lisa Stover, residential code; and Jerry Peterson, energy code.

Carol Alexander supports the adoption of the 2012 codes and is of the opinion that the 2012
International Building Code (IBC) and International Residential Code (IRC) have significant
changes with improved modifications/clarifications to better serve contractors, rather than the
vagueness and arbitrariness of some items in the 2009 code.

¢ Public Testimony — 2009 Code Amendments
2009 IRC-R315.2 — Jason Blais, city of Boise building official, stated the enforcement to install
carbon monoxide detectors in every home is a challenge for code officials since there are no
exceptions to section R315.2 “Where required in existing dwellings” in the 2009 IRC. For that
reason, Mr. Blais proposed the following two exceptions be added to the code:

1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as the replacement of roofing or
siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or ‘doors, or the addition of a porch or
deck, or electrical outlets, are exempt from the requirements of this section.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of noncombustion plumbing or mechanical systems are
exempt from the requirements of this section.

2009 IBC-Table 2902.1 — The largest number of complaints is the cost and requirements to
install high-low drinking fountains and service sinks in small businesses and mercantile
occupancies. The 2009 code has an exemption that an occupant load of 15 or fewer does not
require a drinking fountain. States surrounding ldaho have amended their codes to reflect the
occupant load of 30; doubling the size and matching the 2009 Uniform Plumbing Code.
Currently, there are no exceptions for service sinks in the 2009 code.

Mr. Blais proposed the following changes/additions to table 2902.1:
1. Amend footnote “f” to require occupant load for drinking fountains from 15 to 30.

2. Add footnote “g” to read, “For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile
occupancies with an occupant load of 30 or fewer, service sinks shall not be required.”

Board members Dan Hunter and Carol Alexander are in support of the amendments presented
by Mr. Blais.

Page 2 of 4



2009 IECC 402.4.3 — Casey Bryntesen stated the 2009 code specifies gasketed doors, not glass
doors on fireplaces; thus the code conflicts with the safety requirements of UL listed products.
Mr. Bryntesen suggested the following verbiage from section R402.4.2 of the 2012 code be
incorporated into section R402.4.3 of the 2009 code: “New wood-burning fireplaces shall have
tight-fitting flue dampers and outdoor combustion air.”

Patrick Grace offered to integrate the suggested amendments into the 2009 codes for the
Board’s review at the June 12, 2012 Board meeting.

ACTION: For the June 2012 meeting, Patrick Grace will present, in rule format, the suggested
amendments to the 2009 IRC, section R315.2; 2009 IBC, table 2902.1; and 2009 IECC, section
402.4.3.

Significant Changes to the IBC and IRC--2012 Edition — Carol Alexander expressed that
although the booklets Significant Changes to the International Building Code and Significant
Changes to the International Residential Code are not all inclusive, many pages direct attention
to modifications, clarifications, and some outright changes and additions to the 2012 code.
Those changes are enhancements for contractors, ease of inspections for building inspectors,
and added safety and comfort for homeowners.

Proposed Code Change--1BC Section 903.2.7

Andrew Bick reiterated the objective and background on the proposed change to IBC section
903.2.7. The modified clause reads, “A Group M occupancy.is used for the display and sale of
upholstered furniture or mattresses and exceeds 5000 square feet (464 m?) in area.”

The Board will vote on the above rule change at the June 2012 Board meeting. If approved, it
will be promulgated as a temporary rule to coincide with the effective date of the Idaho Fire
Code.

Deputy Administrator Report

Financial Payback Analysis — In the future, a cost benefit analysis of any change has to be
presented to the legislature. The Board was asked to help gather any information that would
support the action it wants to take relative to the adoption or amendment of codes.

DBS and Building Program — Based on the figures in the financial statements, it has been a
slow winter. DBS is currently in the process of hiring a building inspector to be stationed in
Moscow.

Homeland Security Disaster Drill — The Idaho Bureau of Homeland Security will put on a
disaster drill April 10th and 11th. DBS is the supporting agency for the Department of
Administration, Division of Public Works; providing building inspections, structural
assessments, etc.

Modular Program — The Modular program continues to struggle with units produced in Idaho
plants increasingly being shipped to other states.

Page 30f 4



Manufactured Housing Program — Lack of activity in the manufactured housing industry is
causing strain on the program.

Administrator Report
Financial Report — Dave Decker reviewed the Idaho Building Code fund FY 2012 financial
statements as of February 29, 2012.

Future Public Works Building Projects — Expansion of the following Idaho colleges/universities
will commence in the near future: Football stadium at Boise State University, Boise; University
of ldaho, Moscow; Lewis Clark State College, Lewiston; North Idaho College, Coeur d’Alene;
housing and two new buildings at College of Southern Idaho, Twin Falls; and remodel or
replacement of Colonial Hall at Idaho State University, Pocatello.

Manufactured and Modular Industries — The largest Canadian builder of modular housing will
open a plant in Pocatello. It is anticipated 150 will be employed.

Electrical, HVAC, and Plumbing Programs — With regard to revenue, the last several months the
Division has seen an upturn in electrical, a slight upturn in HVAC, and plumbing has hit bottom.

State Employee Raises — The 2012 legislature passed a 2% across-the-board salary increase for
all state employees. This is the first raise since 2008, and will become effective July 1, 2012.

New Business
There was no new business to discuss.

Executive Session
An executive session was not required.

MOTION: Scott Buck made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Dennis Schaffner seconded. All
in favor, motion carried. The meeting adjourned at 11:55 a.m. (MT).

ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
DATE DATE

*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board 05/23/12rb

Page 4 of 4



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 03 Minutes
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: Approve the minutes from the April 26, 2012 Special Idaho Building Code

Board meeting.

ACTION: Consent

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: April 26, 2012 Special Idaho Building Code Board meeting




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD
SPECIAL VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING

Thursday — April 26, 2012 - 9:30 a.m. (MT)

Division of Building Safety
1090 East Watertower Street, Suite 150, Meridian, Idaho
1250 Ironwood Drive, Suite 220, Coeur d’Alene, Idaho
2055 Garrett Way, Building 1, Suite 4, Pocatello, Idaho

*DRAFT MINUTES OF THE APRIL 26, 2012 MEETING

NOTE: The following report is not intended to be a verbatim transcript of the discussions at the meeting,
but is intended to record the significant features of those discussions.

Chairman Andrew Bick called the meeting to order at 9:36 a.m. (MT).

Board Members Present: DBS Staff Members Present:

Andrew Bick, Chairman C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator

Carol Alexander, Vice-Chairman  Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator, Operations

Chuck Bleth Janice Foster, Deputy Administrator, Administration
Scott Buck Patrick Grace, Deputy Attorney General

Michael Arrington Rod Freligh, Regional Manager, Region 1

Dan Hunter Chris Jensen, Regional Manager, Region 3

Dennis Schaffner Dave Decker, Financial Specialist

Jeff Garro Renee Bryant, Administrative Assistant 2/Board Secretary

Board Members Absent:
Jan Welch
Mike Tracy

This _meeting was scheduled with the intention that the Board decide whether to amend the
existing 2009 codes, adopt the 2012 international codes (administrative rule), adopt an Idaho
building code in lieu of the International Building Code (statute), or amend the 2009 codes
should the 2012 codes fail to move forward.

Contemplate the Amendment of the Existing 2009 Codes

Amendments to the existing 2009 codes are currently being reviewed by the Board through the
negotiated rulemaking process. The first public meeting was held April 10, 2012, and the
required second meeting is scheduled for June 12, 2012.

Contemplate the Adoption of the 2012 International Codes (Administrative Rule)
Carol Alexander addressed modifications and clarifications to the 2012 International Residential
Code (IRC) and the 2012 International Building Code (IBC).

With regard to the energy code, Idaho’s climate zones are five and six. lllinois, Pennsylvania,
and Utah are also zoned five and six. For comparison purposes, information from the 2012

Page 1 of 3



International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) on the above-mentioned states is located on the
Division’s website: http://dbs.idaho.gov/boards/rulemaking.html.

Contemplate the Adoption of Idaho Building Codes in Lieu of the International Building
Code (Statutory)

The question was brought forth whether the Board wants to stay with the IBC; moving forward
with the 2012 edition, OR create an Idaho state code based on the 2012 IBC.

Kraig Stevenson, International Code Council, stated many states choose to either go with a
model code or create a custom code based upon the philosophy on how they want to deliver
service and information to the building public and code administrators.

The 2012 International Code is a model code. It was suggested by Carol Alexander that should
the Board choose to move forward with an ldaho-based code to customize the 2012
International Code; promoting it as the Idaho Building Code.

IDABO President Ed Wagner expressed that IDABO would be in full support of adopting the
2012 codes, as well as supportive of Ms. Alexander’s proposal for an Idaho Building Code.

Contemplate the Amendment of the 2009 Codes Should the 2012 Codes Not Go Anywhere
Currently, the Board is in the rulemaking process with revisions to the 2009 IBC. Chairman
Bick expressed the continuation of a second public meeting; staying congruent with the fire
code already in place.

MOTION: Dan Hunter made a motion to poll-each board member on their preference of code.
Scott Buck seconded. Motion failed for lack of a vote.

Upon advisement from legal counsel, the Board did not vote. However, the majority of board
members communicated the need to move forward with the 2012 codes.

Unable to attend the meeting, Kent Solberg with CH*M Hill read a letter from board member
Jan Welch. The letter, dated April 23, 2012, and addressed to Chairman Bick, Vice-Chairman
Alexander, and Idaho Building Code Board, stated in part, “...1 would strongly recommend the
adoption of the 2012 International code documents with the goal of using this issue of the
International Code documents as the template for the development of the ldaho Building
Codes.”

Industry and city/county officials in attendance expressed support for the adoption of the 2012
codes.

MOTION: Carol Alexander made a motion for the Board to move forward with the negotiated
rulemaking process; hold two public meetings to discuss the proposed amendments to the 2012
International codes, and the revised codes to be known as the “Idaho Building Codes”. Dan
Hunter seconded.

Page 2 of 3


http://dbs.idaho.gov/boards/rulemaking.html

The verbiage in rule must coincide with the language in statute. The current statute requires the
International codes. To rename the codes specific to Idaho, the change must first be made in
statute. Carol Alexander amended her motion.

AMENDED MOTION: Carol Alexander amended her motion by removing the verbiage
“known as the Idaho Building Codes” and suggesting the Board consider statutory lanquage to
reflect an Idaho based code at a future meeting. Dan Hunter amended his second.

Upon further discussion, Carol Alexander withdrew her amended motion; making the following
motion:

MOTION: Carol Alexander made a motion that the Board move forward with the rulemaking
process to adopt the 2012 codes; to review the amendments, make a decision after two hearings,
and abandon the 2009 amendments already submitted as they are incorporated into the 2012
codes. Motion failed for lack of a second.

RESTATED MOTION: Carol Alexander made a motion for the Board to move forward with
the adoption of the 2012 codes; reviewing each of following codes and amendments on an
individual basis with concurrent hearings: 2012 IBC, 2012 IRC, 2012 IECC, and 2012
International Existing Building Code (IEBC). Andrew Bick seconded. Six ayes and one nay,
motion passed.

Negotiated Rulemaking Meeting Dates

As part of the negotiated rulemaking process, the Idaho Building Code Board must hold two
public meetings 60-days apart. The suggested dates to discuss the 2012 codes are: June 18,
2012 and August 20, 2012.

MOTION: Andrew Bick made a motion for the Board to conduct two public meetings, June
18th and August 20th at 9:30 a.m. (MDT), to discuss the 2012 International codes. Carol
Alexander seconded. All in favor, motion carried.

MOTION: Scott Buck made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Chairman Bick seconded. The
meeting adjourned at 12:30 p.m. (MT).

ANDREW BICK, CHAIRMAN C. KELLY PEARCE, ADMINISTRATOR
IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
DATE DATE

*These DRAFT minutes are subject to possible correction and final approval by the Idaho Building Code Board 05/22/12rb

Page 3 of 3



IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 04 Public Testimony — 2009 Code Amendments
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: To seek information and comments from the Board and industry with

regard to amendments to the 2009 codes.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND:

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: 2009 IRC-R315.2; 2009 IBC-Table 2902.1; and 2009 IECC 402.4.3


















































































IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 05 Proposed Code Change-I1BC Section 903.2.7
PRESENTER: Andrew Bick, Chairman
OBJECTIVE: Modify section 903.2.7 of the 2009 IBC to define the requirements to

install automatic sprinkler system in buildings with Group M occupancy.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: Section 903.2.7 clause 4 of the International Building Code (IBC) requires
an automatic sprinkler system be provided throughout buildings containing a Group M
occupancy when used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture.

For flexibility within the clause, Andrew Bick presented a proposal that would require an
automatic sprinkler system be installed where occupancy is greater than 5000 square feet.

At the 2012 legislature session, State Fire Marshal Mark Larson submitted a pending rule that
would amend the section of the 2009 International Fire Code (IFC) with the verbiage reflected in
the proposed change to IBC section 903.2.7 and the 2012 IFC. The rule passed the House
Business Subcommittee, Senate Commerce and Human Resources Committee, and House
Business Committee and will become effective upon sine die of the session.

For cohesiveness between the IFC and IBC, at the January 2012 Idaho Building Code Board
meeting the Board was asked to proceed with the change in the IBC as a temporary rule.

It was determined at the April 10th meeting that the Board will vote on the rule change at the
June 2012 Board meeting. If approved, it will be promulgated as a temporary rule to coincide
with the effective date of the Idaho Fire Code.

ATTACHMENTS: Proposed Amendment to IBC section 903.2.7 clause 4




903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings containing a
Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m?).
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines exceeds
24,000 square feet (2230 m?).

4. A Group M occupancy is used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses
and exceeds 5000 square feet (464 m?) in area.

004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE.
Under the provisions of Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted

and incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. The
effective date of a 2009 edition of any of the codes adopted in this Section with any amendments identified
thereto shall be January 1, 2011. Until such time, the 2006 edition of any such code enumerated in this Section
without amendment will remain effective pursuant to Section 39-4109, Idaho Code. Copies of these documents
may be reviewed at the office of the Division of Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from
International Code Council, 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601-2298 or the International Code

Council at http:/ /www.iccsafe.org. (3-29-10)

01. International Building Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments. (3-29-20)

a. Delete subparagraph 4 of Section 903.2.7 - Group M, and replace with the following: A Group M
occupancy is used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses and exceeds 5000 square feet
(464 m®) in area. (-_-13)

02. International Residential Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments. {3-29-10}

a. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (4-7-11)

b. Delete item No. 2 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work

exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Fences not over six (6) feet (one thousand, eight hundred
twenty-nine (1,829) mm) high may be exempted from the requirement for a building permit in the absence of any
other applicable land use regulations governing the installation, height, type or other aspect. (4-7-112)

c. Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work
exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four
(4) feet (one thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. (4-7-112)

d. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor,

Page 1 of 3



including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of
the lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. (3-29-10)

e. IRC Table R302.1 Exterior Walls -- delete the figures contained in the last column of the table
under the heading Minimum Fire Separation Distance, and replace with the following:

Minimum Fire Separation Distance

Walls (Fire-resistance rated):

N

Three (3) Feet

Walls (Not fire-resistance rated):

v

Three (3) Feet

Projections (Fire-resistance rated):

N

Three (3) Feet

Projections (Not fire-resistance rated): = Three (3) Feet

f. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2 -- Townhouses, and replace with the
following: Exception: A common one-hour or two-hour fire resistance rated wall assembly tested in accordance
with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical
equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both
sides and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing.
Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with section R302.4. (3-29-10)

g. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R313.1 -- Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler
systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be
required in townhouses where a two-hour fire-resistance rated wall is installed between dwelling units or when
additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler
system installed. (3-29-10)

h. Delete IRC section R313.2. (3-29-10) i. Delete IRC section R322.1.10. (3-29-10) j. Delete IRC
section R322.2.2 paragraph 2.2, and replace with the following: The total net area of all openings shall be at least
one (1) square inch (645 mm?2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed area, or the opening shall be designed
and the construction documents shall include a statement that the design and installation of the openings will
provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing the automatic entry and exit of

floodwaters. (3-29-10)

03. International Existing Building Code. 2009 Edition. (3-29-10)

04. International Energy Conservation Code. 2009 Edition with the following amendments.

(4-7-11)

a. Add the following footnote to the title of Table 402.1.1 - Insulation and Fenestration
Requirements by Component: k. For residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see
section 402.6. (4-7-11)

b. Add the following section: 402.6 Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope. Residential log home

construction shall comply with sections 401 (General), 402.4 (Air Leakage), 402.5 (Maximum Fenestration U-Factor
and SHGC), 403.1 (Controls), 403.2.2 (Sealing), 403.2.3 (Building Cavities), sections 403.3 through 403.9 (referred

Page 2 of 3



to as the mandatory provisions), Section 404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either Subparagraph
004.04.b.i., ii., oriii. as follows:

i Sections 402.2 through 402.3, 403.2.1, 404.1 and Table 402.6;

ii. Section 405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or

C.

REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program).

used only in accordance with Subparagraph 004.04.b.i above to appear as follow:

For SI:

1 foot = 304.8 mm.

TABLE 402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

(4-7-11)

(4-7-11)

(4-7-11)

(4-7-11)

Add Table 402.6 Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements By Component to be

) CRAWL
GLAZED Min. BASEMENT | SLAB R- SPACE
CLIMATE |FENESTRATION| SKYLIGHT |FENESTRATION| CEILING | Average | FLOOR WALL VALUE WALL R-
ZONE U-FACTOR? |U-FACTOR SHGC R-VALUE | LOG Size R-VALUE R-VALUE® |& DEPTH®| vaLUE®
in inches
5, 6 - High
efficiency 0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30 15/19 10, 4 ft 10/13
equipment
path ¢
5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10, 2 ft 10/13
6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 15/19 10, 4 ft 10/13

[oR

The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.

R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance heating
equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is considered compliant with the high
efficiency equipment path).

d. “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the interior of
the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the
home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

05.

References to Other Codes. Where any provisions of the codes that are adopted in this section

make reference to other construction and safety-related model codes or standards which have not been adopted
by the involved authority having jurisdiction, to the extent possible, such reference should be construed as

pertaining to the equivalent code or standard that has been duly adopted by such jurisdiction.

(4-7-10)

Page 3 of 3




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 06 Deputy Administrator Report
PRESENTER: Steve Keys, Deputy Administrator-Operations

OBJECTIVE: Report on the recent activities within the Building program.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 07a Financial Report
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator and Dave Decker, Financial Specialist
OBJECTIVE: Review the lIdaho Building Code Board Financial Report.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: Idaho Building Code Board Financial Report




89€'020'T (68L'2€) LST'€S0'T (Gzz'se) (2T¥'0.29) 12S'8.S 192'€8T'T
ysed Jea A JO lapuleway ysed s|gejleAy  ysed salnpuadx3y Sanuanay a|qe|reny
a|ge|leAy pug  1oj yseDd ul abueyd pseroaloid ul sebuey)d yse)d bBuluuibag
ea A paloaloid JETNle)
aoueeg yseD Jo Juswalels

(r29'v2T) (682'2€) (588'16) (000'69T) Z10Z A4 10} 18N
%E6TT T0Z'86. 68.'/2T @tv'T) %<Z 00T Z21v'029 000699 sainipuadx3 [ejoL
%8°G6 T186°CC 0002 6T0'€C %T'V T86 000'vC -Jended
%¢Z 08T 908‘¢0¢C 000'vC (908'ct) %1V '2ET 908'8.T 000'GET :Bunesado
% CTT vTv'c.S 68,18 GLE'6T %¢C 96 G29'06¥ 000°0TS ‘|]suuosiad

salnlpuadx3

%L VET 12S'€/9 000'G6 (22s'82) %/.'GTT 12S'8/S 000°00S ‘Sanuanay
18bpng Slelol pu3 les A 1/png x 190bpng areQ 18bpng Sse|0
JO op e Se lea A paloaloid Jo Japureway Bulureway J0 9% e Se LA Ol JeaA [edsiH
[e10]1 paroaloid l1oJ payosloid

wo.:.ﬁ_UCmQXm pue Sanusnay JO JuswalelS

¢T10cC/0E/Y O SV
SlusWale]S [eloueUlH ZTOZ JeaA [edsid

¢0-6220 ANN4 3AdO0D 9NIdTNg OHvdI
f1ayes Buip|ing 4o UoISIAIQ



ZT0Z ‘o€ |udy Jo sy Z62Z ANN4

NNC AVIN ¥dV VN 834 NVC 93d AON 100 d3S 9NV Ne NNC AVIN ¥dV ¥V §34 NVC O30 AON 100 d3S onv INC
- 0% - 0%
- 000'0¢$ - 000'0¢$
- 000°0v$ - 000°0t$
Sl BN | e - 000°09% - 000'09%
- 000°08% - 000°08%
- 000°00T$ - 000°00T$
“““““““““““““““““““““ - 000°0CT$ L 000'02T$
CT0C 1ea [edsiim ‘ C¢T0OC IedA [edsiH | ‘
1T0Z JeaA eosiqm | 000 or1$ TTOZ JeaA [edsIH{ W - 000 0VT$
e S 0TOC 1e3A [edslH - 000'09T$ OTOZ JesAfeosi4m | ___| L 000'09T$
600¢ 1eaA [edsiH . 6002 JeaA [easiH
000 08T$ 000'08T$
Sanuanay ¢T1-60 Ad seAnipusdx3 ¢T1-60 Ad
NNC AV ¥dV ¥V 834 NVC O3d AON 100 d3s onv nc NNC AV ¥dV ¥V 934 NvC 03d AON 100 d3s 9nv Ine
- 0% - 0%
‘ CT0C 1esA [edsiH | ‘
- 000°0¢$ : ‘ 110z JeaA eosiqm | 000°00¢$
i ‘ 0T0Z JeaA [edsiH .
000°0$ : ‘ 005 Jooa leosia = [ 000'00VS
000093 | 000'009%
| 000088  000'008%
““““““““““““““““““““ 000'00T$ o
B OOO.O._V._”% T OO0.00N.._HW
“““““““““““““ ainipuadxam || 000‘09T$ + 000°00t'T$
“““““““““““““““ ONUSASHM |-+ 000°'08T$ - 000°009'T$
000°00¢$ 000'008'T$
$94N}IPUBdX3 SA SONUBASY ZT Ad yseD a|ge|leAy pu3-Yuo 2T - 60 Ad

ANN4 3dOD ONId1iNng OHvdl

210¢/62/S :patedaid areq




IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD

Agenda Item No. 07b Administrator
PRESENTER: C. Kelly Pearce, Administrator

OBJECTIVE: Provide an overview of the Division’s current activities.

ACTION: Informational

BACKGROUND: This topic is addressed at all regularly scheduled Idaho Building Code
Board Meetings.

PROCEDURAL
HISTORY:

ATTACHMENTS: No documentation




	bc_agenda06122012.pdf
	IDAHO BUILDING CODE BOARD 
	VIDEOCONFERENCE MEETING
	Tuesday, June 12, 2012 -- 9:30 a.m.–12:30 p.m. (MT)

	0229-2_2012-April_BLD_pg1.pdf
	2

	0229-2_2012-April_BLD_pg2.pdf
	2G


