DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
APPLICATION FOR REVIEW OF A PROPOSED STATEWIDE AMENDMENT
TO STATE ADOPTED CODES
2015 Code Adoption Cycle

Logf#t

(Office Use Only)

PLEASE FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS ON PAGE FIVE

1. State Building Code to be Amended:

O International Building Code

I International Energy Conservation Code

O International Residential Code

O International Mechanical Code

O International Fuel Gas Code

O National Electrical Code

O International Existing Building Code

¥ IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04

O Idaho State Plumbing Code

Section: IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04 Pages: 5-8

2. Applicant Name (Specific local government, organization or individual):

Idaho Association of Building Officials (IDABO)

3. Signed: i Y
o ) A L S
Sl e },4_) City of Ammon Building Official 4-14-16
LFFOponent Title Date
4. Designated Contact Person:
Charlie Allen City of Ammon Boise Building Official
Name Title
Address: City of Ammon
2135 S. Ammon Road
Ammon, ID 83406
612-4022
Office Phone Cell Fax

E-mail address: callen@cityofammon.us




5. Proposed Code Amendment. Use ‘legislative format® including both old and new language.
See instructions on page five for specific details. Please attach a separate sheet for each
separate proposal.

IECC IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04 5-8

Code Section Pages

Please note number of additional pages: 7

To adopt the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code and make editorial amendments and
other amendment update changes or deletions to IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04, accordingly to align.

See scparate attachment for proposed IDAPA rule changes.




Supporting Data for Statewide Amendment Proposals. This information is required for all
statewide amendment proposals. Attach supporting documentation, as necessary; incomplete

proposals will net be accepted.
The governing boards require supporting data on any amendment proposal to show:

1. That it meets basic criteria — See Part I to specify how this proposal meets the criteria for code
amendment.

2. The intended effect — Sce Part II to describe the purpose of the proposed amendment, including the
benefits and the problems addressed.

3. The potential impacts or benefits to business — See Part III/Types of Construction, to explain how
methods in construction businesses, industries and services would be affected.

4, The potential impacts on enforcement procedures, See Part II/Types of Services Required, to
provide some analysis of the impacts on code enforcement in local jurisdictions.

5. Economic costs and benefits — Use the Table in Part IV of this form to estimate the costs and benefits
of the proposal on construction practices, users and/or the public, the enforcement community, and
operation and maintenance,

Part I ¢ Background information on amendment.

Code references: IECC, IDAPA 07.03.01, 004, 04 Title: International Energy Conservation Code

Related Codes: IRC
(Does this amendment change other related codes?)

Proponent: Charlie Alien Phone: 612-4022 Date: 4/14/16

NOTE: Amendments to the state building code must be based on one of the following criteria; please indicate
the pertinent rationale for the proposed amendment by selecting from the list below:

0 (1) The amendment is needed to address a critical life/safety need.

00 (2) The amendment is needed to address a specific state policy or statute.

(1 (3) The amendment is needed for consistency with state or federal regulations.
Mi(4) The amendment is needed to address a unique character of the state.

(5) The amendment corrects etrors and omissions.
Part IT ¢+ Amendment Benefit:
PROBLEM(S) ADDRESSED (Describe the intended effect of the proposed code amendment):

Many of the proposed amendments to the IDAPA rules are editorial in nature in order to align them with
the 2015 edition of the International Energy Conservation Code (IECC).

There are amendments with compromise in some areas. Some amendments provide other viable options
that align with current construction practices where it has been shown already meet compliance with the
2015 IECC. For example, providing a footnote to Table R402.1.2 to allow R-38 attic insulation where R~
21 is provided in the exterior walls in Climate Zone 5. Numerous Reschecks on the 2015 IECC for
current construction of homes are showing compliance with R-38 attic insulation and R-21 wall insulation
which is very typical of current construction practice of homes today.

The existing amendment on lighting to be 50% high efficacy is proposed to be deleted. The 2015 IECC
requires 75% of lighting to be high efficacy which still allows 25% of lighting to be of any type for
decorative purposes. Light bulbs are being regulated nationally whereas most are high efficacy that are




available anyway with prices having dropped significantly as well. Efficient lighting also has substantial
energy savings with a very quick payback of 1-2 years for homeowners.

An exception is added clarifying piping insulation is not required for single family dwellings for items 1,
2 and 4 listed under [ECC section R403.5.3.

Adopting the 2015 IECC also allows another option for builder compliance using the Energy Rating
Index (ERI) method (such as the HERS rating). Adding another option is a good thing and many builders
are currently already utilizing this method but typically still have to submit traditional energy code
compliance documents instead. This change would allow jurisdictions to accept the ERI documents and
independent rater inspections/reports. An amendment adjusts Table R406.4 Maximum Energy Rating
Index in Climate Zones 5 and 6 to more of a tiered approach based on square footages of the homes. This
is needed due to volume differences between smaller homes and larger homes.

PRIMARY REASON FOR AMENDMENT: (Describe how the amendment meets one of the criteria
listed above)

With the proposal of adopting the 2015 IECC, there is the need to update or delete some of the IDAPA
rule amendments. Doing so will correct errors or omissions to align with the code text,

Mandating a blower door test on every home is likely not feasible especially in the more rural parts
{unique character) of the state. Qualified individuals to perform the blower door tests in rural areas may
be scarce. The amendment to retain the visual inspection option and an option for a blower door test along
with the existing specified air changes per hour (ACH) amendment will remain. Across the state, blower
door tests are showing new homes with an average of 3.6 ACH, indicating tight construction.

Providing a footnote to Table R402.1.2 to allow R-38 attic insulation where R-21 is provided in the
exterior walls in Climate Zone 5 as another option is good and complies with the 2015 IECC in most
typical cases. This construction is typical practice in Climate Zone 5 of the state.

The market has already taken care of the availability of low U-values on windows and high efficacy light
bulbs, Even though the code has minor changes on these, there really is no change in actual construction
practice with these changes.

An exception added clarifying piping insulation is not required for single family dwellings for items 1, 2
and 4 listed under IECC section R403.5.3. There appears to be no sound available data backing these
requirements.

If builders are choosing to do an ERI method in their construction, why not allow this method as another
option for meeting the energy code? They could then just submit the ERI documents/design and rater
information/reports to applicable jurisdictions for review and approval. The 2015 IECC allows this
method as an option. Options are good and this can save redundancy in eliminating submittal of
traditional energy compliance documents. The ERI target is amended with a tiered approach based on size
of the homes for our Climate Zones in Idaho.

In current construction practices, costs will likely remain the same because of the above mentioned
amendments with some slight increases in lighting,




TYPE OF BENEFITS PROJECTED:

Part ll ¢ Amendment Impacts or Benefits:
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION: ><]New Construction Alteration/Tenant Improvement/Repair
E<]Residential-Single Family [><]Residential-Multi Family [SJCommercial  []Industrial

List businesses/industries affected by amendment:

Manufacturers:
Specific Construction Contractors & Trades:
Construction Supply Industry:
Specialty Trades: A : : : . -
Types of BU“diﬂgS: /i’) 2u N 242 (& //, /771 f.’t’-'i‘_‘"{'/f’ X2y ’/tz/ : (/_,;,-z:/,.‘- _rIAJ/ 1/1_/& Al ’j,é(c £
Fire Protection Industry: £ g T = d

14 {
o 7

Types of Services Required:

[ 1Reporting: Brief Description
[JRecord Keeping: Brief Description
DOther: Brief Description
[]indirect Cost to Industry: Indicate whether there are multiple sources to obtain the equipment,
material or service required by this proposal. If not, provide a justification of the benefit versus small

business impact.

Part IV ¢ Amendment Costs and Benefits

Construction’ Enforcement* Operations &
Building Type Maintenance®
Co % Benefits® | Costs % Benefits | Costs % Benefits
sts .J° impact* 3 impagct /. | impact
Residential _| 3 - {/17// 4 |\ A/A A q’ /A | N
?Amfctl'li far.rluly g 5% ; {P/M’)‘L{ - [} I ] i ,, I!
ulti-family |y 3 UpAasres o :
Gommercial | 3 [ o )] Wpdafel [ e
Retail N W gk Cod< (odt
Industrial K] \é:}; | woT? 1 ) W I T Zr
Institutional |35 1% v V' waplims] WV V  leraptans

1 $ / square foot of floor area or other cosl, Attach data. Construction costs are costs prior o occupancy, and include both design and direct
construction costs that impact the fotal cost of the construction to the owner/consumaer,

2 Cost per project plan. Attach data. Enforcement costs Include governmental review of plans, field inspection, and mediated litigation required
for enforcement.
3 Cost to bullding owner/tenants over the life of the project.

4 Cost differential over a specific size project or range of projects as defermined by the proponent, Provide sufficient cost and benefit detail to
clarify the impact to the Councll, All data should be created and referenced to third party reputable sources for verification.

5 Note seclors with measurable benefit from Part Il including benefits to a) the user, b) the public, c) the indusltry, andfar d) the economy; use e)
for ali of the above,

Division of Building Safety Page 4 of §



04. International Energy Conservation Code.2842 2015 Edition with the following amendments.
(3-20-14)
a. Add the following as a new subsection C101.5.3: Industrial, electronic, and manufacturing
equipment. Buildings or portions thereof that are heated or cooled exclusively to maintain the required operating
temperature of industrial, electronic, or manufacturing equipment shall be exempt from the provisions of this code.
Such buildings or portions thercof shall be separated from connected conditioned space by building thermal envelope

assemblies complying with this code. (3-25-16)
b. etete-tne-varue oRtatRea 1 aoe I v=1= ao1e- S imate zone“S-and Marine
42 and climate zone “6” and replace-with-the-following: Add footnote j to the Ceiling R-Value header, add footnote
k to the Wood frame Wall R-Value header. and add footnote | to table title of Table R402.1.2
(3-20-14)
TFABLE-R4024.2
HNSHAHOMN-AND-FENESTRATION-REQUIREMENTS BY-COMPONENT
Gl y Weed | Mass 2
Climate | Fepesiratio | Sloight E trati Ceiling | Frame | Wall | Fleor \Wall Slab W i"
Zene | nU-Fastor | Ufactor A-SHGC R-Value Wall R- |R-Value R \al R-Value R-\fal
R-Malue | Malue
5-and 20-¢r
Marine4 035 [aRsla} NR 49 12,5 1347 308 Ak ] 1043
035 G50 NR 49 :;3 Esi °| 48H9 309 AELa o 1043

(3-20-14)
i. The Ceiling R-Value in Climate zone 5 may be reduced to R-38 when the wood frame wall R-value is
increased to R-21.

k. The continuous insulation required for wood frame walls in climate zone 6 may be eliminated if wall R-
value is increased to R-21.

RAD o d ana o Raao

a! atHa aolno o e

by-Compenent:*|. For residential Ig home building thermal envelope construction requirements see section R402.6.
(3-25-16)

Section 038 Page 4



” 2 [174L] 2 - .
S5 and climatesone = andreplacevwithhefollovdng:

FABLER402.13
EQUIMALENT U-FACTORS
cl I F " Skvliaht | Ceil Wood Frame Crawlspace
Zone U-factor U-factor | R-Value R\/al R\/al
Eand
Marine 4 035 0.60 0030 0.057 0.065
8 035 060 0028 0057 0085
(3-20-14)
O
(3-25-16)

fc Delete section R402.4.1 (N1102.4.1) and replace with the following: Building thermal envelope.
The building thermal envelope shall comply with sections R402.4.1.1 and either section R402.4.1.2 or R402.4.1.3.
The sealing methods between dissimilar materials shall allow for differential expansion and contraction.  (3-25-16)

g.d.  Delete section R402.4.1.1 (N1102.4.1.1) and replace with the following: Installation. The

Section 038

Page 5



components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table R402.4.1.1 shall be installed in accordance with the

manufacturer’s instructions and the criteria listed in Table R402.4.1.1, as applicable to the method of construction,
(3-25-16)

32- 1)

ie. Delete section R402.4.1.2 (N1102.4.1.2) and replace with the following: Testing option, Building
envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when tested air leakage is less than seven
(7) air changes per hour (ACH) when tested with a blower door at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa). Testing shall occur
after rough in and after installation of penetrations of the building envelope, including penetrations for utilities,

plumbing, electrical, ventilation and combustion appliances. During testing: (3-25-16)
i. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shall be closed, but not sealed;  (3-20-14)
ii. Dampers shall be closed, but not sealed, including exhaust, intake, makeup air, backdraft and flue
dampers; (3-20-14)
iii. Interior doors shall be open; (3-20-14)
iv. Exterior openings for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery ventilators shall be closed
and sealed; (3-20-14)
v. Heating and cooling system(s) shall be turned off; (3-20-14)
Vi. HVAC ducts shall not be sealed; and (3-20-14)
Vil Supply and return registers shall not be sealed. (3-20-14)

1 Add the following as section R402.4.1.3 (N1102.4.1.3): Visual inspection option, Building envelope
tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when the items listed in Table R402.4.1.1,
applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where required by code official an approved party
independent from the installer of the insulation shall inspect the air barrier and insulation. (3-20-14)

k. g.  Addthe following section: R402.6 (N1102.6) Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope. Residential
log home construction shall comply with sections R401 (General), R402.4 (Air Leakage), R402.5 (Maximum
Fenestration U-Factor and SHGC), R403.1 (Controls), R403-2.2 R403.3.2 (Sealing), R463-23 R403.3.5 (Building
Cavities), sections R403.3 R403 .4 through R403.9 R403.10 (referred to as the mandatory provisions), Section R404

(Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either i., ii., or iii. as follows: (3-20-14)
i Sections R402.2 through R402.3, R403-2-F R403.3.1, R404.1 and Table R402.6; 4-7-11)
ii. Section R405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or (4-7-11)
iil. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program). (4-7-11)

L h. Add Table R402.6 (Table N1102.6) Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements By
Component to be used only in accordance with item i of section R402.6 above to appear as follows:

TABLE R402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

For Sl 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

Section 038 Page 6



Min.
" Glazed Averag Basement Slub Crawl
Climate Fenestration U- | Skylight U- . Ceiling Floor R-value | Space
Fenestration e Log Wall
Zone factor? factor R-value 4 R-value d & Wall
Shgc Size In R-value Depth® | R-value®
Inches P
5, 6 - High
EHieTRHcy 0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30 1519 | 10,4t | 1013
equipment
path®
5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10,2 ft. | 10/13
6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 16/19 10,4 1ft. | 10/13

a. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.
b.  R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

c.  90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance
heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is
considered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path).

d. *“15/19" means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the
interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement
wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13" means R-10 continuous insulated
sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

(3-20-14)

1. Section R403.5.3 (N1103.5.3) Hot Water Pipe Insulation (Prescriptive). Add exception 1.

Insulation for items 1, 2., and 4 shall not be required for Single Family Dwellings.

i.  Delete Table R406.4 (N1106.4) Maximum Energy Rating Index and replace with the following:

Table R406.4 Maximum Energy Rating Index

Climate Zone Energy Rating Index
1 52
2 52
3 51
4 54

1.500 sq. ft. or less — 70
1.501 sq. ft. to 2.500 sq. ft. — 65
2.501 sq. ft. to 5.000 sq. ft. — 60

5.001 sq. ft. or greater — 55

1.500 sq. ft. or less — 69

1.501 sq. ft. t0 2.500 sq. fl. — 64

wh

6 2.501 sq. ft. t0 5.000 sq. ft.— 59
5.001 sq. ft. or greater — 54

7 53

g 53

Section 038 Page 7




05. References to Other Codes. Where any provisions of the codes that are adopted in this Section
make reference to other construction and safety-related model codes or standards which have not been adopted by the
involved authority having jurisdiction, to the extent possible, such reference should be construed as pertaining to the
equivalent code or standard that has been duly adopted by such jurisdiction. (3-29-10)

005.  OFFICE -- OFFICE HOURS -- STREET ADDRESS -- MAILING ADDRESS -- TELEPHONE,
FACSIMILE AND WEB ADDRESS.

The principal place of business of the Division of Building Safety is in Meridian, Idaho. The office is located at 1090
E. Watertower St., Meridian, [daho and is open from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m., except Saturday, Sunday and legal holidays.
The mailing address is: Division of Building Safety, 1090 E. Watertower St., Meridian, Idaho 83642. The telephone
number of the office is (208) 334-3896. The facsimile number of the office is (208) §55-9399. The Department website
at http://dbs.idaho.gov. (3-30-06)

Section 038 Page 8



